
Florida State University College of Law Florida State University College of Law 

Scholarship Repository Scholarship Repository 

Staff Analysis Florida Legislative Documents 

1988 

Session Law 88-142 Session Law 88-142 

Florida Senate & House of Representatives 

Follow this and additional works at: https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis 

 Part of the Legislation Commons 

Recommended Citation Recommended Citation 
House of Representatives, Florida Senate &, "Session Law 88-142" (1988). Staff Analysis. 819. 
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis/819 

This Article is brought to you for free and open access by the Florida Legislative Documents at Scholarship 
Repository. It has been accepted for inclusion in Staff Analysis by an authorized administrator of Scholarship 
Repository. For more information, please contact efarrell@law.fsu.edu. 

https://ir.law.fsu.edu/
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/fl-legislative
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis?utm_source=ir.law.fsu.edu%2Fstaff-analysis%2F819&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=PDFCoverPages
https://network.bepress.com/hgg/discipline/859?utm_source=ir.law.fsu.edu%2Fstaff-analysis%2F819&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=PDFCoverPages
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis/819?utm_source=ir.law.fsu.edu%2Fstaff-analysis%2F819&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=PDFCoverPages
mailto:efarrell@law.fsu.edu


LEGISLATIVE SUPPLEMENT "B" - SESSION LAW ABSTRACT 

Sess. Law# 
( / -

Prime Bill # • - ,. �t 
JLMC Senate 3

1 Hist. 
Cites House � ?, _3

H/S Committee Year 

fl 
' ,ffi 

.,., Z,; 

, ,, 

-<::, tCC,'l 

Page# 

<;]. ;:.,;,; 1/ 

J r, �,;:.--
, ' ' 

I, 

IC:' "i '6 

? 

-,____ 

1sec. # JLoF cite 

'/ 
Tcomp./Sim. Bills ,' I ' 

r,' '/' -} I I -, , 

Comms. Senate ,::- . ·A-of '-- ' - { 

Ref. House €1 11: ,ti, /, ': 

COMMITTEE RECORDS 

Record Series: Folder title, 

Jj,- !, ! -· 
I , 

l '  l_.. 

f 

( 
/ I , I I >, _ /(,-' ,•, 'I 

I..' " _,,,,/, I _,, , 
r

_µ , ' - > / 
, 

J; 
/ l '( 

, ,, ,,, ( -'-) 

. 

0 continued on reverse 

Senate/House Journals 

Date Page# 

'/., 3, ,qf;B

Committee/Floor Tapes 

H/S c/f Committee/subcommittee name Date 

Other Documentation 

Record Series Title, folder title, etc. 

etc. 

? 

# 

Loe. Cite 

1 4 /;110-11
; 

/Ci /19/-.-
; 

/;t /I& 2 <J
. , 

I• /10 -: t 
, 

Date 

'V 

M:.: 

/ 

v 

A_; r_ 

Location Cite 

Location cite 



COMMITTEE RECORDS (continued) 

H/S committee Year Record Series: Folder title, etc. Loe. Cite v 

NOTES 



orlda Senate • 1111 

SB 7 

By SenJ.~,,.c J. Ch1-lde1 s 

• 

•u 
0. -

• .0 
�,
C 0. 

u• 

�� 

�.,, 

-·

�" 
., 
o�
uo 

• 

• • 

·�

�o 

.,, " 
•• 
u .0 
; E 
.,, .
OE 

o.-

"" 
> 0 

·�

o•
"E 
�" 

•o
u-
" C 
� -

, . 
o..c 

- "
.c 0 
" -

1 

2 

3 

4 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

,. 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

29 

30 

31 

A bill to be entitled 

An act relating to bu1ld1ng construction 

standards; amending s. 553.73, F.S.; 

prescr1b1ng add1t1onal cond1t1ons upon adoption 

of local standards Yh1ch are more stringent 

than those 1n the State M1n1mum Bu1ld1ng Codes; 

amending s. 553.79, F.S.; requ1r1ng bu1ld1ng 

permit applications to be acted on w1th1n a 

spec1f1ed time; prov1d1ng an effective date. 

Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida: 

Section 1. Subsection (3) of section 553.73, Florida 

Statutes, as amended by section 1, chapter 87-287, Laws of 

Florida, 1s amended to read: 

553.73 State M1n1mum Bu1ld1ng Codes.--

(3) After January 1, 1978, local governments and state

agenc1es with bu1ld1ng construction regulation 

respons1b1l1t1es may provide for more stringent requirements 

than those spec1f1ed 1n the State M1n1rnum Bu1ld1ng Codes, 

provided: 

(a) �"ere-t�-a-determ�netten-by The local governing 

body determines, following a public hearing which h�s _ti�n 

advertised 1n a newspaper of general c1r_culat1q_r1�t least _lQ 

days before tre hearing, that there 1s of a need to strengthen 

the requirements of the State M1n1mum B'J1ld1ng Codes adopted 

by such governing body�, The determ1nat1on must be based upon 

a rev1ew_9f local co�d1�1ons demen�tretton� by the local 

governing body,---2"h1ch r�v1ew demQnstrat� that local 

conditions Justify more stringent requirements than those 

CODING: Words �tr��ken are de�et1ons; words u�derl1n_�g are add1t1ons. 



28-210-BB

11 spec1f1ed 1n the State M1n1mum Bu1ld1ng Codes tfte�e��, for the

2 protection of life and property�;-aftd 

3 (b) Such add1t1on�l requirements are not 

•
, 

discriminatory against materials, products, or construct1on 

5 techniques of demonstrated capab1l1t1es. 

6 Section 2. Subsection (12) 1s added to section 553.79, 

71 Florida Statutes, as amended by section 2, chapter 87-287, 

&I L�ws of Florida, to read: 

9 

10 

553.79 Application.--

(12) A bu1ld1ng permit for a s1ngle-fam1ly res1dent1al 

lll dwelling must be issued w1th1n 45 days of appl1c�t19n therefor 

12I unless unusual circumstances require a longer time for 

131 processing the appl1cat1on or unless the permit appl1cat1on 

141 fails to satisfy the enforcing agency's laws, ordinances, or 

151 codes. 

16 Sl!-Ct1on 3. This act shall take effect upon becoming a 

171 law. 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

,. 

25 

26 

27 

28 

29 

30 

31 

***************************************** 

SENATE SUMMARY 

Provides that, when an agency adopts building 
construction standards more stringent than the State 
Minimum Building Codes it must have the decision to do so 
based on a study of local cond1tions which Justifies the 
requirements, Requires that a public hearing be held 
before a determination that more stringent standards are 
required may b& made. Requires building permit 
applications to be acted on within 45 days, 1n the 
absence of cert�1n circumstances, 

2 

CODING: Words �t��eken are deletions; words underlined are add1t1ons. 



1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

e 

9 

10 

Florida House of Representatives - 1988 

By Representative C. F. Jones 

A bill to be entitled 

HB 779 

An act relating to building construction 

standards; amending s. 553.73, F S.; 

prescr1b1ng additional conditions upon adoption 

of local standards which are more stringent 

than those in the State Minimum Building Codes1 

amending s. 553.79, F.S.; requiring building 

permit applications to be acted on within a 

spec1f1ed time; prov1d1ng an effective date. 

111 Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida1 

12 

B Section l. Subsection 131 of section 553.73, Florida 

lSI Statutes, as amended bt section 1, chapter 87-287, Laws of 

15 Florida, 1s amended to readz 

16 

17 

553.73 State Minimum Building Codes.--

131 After January 1, 1978, local governments and state 

18 agencies with bu1ld1ng construction regulation 

19 responsibilities may provide for more stringent requirements 

20 than those specified 1n the StJte Minimum Building Codes, 

21 prov1.ded1 

22 la) There-i�-a-determinat�on-by The local governing 

23 body determines, following a public hearing which has been 

24 advertised in a newspaper of general circulation at least 10 

25 days before the hearing, that there is of a need to strengthen 

26 the requirements of the State Minimum Building Codes adopted 

27 by such governing body�T The determination must be based upon 

28 a review of local conditions demonstrat�ons by the local 

29 governing body, which review demonstrates that local 

30 conditions Justify more stringent requirements than those 

31 

COOING: Hards 3tr�cken are deletions, words underlined are add1t1ons. 



Florida House of Representatives - 1988 
99-120-3-8

HS 779 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

b •

7 

8 

9 

' 

I 

I 

I 

L 

' 

' 

7 

' 

specified l.n the State Ml.nimum Building Codes there�ny for the 

protection of life and property�t-and 

r bl Such additional requirements are not 

dl.scriminatory against materials, products, or construction 

techniques of demonstrated capabilities. 

Section 2. Subsection ( 12) is added to section 553.79, 

Florida Statutes, as amended by section 2, chapter 87-287, 

Laws of Florida, to readr 

553. 79 Application.--

( 12 l A building fermit for a s1ngle-familt residential 

dwelling must be issued within 45 da�s of aeelication therefor 

unless unusual circumstances re9u1re a long:er time for 

erocessing the aeelication or unless the eermit aeelication 

fails to satisft the enforcing agenc�•s laws2 ordinances2 or 

codes. 

Section 3. This act shall take effect upon becoming a 

law. 

***************************************** 

SENATE SUMMARY 

Provides that, when an agency adopts building construction standards more stringent than t e State 
Minimum Building Codes it must have the decision to do so 
based on a study of local conditions which Justifies the 
requirements. Requires that a public hearing be held 
before a determination that more stringent standards are 
required may be made. Requires building permit 
applications to be acted on w1th1n 45 days, in the 
absence of certain circumstances. 

This publication was produced at an average cost of 1.12 cents 

10 

11 

12 

B 

14 

15 

16 

1 

18 

1 

20 

2 

2 

2 

24 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

3 

3 

D per single page in com�l.ance with the Rules and for
the information of mem rs of the Legislature and the public. 

l 

2 

CODING: Words ����eken are deletions; words Lnderl1ned are additions. 



l 

2 
3 

4 

s 

' 

7 

a 

' 

10 

CS/HB 779 
Florida Hou■e of Representatives - 1988 

By the Comaittee on COIMlunity Affairs and Representative
C. F. Jone■ 

A bill to be entitled 
An act relating to building construction 

■tandard■J nendiRg a. 553.73, F.S,1

prescribing additional conditions upon adoption

of local standards which are more stringent

than those in the State KinimUM Building Codes}

uending •· 553.79, f.S.J �uiring building

peniit applications to be acted on within a

■pecified tiae} providing an effective elate.

11la. It Enacted by the Legialature of the State of Florida, 

12 
13 Section l. Su.bseetion (3) of section 553.73, Florida 
14

,
Statute■, as uended by section 1, chapter 87-Z87, Law■ of

l& Florida, is Ulended to reads 

1, 

17 
553.73 State Minimum Building Code■,--
13) After January 1, 1978, local goverM1ent■ and state

18 agencie■ with building construction regulation 
19 reaponaibilities aay provide for nore ■tringent re�uirementa 
20 than those specified in the State Kinilll.u• Building Codea, 
21 provided1 

2Z (a) 'fhere-i:■-a-4eterainati:on.-lty The local governing 

z3 body Mt.nine■, following a Public hearina which haa been 

2� a5'Y1rti1td in a oew1ea,er of general c1rc01a1:ion at lea,t 10 
2S daYI befon tbt htarinq a that there ii ef- a need to strengthen 

26 the re•uirementa o� the State Nini.awn Building Codes adopted 
27 by auch governing body�y The determination must be based upon 
ta a review of local conditions 4•enstratton• by the local 

tt governing body, which review dtrnonstra:ttt that local 
30 conditions justify aore stringent re•uireaents than those 

31 

l 

CODING: Hord• at:l"iok-, are deletions J words undarlio,d ai-e additions. 



Floria HOIIH � Representative• - 1'811 
171-�7--4-11

CS/1111 779 

l apeaified iD ibl 81:ta tlilliaYII lmildillll '9:111 thereitt.,. for the

� protaation of lif'• and. propertY.1.t-•1111
s lbl Such additional requ1raant:s are not 
• diacriainil.tory agai••t Mt■riala, prodlleta, or oon■truotion

i techni•uea � -o■atnted capabiliti-.

I&! bUl:tlllla I I! IDII I Ii! llllH1 11!1:i i2 illl 
l uba:irur: U!IDm:'I ldaiiQD 2f 112[1; 1:t&:ilwr•oi D!lli.raa•Dil

l!I iblD :lbSB lll&ifud ill :UII l:YH rliDia!II llildiM �I IDSI 
9 iR in allloa;tism 2f limiWilla: S2DliEKIE:liiaD alllksl S!RSIII ibli 
D bl:U!i ill• aff.llG:li af IIIDDdiDI ll!lildina: smDl:liEIS!ii2D IHDSlltsll: 
J: mDiliaml &D ibl :i:liail llilliaYI IYil.sliU r-i-a1 ban Dl!IYll:li1 
Z ._ 1of2aiu IUD� lball IEQ!isll: I IBl2D 11�&1111elisa:lii2E 
I ts• lmil�iDI !IElii I l&ai&na Qf 111 Hisl ES!IY&13111Dil IDd 
'lill!laL. 

I Section z. S..beection I 121 la added to NCtion 553. 7' 
, Florida S1:atutea, •• uencled by aection z, chapter ll7-Z117, 

7 Lava� Florida, to reads 
5 553.79 Appliclltion.-
' !UI l,6 l!!lildiDI lltlii f2t I .,.11-,111,� a1id!nti1J

D !lw:alliDI ■Iii Ill: ia•uad Kit.Ilia ,IQ dixl 2f l!lliaiis!D :lb!afoi 

1 YDIIII YDYIUI 2irc1a1:t10,11 EliYiU! I lona1t iill f2t 

f 11:a..-,na: :la 11!1:U&li'41n Rt u.n1•11 :t.bl -rai.i lll!l"21:U211 
I bill U &iidv ill! 18'212iu .. afteV'I lav•a ordi.DID'211a 2r: 
j ..... 

§ SeQUon 3. Thia ect abal1 - effect upon ..._1,,_ a

' law. 

1 

ll 

' 

0 

� 
z 

COOING: Norcia •triohM ara dalatians1 - y,cllclio,d are additions. 



REVISED: BILL NO. SB 7 

Page _l_ DATE: December 28, 1987 

SENATE STAFF ANALYSIS AND ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT 

ANALYST STAFF DIRECTOR REFERENCE ACTION 

1. Bradlez.xU;:/}' Buck<;:,� 1. ECCA
2. 2. �A�P ___ _
3. 3.
4. -l.

SUBJECT: BILL NO. AND SPONSOR: 

Building Construction 
Standards 

I. §YMMARY:

A. Present S1tuat1on:

SB 7 by 
Senator Don Childers [ 8'°" 

Part VI of ch.553, F.S., the Florida Building Codes Act,
provides for the adoption of State Minimum Building Codes which
contain standards flexible enough to cover all phases of
construction and which provide reasonable protection of the
public health, safety, and welfare. As of October 1, 1984,
each local government was required to adopt one of the State
Minimum Building Codes as its building code to cover all types
of construction. Such codes must include the prov1s1ons of
parts I through VII of the chapter, relating to plumbing,
electrical requirements, glass, manufactured buildings,
accessibility by handicapped persons, and thermal efficiency.

Pursuant to s.553.73(3), F.S., local governments may provide
for more stringent requirements than those specified in the
State Minimum Building Codes. The local governing body must
base such a decision on a demonstration of local conditions
which Justify the need for stricter code requirements for the
protection of life and property and the expanded requirements
may not be discriminatory against otherwise acceptable
materials, products, or construction techniques.

Pursuant to s.553.79, F.S., it is prohibited for any person to
engage in building construction in Florida without first
obtaining a permit from the appropriate agency.

B. Effect of Proposed Changes:

Section 553.73(3), F.S., is amended to revise the conditions
under which a local governing body may adopt more stringent
requirements than those in the State Minimum Building Codes.
The local governing body must hold a public hearing prior to
determining the need for increased code requirements and must
provide notice of the hearing at least 10 days 1n advance in a
newspaper of general circulation. The governing body's
determination must be based on a review of local conditions
which Justifies the need for expanded requirements to protect
life and property.

Section 553.79, F.S., is amended to require that building
permits for single-family residential structures be issued
within 45 days of application unless unusual circumstances
require more time for application processing or the application
fails to comply with the enforcing agency's laws or codes.

II. ECONOMIC IMPACT AµD F_I_;iCA_!,_NOT�:

A. Public:

To the extent that the requirements of the bill preclude the
adoption of unnecessarily stringent building code requirements

f �2..'f 



REVISED: January 5, 1988 BILL NO, SB 7 

Page _l_ DATE: December 28, 1987 

SENATE STAFF ANALYSIS AND ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT 

ANALYST REFERENCE ACTION 

1. Bradley,;;§lf'B
2. 

STAFF DIRECTOR 

Buck� 1. ECCA FAV 
2, -.,A

,__
P ___ _

3. 3. 

4. 4. 

SUBJECT: BILL NO. AND SPONSOR: 

Building Construction 
Standards 

SB 7 by 
Senator Don Childers 

I, SUMMARY: 

A. Present Situation:
/Y

Part VI of ch.553, F.S., the Florida Building Codes Act,
provides for the adoption of State Minimum Bu1ld1ng Codes which
contain standards flexible enough to cover all phases of
construction and which provide reasonable protection of the
public health, safety, and welfare. As of October 1, 1984,
each local government was required to adopt one of the State
M1n1mum Building Codes as its bu1ld1ng code to cover all types
of construction. Such codes must include the provisions of
parts I through VII of the chapter, relating to plumbing,
electrical requirements, glass, manufactured buildings,
accessibility by handicapped persons, and thermal efficiency.

Pursuant to s.553. 73(3), F.S., local governments may provide
for more stringent requirements than those specified in the
State Minimum Building Codes. The local governing body must
base such a decision on a demonstration of local conditions
which justify the need for stricter code requirements for the
protection of life and property and the expanded requirements
may not be discriminatory against otherwise acceptable
materials, products, or construction techniques.

Pursuant to s.553.79, F.S., it is prohibited for any person to
engage in building construction in Florida without first
obtaining a permit from the appropriate agency.

B. Effect of Proposed Changes:

Section 553.73(3), F.S., is amended to revise the conditions
under which a local governing body may adopt more stringent
requirements than those in the State Minimum Building Codes.
The local governing body must hold a public hearing prior to
determining the need for increased code requirements and must
provide notice of the hearing at least 10 days in advance in a
newspaper of general circulation. The governing body's
determination must be based on a review of local conditions
which justifies the need for expanded requirements to protect
life and property.

Section 553,79, F.S., 1s amended to require that building
permits for single-family residential structures be issued
within 45 days of application unless unusual circumstances
require more time for appl1cat1on processing or the application
fails to comply with the enforcing agency's laws or codes.

II. ECONOMIC IMPACT AND FISCAl,_l/OTE:

A. Public:

To the extent that the requirements of the bill preclude the
adoption of unnecessarily stringent building code requirements

i0zf 



REVISED: Januar-"'--2..,_ 1988 

DATE: December 28, 1987 

BILL NO. S8 7 

Page _2_ 

and prevent delays 1n the granting of building permits, 
builders and purchasers of structures will realize a savings. 

B. Government:

To the extent that reviews of local conditions required before
adopting more stringent bu1ld1ng code provisions necessitate
add1t1onal staff and public hearings, local governments will
incur costs.

I I I • COMMEt,_T S : 

No companion bill has been filed 1n the House. 

IV. AMENDMENTS:

None.



REVISED: BILL NO, SB 7 

Page _l_ DATE: April 15, 1988 

SENATE STAFF ANALYSIS AND ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT 

AN.>._L_YST STAFF DIRECTOR REFEREN_s'._E ACTION 

l, Bradley 
2. Barrett t
3. 

Buck 
Sm1_tJ1_ 

1, ECCA 
2. � 
3. 

Favorable 
Fav/1 amend. 

4. 4. 

SUBJECT: BILL NO, AND SPONSOR: 

Building Construction 
Standards 

I. SUMMARY:

A. Present Situation:

SB 7 by 
Senator Don Childers 

Part VI of ch.553, F.S., the Florida Building Codes Act,
provides for the adoption of State M1n1mum Building Codes which
contain standards flexible enough to cover all phases of
construction and which provide reasonable protection of the
public health, safety, and welfare. As of October 1, 1984,
each local government was required to adopt one of the State
Minimum Building Codes as its building code to cover all types
of construction. Such codes must include the provisions of
parts I through VII of the chapter, relating to plumbing,
electrical requirements, glass, manufactured buildings,
accessibility by handicapped persons, and thermal efficiency.

Pursuant to s.553.73(3), F,S., local governments may provide
for more stringent requirements than those specified in the
State Minimum Building Codes. The local governing body must
base such a decision on a demonstration of local conditions
which Justify the need for stricter code requirements for the
protection of life and property and the expanded requirements
may not be discriminatory against otherwise acceptable
materials, products, or construction techniques.

Pursuant to s.553.79, F.S., it is prohibited for any person to
engage in building construction in Florida without first
obtaining a permit from the appropriate agency.

B. Effect of Proposed Changes:

Section 553.73(3}, F.S., is amended to revise the conditions
under which a local governing body may adopt more stringent
requirements than those in the State Minimum Building Codes.
The local governing body must hold a public hearing prior to
determining the need for increased code requirements and must
provide notice of the hearing at least 10 days in advance in a
newspaper of general circulation. The governing body's
determination must be based on a review of local conditions
which justifies the need for expanded requirements to protect
life and property.

Section 553.79, F.S., is amended to require that building
permits for single-family residential structures be issued
within 45 days of application unless unusual circumstances
require more time for application processing or the application
fails to comply with the enforcing agency's laws or codes.

II, ECONOMIC IMPACT AND FISCAL NO'l'_E: 

A. Public:

To the extent that the requirements of the bill preclude the
adoption of unnecessarily stringent building code requirements



REVISED: BILL NO, SB 7 

Page _2_ DATE: April 15, 1988 

and prevent delays in the granting of building permits, 
builders and purchasers of structures will realize a savings. 

B. Government:

To the extent that reviews of local cond1t1ons required before
adopting more stringent building code provisions necessitate
additional staff and public hearings, local governments will
incur costs.

I 11. COMMENTS: 

This act shall take effect upon becoming a law. 

IV. M-{ENDMENTS:

Amendment #1 by Appropr1at1ons

Requires that building permits for single-family residential
dwellings be issued within 30 working days of application.



1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

s0007 

HB 

SENATE COMMITTEE AMENDMENT 
No. l 

(reported favorably) 

The Committee on ..•. Appropriations .... recommended the following 

amendment which was moved by Senator ............... and adopted: 
and failed: 

Senate Amendment 

On page .. ,.,2 .... , line •.. ,,11 •.. , strike 

45 

91 If amendment is text from another bill insert: 

101 Bill No. Draft No. 
No 

With Changes? Yes 

11 I and insert: 

121 30 working 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

29 

30 

31 

88s0007/ap0l 
CODING: Words st�teke" are deletions: words underlined are additions. 

******************************************************************* 
* Amendment No. _!, taken up by committee: Adopted X *
* Offered by Senator Don Childers Failed_ * 
******************************************************************* 

(Amendment No. Adopted -- Failed Date_/_/ 



,3TOEAGE NA1''.E: S-h::::i•-·?. ;ss

8at�: 4-:1-ss 

BILL :: HB 779 

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
COMMITTEE ON COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

STAFF ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT 

RELATING TO: Building Ccnstruction Standards 

� SPONSOR ( S) Rep. c.F. Jones 

E?FECTIVE DATE: Upcn Becoming a L3w 

COMPANION BILL(s: S1m1lar SB 7 

OTHER CO�MITTEES OF FEFEPENCE: i 1 I 

( : ) 

(i 

;._p�ropr1?. t ions 

*�**�**�***r*�*�****�*r*��*****���**r*****�*******�*�*�**********�*******k-

T SUMMAPY: 

A. PRESENT SITUATIJN:

Part v: of chspter 553, Fl,Jr:da St3tutes, tF:�r:ia 3G:��ing :c1e�
Act) provides fer the adopt1�n cf State M1n1�um E��!�1ng Codes
wh��h coctain standards fle�1ble e□OiJgh ta cc·,er 311 ;h3ses cf
�0�2�ru�t1on anj which provide reasonable protectio� Jf the
��bl1c �ealt�. saf�ty, and welfare. As of Octo�er :, 1984, east
lG:al sover�ffient waE requ1r�d to adapt one of the fou� state
�1n�m�rn Eu1ld1n� Cedes as :�s building c0�� t•: ��v�� �11 types cf
constr:?ct1on. Surh cedes muEt 1ncl11de tte prcv1s:c::E of partE I
through VII of the ctapter, relating to plurnblcg, e!�=tr��al
requ1�ements. g:as3, manufactured buildings, acces�1b1l1ty by
handicapped p�rE�ns and thermal eff1=1�nc7.

Sec�1sn 553.7?/Jl, Flcr�es Statutes, states that l•J�al
governrrents may prov�de f�r more str��gent rs�u�=����t� ttan
those specif�ed in the State Mi�imum Building Codes ;ct. Tje
lccal g:vern111g bod� mus� base suet a dec1s1ca on a �emc�strat1:n
cf l0ca: co�dit:�ns wh1sj J�stify the need f�r st�1�t�r �ode
rE�u:re�e11t� f0r t�e pro:ect1on of l��e an� prop��ty If the
�equ:rerne�tE are expanded, they may not d1s�r1m1natcry &ga1nst
c�herw1�e acceptable ms�er:als, produ�t� c� c0nstrast1cn
�ec�n1q11eE.

Se•:t10� 553.79, Florida Statutes proh1�1ts a�7 ;e�2Jn tJ engag�
1n b�ild111g c�3struct1cn 1n Flcr1�a without first sbta�n1ng a
perm�� from the appropriate ag��=Y-

E. EF?EC� OF PRC?OEED CHANGES·

�je bill amends s 11bs�ct1on 13) of section 553. 7 3 Fl·:r:da
St!t·1te�. a� am�nded by section 1, chapter 87-287, Laws of
Fl�r1da and 3dds subsec�1�n '12) t� section 553. 7 ? (Sec�1,:n
���.73 ?art I� rela�ef t� t�� ��ate M1n1mu� Building �odes)



Page : 
Bl 1,1 = · :-IE 7 7 9 
Date: 4-21-88

The bill reGuires :acal �overnments des1�ous cf spply1Gg �ore 
stringent requirements to the State Minimum Building Code to: 

:1) �dver�:se fo� a putl1s hearin� (lJ �ays 1� a��3:1:2

1:l Eolt a putl1� �earing 
(�� Review ccnd1t1ccs whi:h necessitate a 2h3n�e t= m,:re 
Etringert appl1ca:1ons than those 1n the St3te Minimum Bu1ld1ng 
code 

The bill also addE new langu�ge �o the appl1cat10n precess wh:ch 
re�u1res tha�· 

(:) The ?erm1� f�r � s:r�le-fa�1l� ��s:de�t13: h,)me m�.s� �e 
is�ued w1tj1� �5 �a�s a�ply1ng c�less '.a) unus11a� c1rcumEtaLceE 
requ1re longe�; •Jr ;bl t�e per�1t a�;l1:at1:n fa:ls t,: 3a�1Ef� 
cu�rent laws, ordinances or codes. 

S��TION-BY-SE:TIOtl A�ALYS:S: 

f7ct1cn 1. Req 1::..res a l:cal ::,1bl1r: ::ear::..::.; bef,:rt= a:1:r c:--..a:1g-::.:: :: :: :1

b� @ate t0 the t1·1ld:�g :ote ant �jere muE� te �a!:d reasons as 
�� w�� the :ha�0es are nee�ed. 

Sectio� :. ReqG1re5 t�at a j·1:ld1�g perm:t f�r a s1�g!e-f�mily 
:.-eE 1de:: ti2.l dwell i:-,g must ::..s .sue-d wi this 4 '.:, cf ter applying. 
Ex:e;�1ons pr�\·:���-

Sertiot 3. Effsct1·;e --l - ..... -
...l.C ,._ t::: • 

:r. FIS�-�.:.. P..NJ.-!.iYSIS & Econ,JM.I,: :;::Mp_::;c,:i STP..TEME�lT: 

,. 
_ ... , .  FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE AGENC�ES/STATE FUNDS: 

1. lion-recurring er First Yectr Sta_rt-:Jp Effects·

n , ;._

" fec�rr:ng or A��ual1:�� cc,1--..t1�uat10= Ef�ec�E:

N 'J:...

a • Long Run Effects Other �han Nc=mal Growth:

4 Appr��r1at1ons �onseq1e�ce�: 

��/ .'A. 

B. FISCAL I�IPACT ON LOCAL G�VERNMENTS AS A WE0LE·

1. No�-recu=r1na or Firsc Yectr Stare-up Effe�ts:

N 'A.



?age 2 

Eill � HE 779 
:)ate: 4-21-88

r:r. 

2. Recurring er Annu�lized Con�1nuaticn EffectE·

? 
J .  

T: the extent that reviews of local co�dit1ons required
tef0re adopting more str1ng��� b·11ldi�g cJ�� previsions
necessitate add1t1onal sta�f and pt1bl1c hearingE local
g0ver�ments will �ncu� c0st2.

Long Run Ef�ects Other Than Normal Growth:

"'T I� 1 .. ( ' -

2·I?EC':' E':'C!TOM=-: :MP:':.":.'T ON ??.I�:P-.':"S 3E: ��'JF 

1. �1rect ?r1v�te 3e:t1:r C�s:�·

" Direct Pr1··s.te Se:-t:,r 3�n'7i:."':.?. 

Shc�ld :ocal �cvernments c�ocse t� adc,�t more E:r�ngent 
ju1ld�ng ccd�s. it �s c:nce�-,�tle t!:3t pr1vat� juE1nesse� 1� 
th� �u1ld1ng ��d cons�ruc�1c,n industr7 would �e involved, 
therefo�e prc�1t1ng f=)m ��13 3C�. 

3. Effe:�s c� Csr1pet1t1cn, P�:v�te E���rpr12� ac� E�r:,:�men� 
11a�ketE·

see :. . abci:e

D. FI2CAL C:JMMENTS·

Nc,ne

LCNG PP..NGE ::::JNSE�UENCE.'3: 

Thos� who choose tc adJ�c more str1nge�t re�u�reme�ts ttan �et fort� 
in the state Minim�� Building c�ees Act wo11ld mere t�a� likely be 
�r�vid1�g better an� longer las:1ng �u1ld1ng� 3nd str�ct 1 1res for 
�teir ci�izenE the�efcr� m�n1m1z1rg the costs cf repa��s ant 
r�nc,,at1ons. 

IV. COMMENTS:

,, 
' .  

3�3ate Bill � has �asEed the ��na�e �c0n0�1= co�mu�i�� an� ccns·1mer
;ffairs Ccrnmittee and the Senate ApprQpr1at1011s Com�1t�ee (w�th 1
ame�dm�nt - �srikes 45 days and r�pl�ce5 it with �O).

J'.ME?;DMEN�'3:

i!Jne 



• P 1ge .J

51:l_l :±: HB 779 
Date: 4-21-38

VI. SIGNATURES·

SUEST.n.NTIVE COMMITTEE·

Prepared by:

Q1ll1am H1g�t�w�r 

FINANCE -� 7.,XATIC,tr: 

Fre:;iared by· 

AFFROFF.IAT:::ON:C 
?repared by· 

Staff :):.:r-�·:tcr: 

St3.'.:::": Dire·:':'):·: 



STORAGE NAME: h0779s.ca 
Date: 4-27-88

BILL #: 

c,/H/3 ')J'f HOUSE OP REPRESENTATIVES 

COMMI'l"l'EE ON COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

STAPP ANALYSIS r. ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT 

CS/HB 779 

RELATING TO: _BµiJ__diJ'l_g: Construction Standards 

SPONSOR(S): Rep. C.F. Jones 

EFFECTIVE DATE: Upon Becoming a Law 

COMPANION BILL(S): Similar SB 7 

OTHER COMMITTEES OF REFERENCE: (1) 

( 2) 

Appropriations 

*************************************************************************** 

I. SUMMARY:

A. PRESENT SITUATION:

Part VI of chapter 553, Florida Statutes, (Florida Building Codes
Act) provides for the adoption of State Minimum Building Codes
which contain standards flexible enough to cover all phases of
construction and which provide reasonable protection of the
public health, safety, and welfare. As of October 1, 1984, each
local government was required to adopt one of the four State
Minimum Building Codes as its building code to cover all types of
construction. Such codes must include the provisions of parts I
through VII of the chapter, relating to plumbing, electrical
requirements, glass, manufactured buildings, accessibility by
handicapped persons and thermal efficiency.

Section 553.73(3), Florida Statutes, states that local
governments may provide for more stringent requirements than
those specified in the State Minimum Building Codes Act. The
local governing body must base such a decision on a demonstration
of local conditions which justify the need for stricter code
requirements for the protection of life and property. If the
requirements are expanded, they may not discriminatory against
otherwise acceptable materials, products or construction
techniques.

Section 553.79, Florida Statutes, prohibits any person to engage
in building construction in Florida without first obtaining a
permit from the appropriate agency.

B. EFFECT OF PROPOSED CHANGES:

The bill amends subsection (3) of section 553.73, Florida
Statutes, as amended by section l, chapter 87-287, Laws of
Florida, and adds subsection (12) to section 553.79. (Section
553.79 Part IV relates to the State Minimum Building Codes)

�II O MAY 311988



"Page 2 
Billi: CS/HB 779 
Date: 4-27-88 

The bill requires local governments desirous of applying more 
stringent requirements to the State Minimum Building Code to: 

(1) Advertise for a public hearing (10 days in advance)
(2) Hold a public hearing
(3) Review conditions which necessitate a change to more
stringent applications than those in the State Minimum Building
Code.

The bill also adds new language to the application process which 
requires that: 

(1) Any person applying for a building permit, is entitled to a
listing of all requirements, codes and amendments to any
requirements and/or codes;

(2) The permit for a single-family residential home must be
issued within 30 days of application unless (a) unusual
circumstances require longer; or (bl the permit application fails
to satisfy current laws, ordinances or codes.

C. SECTION-BY-SECTION ANALYSIS:

Section 1. Requires a local public hearing before any changes can
be made to the building code and there must be valid reasons as
to why the changes are needed. This section also requires that
any person applying for a building permit is entitled to a
listing of all requirements, codes and amendments to any
requirements and/or codes.

Section 2. Requires that a building permit for a single-family
residential dwelling must issued within 30 after applying.
Exceptions provided.

Section 3. Provides an effective date of upon becoming a law.

II. FISCAL ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT:

A. FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE AGENCIES/STATE FUNDS:

1. Non-recurring or First Year Start-Up Effects:

N/A 

2. Recurring or Annualized Continuation Effects:

N/A

3. Long Run Effects Other Than Normal Growth:

N/A

4. ApPropriations Conseguences:

N/A

�/� 



-Page 3
Billi: CS/HB 779
Date: 4-27-88

B. FISCAL IMPACT ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS AS A WHOLE:

l. Non-recurring or First Year Start-Up Effects:

N/A

2. Recurring or Annualized Continuation Effects:

To the extent that reviews of local conditions required
before adopting more stringent building code provisions
necessitate additional staff and public hearings, local
governments will incur costs.

3. Long Run Effects Other Than Normal Growth:

N/A

C. DIRECT ECONOMIC IMPACT ON PRIVATE SECTOR:

1. Direct Private Sector Costs:

2. Direct Private Sector Benefits:

Should local governments choose to adopt more stringent
building codes, it is conceivable that private businesses in
the building and construction industry would be involved,
therefore profiting from this act.

3. Effects on Competition, Private Enterprise, and Employment
Markets:

See 2. above

D. FISCAL COMMENTS:

None

III. LONG RANGE CONSEQUENCES:

Those who choose to adopt more stringent requirements than set forth
in the State Minimum Building Codes Act would more than likely be
providing better and longer lasting buildings and structures for
their citizens therefore minimizing the costs of repairs and
renovations.

IV. COf,!MENTS :

Senate Bill 7 has passed the Senate Economic Community and Consumer
Affairs Committee and the Senate Appropriations Committee (with 1
amendment - strikes 45 days and replaces it with 30).

�//,? 



Page 4 
Billi: CS/HB 779 
Date: 4-27-88 

V. AMENDMENTS :

None 

VI. SIGNATURES:

SUBSTANTIVE COMMITTEE:
by: 

ic;ihtower 

FINANCE, TAAATION: 
Prepared by: 

APPROPRIATIONS: 
Prepared by: 

�I/tr 

Staff Director: 

Staff Director: 



,mRA�E 
)ate: 

3ILL i: 

NAME: h0779s-f.ca 
July 18, 1988 

AS PASSED BY THE LEGISLATURE 

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
COMMITTEE ON COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

FINAL STAFF ANALYSIS� ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT 

CS/HB 779 (SB 7) 

,ELATING TO: Building Construction Standards 

,PONSOR(S): Community Affairs; Rep. C.F. Jones 

sFFECTIVE DATE: Upon becoming a law 

)ATE BECAME LAW: July 1, 1988 

:HAPTER i: 88-142, Laws of Florida

:OMPANION BILL(S): HB 1617, SB 7 

)THER COMMITTEES OF REFERENCE: (1) 

( 2) 

Appropriations 

�************************************************************************** 

I. SUMMARY:

House Bill 779 passed the House Community Affairs Committee as a 
Committee Substitute on 4-27-88, was withdrawn from the House 
Appropriations Committee and was subsequently substituted for Senate 
Bill 7 which passed both Houses and is now Chapter 88-142, Laws of 
Florida. 

Senate Bill 7 is identical to CS/H 779 with the exception of the 
phrase "working" in Section 2 of the bill relating to the length of 
time for which a building permit must be issued. Committee 
Substitute for House Bill 779 states "30 days" and Senate Bill 7 
states "30 working days". 

A. PRESENT SITUATION:

Part VI of chapter 553, Florida Statutes, (Florida Building
Codes Act) provides for the adoption of State Minimum Building
Codes which contain standards flexible enough to cover all
phases of construction and which provide reasonable protection
of the public health, safety, and welfare. As of October 1,
1984, each local government was required to adopt one of the
four State Minimum Building Codes as its building code to cover
all types of construction. Such codes must include the
provisions of parts I through VII of the chapter, relating to
plumbing, electrical requirements, glass, manufactured
buildings, accessibility by handicapped persons and thermal
efficiency.



Page 2 
Bill JI: HB 779 
11ate: 7-18-88

Section 553.73(3), Florida Statutes, states that local 
governments may provide for more stringent requirements than 
those specified in the State Minimum Building Codes Act. The 
local governing body must base such a decision on a 
demonstration of local conditions which justify the need for 
stricter code requirements for the protection of life and 
property. If the requirements are expanded, they may not 
discriminatory against otherwise acceptable materials, products 
or construction techniques. 

Section 553.79, Florida Statutes, prohibits any person to engage 
in building construction in Florida without first obtaining a 
permit from the appropriate agency. 

B. EFFECT OF PROPOSED CHANGES:

The bill amends subsection (3) of section 553.73, Florida
Statutes, as amended by section 1, chapter 87-287, Laws of
Florida, and adds subsection (12) to section 553.79. (Section
553.79 Part IV relates to the State Minimum Building Codes)

The bill requires local governments desirous of applying more
stringent requirements to the State Minimum Building Code to:

(1) Advertise for a public hearing (10 days in advance)
(2) Hold a public hearing
(3) Review conditions which necessitate a change to more
stringent applications than those in the State Minimum Building
Code.

The bill also adds new language to the application process which 
requires that: 

(1) Any person applying for a building permit, is entitled to a
listing of all requirements, codes and amendments to any
requirements and/or codes;

(2) The permit for a single-family residential home must be
issued within 30 working days of application unless (a) unusual
circumstances require longer; or (b) the permit application
fails to satisfy current laws, ordinances or codes.

C. SECTION-BY-SECTION ANALYSIS:

Section 1. Requires a local public hearing before any changes
can be made to the building code and there must be valid reasons
as to why the changes are needed. This section also requires
that any person applying for a building permit is entitled to a
listing of all requirements, codes and amendments to any
requirements and/or codes.



Page 3 
Flill i:
1"ate: 

HB 779 
7-18-88

Section 2. Requires that a building permit for a single-family
residential dwelling must issued within 30 working days after
applying. Exceptions provided.

Section 3. Provides an effective date of upon becoming a law.

II. FISCAL ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT:

A. FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE AGENCIES/STATE FUNDS:

1. Non-recurring or First Year Start-Up Effects:

N/A 

2. Recurring or Annualized Continuation Effects:

N/A

3. Long Run Effects Other Than Normal Growth:

N/A

4. Appropriations Consequences:

N/A

B. FISCAL IMPACT ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS AS A WHOLE:

1. Non-recurring or First Year Start-Up Effects:

N/A 

2. Recurring or Annualized Continuation Effects:

To the extent that reviews of local conditions required before adopting
more stringent building code provisions necessitate additional staff and
public hearings, local governments will incur costs.

3. Long Run Effects Other Than Normal Growth:

N/A

C. DIRECT ECONOMIC IMPACT ON PRIVATE SECTOR:

1. Direct Private Sector Costs:

2. Direct Private Sector Benefits:

Should local governments choose to adopt more stringent building codes,
it is conceivable that private businesses in the building and
construction industry would be involved, therefore profiting from this
act.



Page 4 
Bill l!: 
l.'ate :" 

HB 779 

7-18-88 

III. 

3. Effects on Competition, Private Enterprise, and Employment Markets:

See 2. above

D. FISCAL COMMENTS:

None

LONG RANGE CONSEQUENCES: 

Those who choose to adopt more stringent requirements than set forth 
in the State Minimum Building Codes Act would more than likely be 
providing better and longer lasting buildings and structures for 
their citizens therefore minimizing the costs of repairs and 
renovations. 

IV. COMMENTS:

None

V. SIGNATURES:

SUBSTANTIVE COMMITTEE:
Prew.md.l:>y:

William B. H'!lghtower

FINANCE & TAXATION:
Prepared by:

withdrawn 

APPROPRIATIONS: 
Prepared by: 

staff Director: 

Staff Director: 


	Session Law 88-142
	Recommended Citation

	tmp.1685067385.pdf.UpE9l

