Florida State University College of Law

Scholarship Repository

Staff Analysis Florida Legislative Documents

1988

Session Law 88-142

Florida Senate & House of Representatives

Follow this and additional works at: https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis

Cf Part of the Legislation Commons

Recommended Citation

House of Representatives, Florida Senate &, "Session Law 88-142" (1988). Staff Analysis. 819.
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis/819

This Article is brought to you for free and open access by the Florida Legislative Documents at Scholarship
Repository. It has been accepted for inclusion in Staff Analysis by an authorized administrator of Scholarship
Repository. For more information, please contact efarrell@law.fsu.edu.


https://ir.law.fsu.edu/
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/fl-legislative
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis?utm_source=ir.law.fsu.edu%2Fstaff-analysis%2F819&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=PDFCoverPages
https://network.bepress.com/hgg/discipline/859?utm_source=ir.law.fsu.edu%2Fstaff-analysis%2F819&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=PDFCoverPages
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis/819?utm_source=ir.law.fsu.edu%2Fstaff-analysis%2F819&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=PDFCoverPages
mailto:efarrell@law.fsu.edu

LEGISLATIVE SUPPLEMENT "B" - SESSION LAW ABSTRACT

Sess. Law # _ .. _ - Sec. # LOF cite
¢ ( “~

Prime Bill # -7, . Comp./Sim. Bills A

JILMC |Senate 3 Comnms. | Senate -~ - .

Hist. = of ALY =

Cites|{House 333 Ref. |House /4 ,., . ,

COMMITTEE RECORDS

H/S|Committee|Year Record Series: Folder title, etc. Loc. Cite v
f/ s.}'}l.i_; /f.[’v /7‘1?‘ _/,}_’_,;L e _,.x{,' /W// Jro -1/ P
RS /
p 7, r ' ¢ ; by —
! / 4 PRI ///- 't/ /S//lﬁ/\ /
y /
[ | Ecech jeig| i L, . TR/ /;f_//(;77 v
b r 7
s i rd .
’ p L fdle, )5 Jlo e ne
[ continued on reverse

Senate/House Journals

Page # ? Date Page # ? Date

'/)‘.f 51 ’958 e

vy
)
B3]
X

AN

Committee/Floor Tapes

H/S|c/f Committee/subcommittee name Date # Location Cite

Other Documentation

Record Series Title, folder title, etc. Location Cite




COMMITTEE RECORDS (continued)

H/S

Committee

Year

Record Series: Folder title, etc.

Loc.

Cite

NOTES




rida Senats - 1988 SB .

By Seni-tc 2. Childers

+ cost of 1.5 cents per page

This publication was produced at an av

1 A bill to be entitled
2 An act relating to building construction
3 standards; amending s. 553.73, F.S.;
4 prescribing additional conditions upon adoptlion
5 of local standards which are more stringent
6 than those 1n the State Minimum Building Codes;
= 7 amending s. 553.79, F.S.; requiring building
r .
2 8 permit applications to be acted on within a
2 9 specified time; provid:ing an effective date.
+
w | 10
G
. 11| Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:
13
2112
"
a3 Section 1. Subsection (3} of section 553.73, Florida

14| Statutes, as amended by section 1, chapter 87-287, Laws of

15| Florida, 1s amended to read:

16 553.73 State Minimum Building Codes.--

11/ (3) After January 1, 1978, local governments and state
18| agencies with building construction requlation

19| responsibilities may provide for more stringent requirements
20| than those specified in the State Minimum Building Codes,

21| provided:

22 (a) Fhere-i1s-a-determinatien-by The local governing

23| body determines, following_a public hearing which has been

24| advertised in a newspaper of general circulation at least 10

25) days before the hearing, that there 1s of a need to strengthen

for the information of members of the .

26| the requirements of the State Minimum Building Codes adopted

27| by such governing body.7; The determination must be based upon

28| a_review of local conditions demenstrat:ons by the local

29| governing body, which review demgonstrates that local

30| conditions justify more stringent requirements than those

31

1

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




28-210-88

1| specified 1n the State Minimum Building Codes there:n; for the

2| protection of life and property,s;-and

3 {b) Such additional requirements are not

4| discriminatory against materials, products, or construction

S| techniques of demonstrated capabilit:ies.

6 Section 2. Subsection (12) 1s added to section 553.79,
7| Florida Statutes, as amended by section 2, chapter 87-287,

8| Laws of Florida, to read:

9 553.79 Application,—-
10 (12) A building perm:it for a single-family residential

11| dwelling must be i1ssued within 45 days of application therefor

12| uynless unusual circumstances require a longer time for

13| processing the application or unless the permit application
14} fai1ls to satisfy the enforcing agency's laws, ordinances, or
15} codes.

16 Section 3. This act shall take effect upon becoming a
17| law.

18
19

ARRRRRRRAKRRRRARRRRRRRRANR R AR RRR AR R AR
20

21 SENATE SUMMARY

Provides that, when an agency adopts building

22 construction standards more stringent than the State
Minimum Building Codes 1t must have the decision to do so

23 based on a study of local conditions which justifies the
requirements. Requires that a public hearing be held

24 before a determination that more stringent standards are
required may be made. Requires bu:ilding permit

25 applications to be acted on within 45 days, in the

26 absence of certain circumstances.

27

28

29

30

31

2

CODING: Words striekenr are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Florida House of Representatives - 1988 HB 779

By Representative C. F. Jones

A b11l to be entitled
An act relating to building construction
standards3 amendzng s. 553.73, F S.3
prescribang additional conditions upon adoption
of local standards which are more strangent
than those 1n the State Minimum Building Codes}
amending s. 553.79, F.S.j requiring building

permit applications to be acted on withan a

DN NP NN P

specified times providing an effective date.

-
- o

Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Floraida:

[P
wWoN

Section 1. Subsection (3) of section 553.73, Florida

-
F

Statutes, as amended by section 1, chapter 87-287, Laws of

)
n

Florida, is amended to read:

553.73 State Minimum Building Codes.--

[
N o

(31 After January 1, 1978, local governments and state

)
®

agencles with building construction regulation

[y
0

responsibilities may provide for more strangent requirements

N
[}

than those specified in the State Minimum Building Codes,

N
—

provided:

N
~N

(a) There-trs-a-determinatton-by The local governing

[N
W

body determines, following a public hearing which has been
advertised in a newspaper of general circulation at least 10
days before the hearing, that there i1s of a need to strengthen

the requirements of the State Hinimum Building Codes adopted

N NN
N o P

by such governing body.y The determination must be based upon

n
[v]

a review of local conditions demonstrat:rons by the local

n
D

governing body, which review demonstrates that local

conditions justify more stringent requirements than those

W
o

W
—

CODING: HWords stricken are deletions, words underlined are addit:ions.



Florida House of Representatives -~ 1988 HB 779
99-120-3-8

specified in the State Minamum Building Codes therexny for the

protection of life and property.s-and

[b) Such additional requirements are not
discraiminatory against materials, products, or comstruction
techniques of demonstrated capabilities.

Section 2. Subsection (12) 1s added to section 553.79,
Florida Statutes, as amended by section 2, chapter 87-287,

Laws of Florida, to read:

O O N ¢ n & W N o=

E53.79 Applacation.--

-
o

(123 A building permit for a single-family residential

-
[

dwelling must be 1ssued within 45 days of application therefor

[
N

unless unusual circumstances require a longer time for

o)
W

processing _the application or unless the permit application

-
&

fails to satisfy the enforcing agency's laws,_ordihances, or

—
n

codes.

P
[

Section 3. This act shall take effect upon becoming a

P
~

law.

oo
S ®

E2 2222222222222 22332222 223222222 233323322223

[N}
o

SENATE SUMMARY

~n
™

Provides that, when an agency adopts buildin
construction standards more strangent than tge State
Minimum Building Codes 1t must have the decision to do so
based on a study of local conditions which justifies the
requirements. Requires that a public hearing be held
before a determination that morec stringent standards are
required may be made. Requires building permit
applications to be acted on within 45 days, in the
absence of certain circumstances.

N NN NN NN
N N ¢ S W

~nN
-0

This publication was produced at an average cost of 1.12 cents
per single page 1n compliance with the Rules and for
the i1nformation of memgers of the Legislature and the publac.

W
Q

W
~

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



CS/HB 779
Florida House of Representatives - 1988

By the Committee on Community Affairs and Representative
C. F. Jones

1 A bill to be entitled

2 An act relating to building construction

3 standardsy amending s. 553.73, F.S.»

3 prescribing additional conditions upon adoption

5 of local standards which are more stringent

6 than those in the State Minimum Building Codes}

7 amending =. 553.79, F.S.) requiring building

8 permit applications to be acted on within a

9 specified time; providing an effective date.

10

11| 8e It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:

12

13 Section 1. Subsection (3) of section 553.73, Florida
14) Statutes, as amended by section 1, chapter 87-287, Laws of
15|Florida, is amended to read:
16 553.73 State Minimum Building Codes.--

17 (3) After January 1, 1978, local governments and state
18] agencies with building construction regulation

[
1)

responsibilities may provids for more stringent requiraments
than those specified in the State Minimum Building Codes,
provided:

N DN DN
N H# O

(a} There-is-a-determination-by The local governing
body determines. folloying a public hearing which has been

= - ulat

2

davs before the hearing, that there iz of a need to strengthen
the requirements of the State Minimum Building Codes adopted
by such governing body.y The determination must be based upon
a review of local conditjong demenstrations by the local
governing body, which review demonstraiss that local

conditions justify more stringent requirements than those

W e @ 0NN
O w O N & 0

W
[y

1

CODING: Words strieken ars deletions; words undgrlined are additions.



Floride House of Representatives ~ 1988 CS/HB 779
171-347-4-8

1) specified in_the Stats Miniaum Building Codes thereimy for the
2| protection of life and property. s-and

3 {b) Such additional requirements are not
Q‘ discriminatory against materials, prodewcts, or gonstruction
5§ techniques of gemomstrated capabilities.
’ (g)__Paragraebs.ia) and (b) shall arsly to the
7| anforcing agqency's adostion of more sirincent reeyiresents
il ithan those specified in the State Minimum Puilding Codex and

0 _the sdostion of building construction related ceodes that
10} have, the affoct of amending building construction standards
1} contained. in. the State Mininus Puilding Codes, Upon resuest,
12| the enforcing agency shall msrovide a perzon making aeplication
13| for 3 building sermit a listing of s3ll said reeyiresents and
14| codes.
15 Section 2. Subsection (12) is added to section 553.79,
16| Florida Statutes, as amended by section 2, chapter 87-287,
17| Laus of Floritda, to read:
18 553.79 Application.-—-
19 112) A building sermit for a sincle-family residentia}
20| duqlling nust be izsued within 30 davs of arelication therefor
21 unless ynysyal.circumstances require a longer time for
proceszaing tha asplication op unlegs ithe sereit asplication
fails to satisfy the enforcing asency's lavs, ordinancess. ot
sodpp, )

Section 3. This act shall take sffect upon becoming s

law.

&S 8NLGEBENRN

GODING: Mords stricken arae delationss worde ynderlingd are additions.



REVISED: BILL NC. S8 7

DATE: December 28, 1987 Page _1

SENATE STAFF ANALYSIS AND ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT

ANALYST STAFF_DIRECTOR REFERENCE ACTION
1. Bradleyndrdy Buck O 1. ECCA
2. 2. AP
3. 3.
4. 4.
SUBJECT: BILL NO. ANB SPONSOR:
Building Construction SB 7 by {Q}Zf?
Standards Senator Don Childers lsi/

I, SUMMARY :
A. Present Situation:

Part VI of ch.553, F.S., the Florida Building Codes Act,
provides for the adoption of State Minimum Building Codes which
contain standards flexible enough to cover all phases of
construction and which provide reasonable protection of the
public health, safety, and welfare. As of October 1, 1584,
each local government was requlred to adopt one of the State
Minimum Building Codes as its building code to cover all types
of construction. Such codes must include the provisions of
parts I through VII of the chapter, relating to plumbing,
electrical requirements, glass, manufactured buildings,
accessibility by handicapped persons, and thermal efficiency.

Pursuant to s.553.73(3), F.S., local governments may provide
for more stringent requirements than those specified in the
State Minimum Building Codes. The local governing body must
base such a decision on a demonstration of local conditions
which justify the need for stricter code requirements for the
protection of life and property and the expanded requ:rements
may not be discriminatory against otherwise acceptable
materials, products, or construction technigues,

Pursuant to s.553.79, F.S., 1t i1s prohibited for any person to
engage in building construction in Florida without first
obtaining a permit from the appropriate agency.

B. Effect of Proposed Changes:

Section 5%3.73(3), F.S., is amended to revise the conditions
under which a local governing body may adopt more stringent
requirements than those in the State Minimum Building Codes.
The local governing body must hold a public hearing prior to
determining the need for increased code requirements and must
provide notice of the hearing at least 10 days 1n advance in a
newspaper of general circulation. The governing body's
determination must be based on a review of local conditions
which justifies the need for expanded requirements to protect
l1fe and property.

Section 553.79, F.S., is amended to require that building
permits for single-family residential structures be 1ssued
within 45 days of application unless unusual circumstances
require more time for application processing or the application
fails to comply with the enforcing agency'’'s laws or codes.

II1. ECONOMIC IMPACT AND FISCAL NOTE:

A, Public:

To the extent that the requirements of the bill preclude the
adoption of unnecessarily stringent building code requirements



REVISED:

DATE:

January 5, 1988 BILL NO. SB 7

December 28, 1987 Page 1

SENATE STAFF ANALYSIS AND ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT

ANALYST STAFF DIRECTOR REFERENCE ACTION

BradleyodRd Emck;jE

ECCA FAV

AP

105
2.
3.
4,

W N -

.

SUBJECT:

BILL NO. AND SPONSOR:

Building Construction SB 7 by
Standards Senator Don Childers

I. SUMMARY:

A,

Present Situation:

Part VI of ch.553, F.S., the Flor:i:da Building Codes Act, /Zg;;fr
provides for the adoption of State Minimum Building Codes which
contain standards flexible enough to cover all phases of
construction and which provide reasonable protection of the
public health, safety, and welfare., As of October 1, 1984,
each local government was required to adopt one of the State
Minimum Building Codes as its building code to cover all types
of construction. Such codes must include the provisions of
parts I through VII of the chapter, relating to plumbing,
electrical requirements, glass, manufactured buildings,
accessibility by handicapped persons, and thermal efficiency.

Pursuant to s.553.73(3), F.S., local governments may provide
for more stringent requirements than those specified 1n the
State Minimum Building Codes. The local governing body must
base such a decision on a demonstration of local cond:itions
which justify the need for stricter code requirements for the
protection of life and property and the expanded requirements
may not be discriminatory against otherwise acceptable
materials, products, or construction techniques.

Pursuant to s.553.79, F.S., 1t 1s prohibited for any person to
engage in building construction i1n Florida without first
obtaining a permit from the appropriate agency.

Effect of Proposed Changes:

Section 553.73(3), F.S., is amended to revise the conditions
under which a local governing body may adopt more stringent
requirements than those in the State Minimum Building Codes.
The local governing body must hold a public hearing prior to
determining the need for increased code requirements and must
provide notice of the hearing at least 10 days 1n advance 1in a
newspaper of general circulation. The governing body's
determination must be based on a review of local conditions
which justifies the need for expanded reqguirements to protect
life and property.

Section 553.79, F.S., 1s amended to require that building
permits for single-family residential structures be 1ssued
within 45 days of application unless unusual circumstances
require more time for application processing or the application
fails to comply with the enforcing agency's laws or codes.

I1. ECONOMIC IMPACT AND FISCAL NOTE:

A,

Public:

To the extent that the requirements of the bill preclude the
adoption of unnecessarily stringent building code requirements



REVISED: January 5, 1988 BILL NO. SB 7

DATE: December 28, 1987 Page _2
and prevent delays 1n the granting of building permits,
builders and purchasers of structures will realize a savings,

B. Government:
To the extent that reviews of local conditions reguired before
adopting more stringent building code provisions necessitate
additional staff and public hearings, local governments will
incur costs.

III., COMMENTS:

No companion bill has been filed 1n the House.
Iv. AMENDMENTS:

None.



REVISED: BILL NO. SB 7

DATE: April 15, 1988 Page _1

SENATE STAFF ANALYSIS AND ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT

ANALYST STAFF DIRECTOR REFERENCE ACTION
1. Bradley Buck 1. ECCA Favorable
2. Barrett Smith 2. AP Fav/1l amend.
3. 3h
4. 4,
SUBJECT: BILL NO. AND SPONSOR:
Building Construction SB 7 by
Standards Senator Don Childers
)05 SUMMARY :

A. Present Situation:

Part VI of ch.553, F.S., the Florida Building Codes Act,
provides for the adoption of State Minimum Building Codes which
contain standards flexible enough to cover all phases of
construction and which provide reasonable protection of the
public health, safety, and welfare., As of October 1, 1984,
each local government was required to adopt one of the State
Minimum Building Codes as its building code to cover all types
of construction. Such codes must include the provisions of
parts I through VII of the chapter, relating to plumbing,
electrical requirements, glass, manufactured buildings,
accessibility by handicapped persons, and thermal efficiency.

Pursuant to s.553.73(3), F.S., local governments may provide
for more stringent requirements than those specified in the
State Minimum Building Codes. The local governing body must
base such a decision on a demonstration of local conditions
which justify the need for stricter code requirements for the
protection of life and property and the expanded requirements
may not be discriminatory against otherwise acceptable
materials, products, or construction techniques.

Pursuant to s.553.79, F.S., 1t is prohibited for any person to
engage in building construction in Florida without first
obtaining a permit from the appropriate agency.

B. Effect of Proposed Changes:

Section 553.73(3), F.S., is amended to revise the conditions
under which a local governing body may adopt more stringent
requirements than those in the State Minimum Building Codes.
The local governing body must hold a public hearing prior to
determining the need for increased code requirements and must
provide notice of the hearing at least 10 days 1n advance in a
newspaper of general circulation. The governing body's
determination must be based on a review of local conditions
which justifies the need for expanded requirements to protect
li1fe and property.

Section 553.79, F.S., is amended to require that building
permits for single-family residential structures be issued
within 45 days of application unless unusual circumstances
require more time for application processing or the application
fails to comply with the enforcing agency's laws or codes.

Il, ECONOMIC IMPACT AND FISCAL NOTE:

To the extent that the requirements of the bill preclude the
adoption of unnecessarily stringent building code requirements



REVISED: - BILL NO. SB 7

DATE: April 15, 1988 Page _2

and prevent delays in the granting of building permits,
builders and purchasers of structures will realize a savings.

B. Government:
To the extent that reviews of local conditions required before
adopting more stringent building code provisions necessitate
additional staff and public hearings, local governments will
incur costs.
ITI. COMMENTS:
This act shall take effect upon becoming a law.
IV. AMENDMENTS:
Amendment #1 by Appropriations

Requires that building permits for single-family residential
dwellings be 1ssued within 30 working days of application.



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
13
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31

SENATE COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
s0007 No. 1
(reported favorably)

HB

The Committee on....Appropriations....recommended the following

amendment which was moved by Senator...............and adopted:
and failed:

Senate Amendment
On page .....2...., line .....ll..., strike
45
If amendment is text from another bill insert:
No _
Bill No. Draft No. With Changes? Yes
and insert:
30 working
1
88s0007/ap01

CODING: Words strieckenm are deletions; words underlined are additions.
L2222 222222 22 222 222 222 a2 X8 2 2t in s Rt R 2 R R 0l S

* Amendment No. _1, taken up by committee: Adopted X
* QOffered by Senator Don Childers Failed

*
*

******t***********i*****t*t*****t**t***********t****t*i********;***

(Amendment No. Adopted Failed Date _ /_ /_)



,STCPAGE NAME: S-hd772 .53
Date: $-71-28
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES
COMMITTEE ON COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
STAFF ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT
BILL =: HE 775

RELATING TO: Building Ccnstriction Standavds

SPONSOR(S) : Rep. C.F. Jones !‘?
EFFECTIVE DATE: Upon Eecoming a Law

COMPANION BILL(S) similar SB 7

CTHER COMMITTEES OF FEFERENCE: (1) ADETOpPr1ations

KKK ARV HAAPHCL P RN NN VNP P e d Y FFL b d P rrhRrr AR RN RK NS Kw kb ok dw ok ok kN dekek ko

A SUMMAPRY :

A. PRESENT SITUATION:
Part VI of chapter 523, Flor-da Statutss, (rlorida zullding Zods
Act) provides for the adoptisn <f State Miniamum EBuzldling Cadss
which contain standards fiexikle enoiigh teo ccver 3ll zhaseg of
zeastruction and which provide reasonabic protection >f the
gblic he=3lta. safzty, and welfar As of Octaler 7, 1984, esch
lczal government was raquirsd to aaopt cne of the four State
Minaimam Euilding Codes as 2ts building cocds to cover =211 types ¢
congtruction. Surh ccdes must includs the previsicise of partes I
through VITI of the chapter, relating te plumbing, el:zctricazl
regquirements, ¢lass, manufactured bulldlngs, accescibility hy
nandicapped parcons and thermal effizizncy.
Sectisn 553.7213Y, Flcraids Statutes, states that local
governrents may provids f7r more stringsnt raguirsmsats than
thoses specif-ed in the State Minimum Building Codes nct. The
local governing body must base such a dscisica on a 2zmenstrat:c
cf 1ocal condaitoons which justify the need for striztsr code
requirements £or the prozsction of l:fe and prop=rty If the=
requirements are excanded, they may not dlsur1¢1natcry &gainst
ctherwles acceptable materials, products cr sonstructicn
Tecnnigiles
Secttioa 553.79, rlorida Statutes prohitits any gerson ty engags
in building csastructicn in Fleriacdae without first <btatning a
verm.T from the appropriatz agsncy.

E. EFFECT OF FRCPOSED CHANGES-
The bi1ll amends subs=ction 13) of section 553.73 TFTlcorida
Statites, az am=ndszd by section 1, chapt=sr 87-287, Laws of
Fisridaza and adds :ubs=zczicn ‘12) to secticn 553.79 {Section
fE2.793 Part IV re=lates to ths State nimus Building Jodecz)

iy

H

et



O 0¥ o

o o

(gl aalial

M =

"oy

[

o>

ro L
2t

0> ~d

Th=2

stringent requirements tce the st

~d
Ul

[€s]

bill requires locel government 1T

ous

tz

‘1) Adwvertise for a puklic hearing (13 Jdavs 1a adv
(2) Ecolé & pukli- hearing

t2) Review ccnditicns which necesgitate a changs
gtringsrt applicaticns than those 1

Code

The 911l alszo adds new languags *to the

Tecutarse that

{2) The »2=rmi%t for =3 szncles-family r=s:dentizl hom
1ssued within 45 cavs arplving unless ![a) unusual
require ioncger; oOr ib) the permit aczlicati:n fail
current laws, ordinances or codes
SZTTIQN=-BY-SEZTION ANALYSIS

S=cticn 1. Eag1res & l-cal zabiic hearins keficre
Lz macde t< the bvildozng zode ané “here must ke val
2> why the cthangss are nesied

Secticn . Requires that a 21zlding rermzt for a s
recidentizal dweslliing must zszsued within 45 after a
Excegtions providsad

Sz~tion 2. Eff=actaive date

2L ANALYIIS & ECONDMIZ IMPACT STATEMENT:

03]

FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE

I,

1o

Ll

FISTAL IMPACT

1.

AGENCIES/STATE FUNDS:

Mon-recurring ¢r First Year Start-Jp Effects:

A
Fecurriag or AmnualizsZ Continuatian Effects:

ADPr=

N/A

CN LCCAL G-VEPNMENTS AS A WHOLE-

Nor.-recurring or First ¥Y=ar Start-Up Effe-ts:

NA

n N W

}-l
ok m 3

more
n the 3tate Minimum EBuilding

o
.

[(VENS)

[¢3)

m = ot

1

—
—

of or U5
= D

0

o

ct applying meore
imum Building Code to:

0

[

g

rmn



rage
B1l1l

Date:

d525a0

Iv.

= H2 779
4-~21-88
2. Pecurring cr Annuialized Con=tinuaticn Effects-
T- the extent that reviews of local corditions required
kefcre adopting more stringent br11lding c¢2ds provislions
necessitate additional staff and public hearings local
governments wiil Incur costz,
3 Long Run Effects Other Than Normal Growth:
PR
oy DIFECT Z7TCHNCOMIT ZMPXTT ON PRITATE IETTAO
1. Direct Praivate 3Settcor Cos=cz
2. Direct Pri-ztzs Sz7tor Zensi-ts
Shetild local Covernments caoccse Lo adapt more Siringent
sullding codss, 1t 1s concesvzkle that privats Duginesses 1
the uwldlxg z3d consiruciicn industrv would e i1nvolved,
therefore preofiting £rom thiz acst
2. Effects cn Teonpetition, Private Eatsrpraiss  and Emrlormsent
Markets
See Z. abcve
D. tICAL COMMENTS-
NonlE
LCNG PANGE ZONSEZUENCES
Thos2 who chooss te zdort mors stringsat resguirements than s=t fort
in the State Minimum Building Coées Act would mcors than likely ke
oroviding better and longsr las=ting builldings and structares for
“he1r citizens therefore mInimizing the costs cf repairs and
r=ncwvations
COMMENTS
Ieznate 2111l 7 has rassed the Senats Zcoconemic Cormunit, andé Cons'imer
~Affzirs Commlttee and the Senate Appropriations Commiti=ss (with 1
am=idmant - snrikes 4% days and r=plzces 1t with 29)

AMENDMENTS :

ITone

)



Page 1
Bi1ll #: HB 779
Date: 4-21-88

VI. <SIGNATURES*

SUESTANTIVE COMMITTEE-
Prapared bky:

TINMANCE & TAXATICHM:
Frenared by Staff Dir=zcter
APFPROPEIATIONS

in
ot
joH]
[ 5
th
()
'_.I
L)
D
(]
oF
(@]

4

Srepared by

4




STORAGE NAME: h0779s.ca

Date: __4-27-88
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES C.S / HB 77 7
COMMITTEE ON COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
STAFP ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT
BILL #: _CS/HB 779

RELATING TO: Building Construction Standards

SPONSOR(S) : Rep. C.F. Jones

EFFECTIVE DATE: Upon Becoming a Law

COMPANION BILL(S): Similar SB 7

OTHER COMMITTEES OF REFERENCE: (1) Appropriations
(2)

L2 22222 SRR 2222222222 RRRRRRRRRRRR2RRRRRRRRRRRRRRRRRRRRR2RRRRRRRRRRERRRRRR SR

I. SUMMARY:

A.

PRESENT SITUATION:

Part VI of chapter 553, Florida Statutes, (Florida Building Codes
Act) provides for the adoption of State Minimum Building Codes
which contain standards flexible enough to cover all phases of
construction and which provide reasonable protection of the
public health, safety, and welfare. As of October 1, 1984, each
local government was required to adopt one of the four State
Minimum Building Codes as its building code to cover all types of
construction. Such codes must include the provisions of parts I
through VII of the chapter, relating to plumbing, electrical
requirements, glass, manufactured buildings, accessibility by
handicapped persons and thermal efficiency.

Section 553.73(3), Florida Statutes, states that local
governments may provide for more stringent requirements than
those specified in the State Minimum Building Codes Act. The
local governing body must base such a decision on a demonstration
of local conditions which justify the need for stricter code
requirements for the protection of life and property. If the
requirements are expanded, they may not discriminatory against
otherwise acceptable materials, products or construction
techniques.

Section 553.79, Florida Statutes, prohibits any person to engage
in building construction in Florida without first obtaining a
permit from the appropriate agency.

EFFECT OF PROPOSED CHANGES:
The bill amends subsection (3) of section 553.73, Florida
Statutes, as amended by section 1, chapter 87-287, Laws of

Florida, and adds subsection (12) to section 553.79. (Section
553.79 Part IV relates to the State Minimum Building Codes)

S S MAY 311988



"Page 2
Bill #:

CS/HB 779

Date: 4-27-88

The bill requires local governments desirous of applying more
stringent requirements to the State Minimum Building Code to:

(1) Advertise for a public hearing (10 days in advance)

(2) Hold a public hearing

(3) Review conditions which necessitate a change to more
stringent applications than those in the State Minimum Building
Code.

The bill also adds new lanquage to the application process which
requires that:

(1) Any person applying for a building permit, is entitled to a
listing of all requirements, codes and amendments to any
requirements and/or codes;

(2) The permit for a single-family residential home must be
issued within 30 days of application unless (a) unusual
circumstances require longer; or (b) the permit application fails
to satisfy current laws, ordinances or codes.

SECTION-BY-SECTION ANALYSIS:

Section 1. Requires a local public hearing before any changes can
be made to the building code and there must be valid reasons as
to why the changes are needed. This section also requires that
any person applying for a building permit is entitled to a
listing of all requirements, codes and amendments to any
requirements and/or codes.

Section 2. Requires that a building permit for a single-family
residential dwelling must issued within 30 after applying.
Exceptions provided.

Section 3. Provides an effective date of upon becoming a law.

II. FISCAL ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT:

A.

FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE AGENCIES/STATE FUNDS:

1. Non-recurring or First Year Start-Up Effects:
N/A

2. Recurring or Annualized Continuation Effects:

N/A

3. Long Run Effects Other Than Normal Growth:

N/A

4. Appropriations Consequences: -

>/

N/A



“Page 3
Bill %: CS/HB 779
Date: 4-27-88
B. FISCAL IMPACT ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS AS A WHOLE:

1. Non-recurring or First Year Start-Up Effects:

N/A

2. Recurring or Annualized Continuation Effects:

To the extent that reviews of local conditions regquired
before adopting more stringent building code provisions
necessitate additional staff and public hearings, local
governments will incur costs.

3. Long Run Effects Other Than Normal Growth:
N/A
C. DIRECT ECONOMIC IMPACT ON PRIVATE SECTOR:

1. Direct Private Sector Costs:

2. Direct Private Sector Benefits:

Should local governments choose to adopt more stringent
building codes, it is conceivable that private businesses in
the building and construction industry would be involved,
therefore profiting from this act.

3. Effects on Competition, Private Enterprise, and Employment

Markets:
See 2. above
D. FISCAL COMMENTS:

None

ITII. LONG RANGE CONSEQUENCES:

Those who choose to adopt more stringent requirements than set forth
in the State Minimum Building Codes Act would more than likely be
providing better and longer lasting buildings and structures for
their citizens therefore minimizing the costs of repairs and
renovations.

IV. COMMENTS:
Senate Bill 7 has passed the Senate Economic Community and Consumer

Affairs Committee and the Senate Appropriations Committee (with 1
amendment - strikes 45 days and replaces it with 30).

Sl 2



Page 4
Bill &%: CsS/HB 779
Date: 4-27-88

V. AMENDMENTS:

None

VI. SIGNATURES:

SUBSTANTIVE COMMITTEE:
P red by:

b~

Wwilliam Hightower

FINANCE & TARATION:

Prepared by: Staff Director:
APPROPRIATIONS:
Prepared by: Staff Director:

Al



AS PASSED BY THE LEGISLATURE

STORAGE NAME: h0779s-f.ca
J>ate: July 18, 1988

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES
COMMITTEE ON COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
FINAL STAFF ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT

3ILL #%: CS/HB 779 (sB 7)

RELATING TO: Building Construction Standards

SPONSOR(S) : Community Affairs; Rep. C.F. Jones

IFFECTIVE DATE: Upon becoming a law

JATE BECAME LAW: July 1, 1988

HAPTER #: 88-142, Laws of Florida

COMPANION BILL(S): HB 1617, SB 7

JTHER COMMITTEES OF REFERENCE: (1) Appropriations
(2)

CARKRKARKRKAKRKRKAKRKRAR AR AR kA ARk kA Ak hkAhkhkkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkhkkhkhkkhkkkkhkkkkkkkkkkkkkk

JGC SUMMARY :

House Bill 779 passed the House Community Affairs Committee as a
Committee Substitute on 4-27-88, was withdrawn from the House
Appropriations Committee and was subsequently substituted for Senate
Bill 7 which passed both Houses and is now Chapter 88-142, Laws of
Florida.

Senate Bill 7 is identical to CS/H 779 with the exception of the
phrase '"working" in Section 2 of the bill relating to the length of
time for which a building permit must be issued. Committee
Substitute for House Bill 779 states "30 days" and Senate Bill 7
states "30 working days".

A. PRESENT SITUATION:

Part VI of chapter 553, Florida Statutes, (Florida Building
Codes Act) provides for the adoption of State Minimum Building
Codes which contain standards flexible enough to cover all
phases of construction and which provide reasonable protection
of the public health, safety, and welfare. As of October 1,
1984, each local government was required to adopt one of the
four State Minimum Building Codes as its building code to cover
all types of construction. Such codes must include the
provisions of parts I through VII of the chapter, relating to
plumbing, electrical requirements, glass, manufactured
buildings, accessibility by handicapped persons and thermal
efficiency.



Page 2
Bill #:
Date:

HB 779
7-18-88

Section 553.73(3), Florida Statutes, states that local
governments may provide for more stringent requirements than
those specified in the State Minimum Building Codes Act. The
local governing body must base such a decision on a
demonstration of local conditions which justify the need for
stricter code requirements for the protection of life and
property. If the requirements are expanded, they may not
discriminatory against otherwise acceptable materials, products
or construction techniques.

Section 553.79, Florida Statutes, prohibits any person to engage
in building construction in Florida without first obtaining a

permit from the appropriate agency.
EFFECT OF PROPOSED CHANGES:

The bill amends subsection (3) of section 553.73, Florida
Statutes, as amended by section 1, chapter 87-287, Laws of
Florida, and adds subsection (12) to section 553.79. (Section
553.79 Part IV relates to the State Minimum Building Codes)

The bill requires local governments desirous of applying more
stringent requirements to the State Minimum Building Code to:

(1) Advertise for a public hearing (10 days in advance)

(2) Hold a public hearing

(3) Review conditions which necessitate a change to more
stringent applications than those in the State Minimum Building
Code.

The bill also adds new language to the application process which
requires that:

(1) Any person applying for a building permit, is entitled to a
listing of all requirements, codes and amendments to any
requirements and/or codes;

(2) The permit for a single-family residential home must be
issued within 30 working days of application unless (a) unusual
circumstances require longer; or (b) the permit application
fails to satisfy current laws, ordinances or codes.

SECTION-BY~SECTION ANALYSIS:

Section 1. Requires a local public hearing before any changes
can be made to the building code and there must be valid reasons
as to why the changes are needed. This section also requires
that any person applying for a building permit is entitled to a
listing of all requirements, codes and amendments to any
requirements and/or codes.




Page 3
Rill 4: HB 779
Bate: 7-18-88

Section 2. Requires that a building permit for a single-family
residential dwelling must issued within 30 working days after
applying. Exceptions provided.

Section 3. Provides an effective date of upon becoming a law.

II. FISCAL ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT:

A. FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE AGENCIES/STATE FUNDS:

1. Non-recurring or First Year Start-Up Effects:

N/A

2. Recurring or Annualized Continuation Effects:

N/A

3. Long Run Effects Other Than Normal Growth:

N/A

4. Appropriations Consegquences:

N/A

B. FISCAL IMPACT ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS AS A WHOLE:

1. Non-recurring or First Year Start-Up Effects:
N/A

2. Recurring or Annualized Continuation Effects:

To the extent that reviews of local conditions required before adopting
more stringent building code provisions necessitate additional staff and
public hearings, local governments will incur costs.

3. Long Run Effects Other Than Normal Growth:

N/A
C. DIRECT ECONOMIC IMPACT ON PRIVATE SECTOR:

1. Direct Private Sector Costs:

2. Direct Private Sector Benefits:

Should local governments choose to adopt more stringent building codes,
it is conceivable that private businesses in the building and
construction industry would be involved, therefore profiting from this
act.




Page 4
Bill #
Pate:’

III.

Iv.

: HB 779
7-18-88

3. Effects on Competition, Private Enterprise, and Employment Markets:

See 2. above
D. FISCAL COMMENTS:

None

LONG RANGE CONSEQUENCES:

Those who choose to adopt more stringent requirements than set forth
in the State Minimum Building Codes Act would more than likely be
providing better and longer lasting buildings and structures for
their citizens therefore minimizing the costs of repairs and
renovations.

COMMENTS :
None

SIGNATURES:

SUBSTANTIVE COMMITTEE:
Prepayed, by:

William B. Hightower

FINANCE & TAXATION:
Prepared by: Staff Director:

withdrawn

APPROPRIATIONS:
Prepared by: Staff Director:




	Session Law 88-142
	Recommended Citation

	tmp.1685067385.pdf.UpE9l

