
Florida State University College of Law Florida State University College of Law 

Scholarship Repository Scholarship Repository 

Staff Analysis Florida Legislative Documents 

2000 

Session Law 00-372 Session Law 00-372 

Florida Senate & House of Representatives 

Follow this and additional works at: https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis 

 Part of the Legislation Commons 

Recommended Citation Recommended Citation 
& House of Representatives, Florida Senate, "Session Law 00-372" (2000). Staff Analysis. 1242. 
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis/1242 

This Article is brought to you for free and open access by the Florida Legislative Documents at Scholarship 
Repository. It has been accepted for inclusion in Staff Analysis by an authorized administrator of Scholarship 
Repository. For more information, please contact efarrell@law.fsu.edu. 

https://ir.law.fsu.edu/
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/fl-legislative
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis?utm_source=ir.law.fsu.edu%2Fstaff-analysis%2F1242&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=PDFCoverPages
https://network.bepress.com/hgg/discipline/859?utm_source=ir.law.fsu.edu%2Fstaff-analysis%2F1242&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=PDFCoverPages
https://ir.law.fsu.edu/staff-analysis/1242?utm_source=ir.law.fsu.edu%2Fstaff-analysis%2F1242&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=PDFCoverPages
mailto:efarrell@law.fsu.edu


Jc,/f .Z uo ! -.i' .Z. .r

�- .. 

2 oOO -.J7 2_ ( r ,- ; ? 2 S, 0 6 ) 
('DF 

� 

I 

@ ____ 2.o_oo _- 5 J .2 / 
5 _.,,., 31 (;r,_I_ -2, -2:7_-2.Zr�J_) _____ ___ __ ..2_�! 1�3-Zo/1 _-

@ __ Jl_lt,-l _ !l;y s_? 22:-_0 1-0 

----- JV-::_f- _l_rl__ o_,,, _.? 8_ 2_-3--_o ___ or_ ( 5 ---- ----- -------- --

----5 _ _ @_IJ�____c[}_ 'f /o o__ { ePi/�r; _e_l. c; !_)_ /V__I)_, __ � <1.?() 7,,?_f ,.c, :i' 2. 70, /oo 7' o (
�--- -- �- __J!_ /J, I -1'/_-_sZ:_ -- ---- -------

2. (j) ff 'J s/.[j_oo f- 17�!!._1 172,r, 12.2 __Jss-
n I 

.u,.1, 

__ ±_ ___ U,/ cs, 5/l 2.ZQ_ I� E..,,,_,,_,_ /__/-� -57) IH2;1__!_7_- -� 

2L_@ __ d_, F�,, I /JI.1.,-_t., __A__�-1-L._y_,[_Lf __ a_f _ cs /_�f? -<2Q,, _ __zt/4oo _ _ __ _ 

-- - - - - _ ?___: _e -..,s,_ iR:--"'1� .,t ro�r�- �,<_ - SI",<,_ v1'1c,.- ,:-- (c;__ Ii __ ) - - .2 72 - :Z.7 2___

__ _ I __ _ 6)_ 8_1_ L,L_ __ II)' __ _!-/ f_ _ I IQ CJ __ _ _ ___ _ __ ___ ___ _ ___ 
_ _ 3__ <f) _ _ /Jmf), /YcJ, Y- __ fo_ _;-1/J /IO'f--/ {[,,,_� ,;._ jl; -le�) ____ 

_ _ _ "1- ;2 o _1_ 2,_ 1_.s:__ _ -1 J?J-/ Q_ o__ _ _ __ _ _ _ __ _ __ _ 
___ -� __ (j) ____ ft_J __ t/:z_r-__/Qo_ ___ c, �-c_._'--9 l _;p__?±?; _?s2 ___ __ 

------ -- - -- - -- 4/VI[) S'

_ 1 _ @) __ He 1;09 
' I 

-- - s.:-<',- .?.? 
- -- - - --- ---

( .,1- - C, e C"-f _1 ff,{, 4 r -Sj

d_<f--t 
91.5'- /7

% 9_ 1--7< - . - -1 

150 58-5 - - -- I 

__ /l__ff __ (l{!C, _ � �""-"t--_feG_�.i; //'- /___ _ _ _____ _ .[61__ 1 {,Is-,;

l��-J 8tl'-- ft,...,-,4r,,- 0,C yr? L/0 9, ,-'-'------�--­
________ __,{�v'-'.,..,'-'-'-'--l"'?_L ___Af"� 1�--2_ J /; 6 /_oq {II-II ) l F �;;'� ) 0 ?S- - 6 4-_]

L _ _(j]J_ e IL c _ f/,y __ .s
t
? I ot9-___ ���- ___ �- -�-z_t � 

�-3 (!j) /t-41C?� _fr!_ {5/s_rl _J_p_(,_'t___(bLft_{rjl_)�/_.z/ooJ_;,.�:,,,,) ____ q71--1?eo

-�



5 

2 600 -57 2

-- - - - -

{l)_ __ -2.__Q_QQ_ - .1 7 2 / 
.5 "r, 3 I

@ /J;t...L fl, s '8' 2-2 0- --------- ----- -- - _,7 - --

(re; ?.2s,06) 

Jc,/] ;:> uu, -.i' .Z. J

f' VF

(;r, _!_ -2 I _,3_?_-4_/JQ_l __ - -- - --!--_f,.23-.Zo/, _-
1- o 

_______ _______ N,,__r _!,,.., 0,-/7 _58 2.Z_O __ o� _c_, ________ _ 
____ 3 _ _ @____g��J i /o o_ { �Ci '�i;- _ e_l, _GI)_�-:!),_ � '1--.?O ?.f

1

/4-,,,._ .? ..2. __ ?q, loo_-/ Of

- - -- f P, _ __j_F_..i'j_�__s2.. -- - -------- ---- ------------- -
2-- -- __ r:j)__ ff 'J _s /,[_jq_ o f , _j__ ?j_J__ 1-flil I 22 t _ _/ -i' J 

n :,,,_ 1, 

±_ __ � __ _Ls,/5<? .2_6Q__ _j__ �r- E.,.,. __ /f, !__
1 

4-'--'lc:__-"'--'>0"'-------------

2_1 _ @ ___ !/, Ft�-. 1 _fJz;,,__c, .A,.,--1-0,[_ ,s- _ o_f_ __ c:r !_-!:'__€' ;,..2__ o 1)/400 
___i_±()_ I I ,!7 -. '-_0: 

__ __ _ _ _ _  /1___._(Jv F, ,:___,,"'(,if rv~,-,._,,,,<_ _ S-t'"":_v1:c.,-_[' _("'!_Ii__) __ ..272_ - .292___

____ l ___ (i)_ __ 8!L_L__ (-17 !ft?_ (/_0']_ __ _______ ________ _ ______ __ _ .,s _1-6
__ J_ ___ (j) ____ /10::!), ,,Yv. '/ __ / Q _ f{j_jl[)__'t_

-/
_([-:_"-,:,_.}-__/''!___;_l_E!-) _ __ __ __ _ _ C{15'-17 

____________ :"lj ;201_:Z'j_f"_ ___ 1-j?!J-/o__u____ ________ _____________ _ __
--- _2-____ (j) ____ Jj_) __ t/2.)_/00 - _(_ 5�"_. 

1_"1_) _;p_ __ ?f-2; __ 7J2� -- - - % 9 / 1--7-.' 
4/l-,o S' ------ -- --- ------- - - - -

-
---:?,-<'. :?.? 

- -- - - - -- -- -- ------ --- ---- -- --- -

_ "f_@ _ tf_(J !/09 ({/'c-v;_,ff,_{, 41-5/ _ 1_30
1
s2J -J

� 
' I 

--: --fM__ 
__ /I§ __ [l{d_<'f _ �N�� _r,:-_c,_?-i.; f,P, /__ _ _ _____ _ 567__1 b!S-c-

/-r ,_,.� f fJ r l '-- 11 =4-ea __ _c;, � If fl LL O 9 ,. , , __________ _ 
--------�{�c;;_....,�/>7. < ___A-!r,111<._f_ J/j6/_oq (II-// ){op-";;;,';;) 5?:S--(4-] 

__ __L___{jj2 f3 /e,_ c __ ff.� _-:,-f? I ot1-_________ _________ _____ 2_'/_ rJ

____ 3 __ (])_ /1-M{). _fq (S /_-,fl __ j_{?_f, __ 1: ___ (/11 /f£1,_d(_)__�1�/20 (;:;,�) ____ qZ_<f-r?c

-r------6----- - --



D Chapter 2000-372 Tille Page 
D Laws of Florida, 2000, Chapter 2000-372 

v D Passed B ill CS/SB 220- History 
D SB 220 (premed 10/7199) 
D CS/SB 220 (3128/00 - Regulated Industries) 
D Staff Analysis of CS/SB 220 (3129/00- Regulated Industries) 
D House Amendments (3) to CS/SB 220 (514/00) 
D House Message Summary for CS/SB 220 (514/00- Regulated Industries) 
D House Journal for 515/00, pp. 1719-1730. 
D CS/SB 220 First Engrossed (515/00) 
D CS/SB 220 Enrolled (LOF Ch. 2000-372) 
D House Final Bill Analysis of CS/SB 220 (711 /00 - Business Regulation ... ) 

v D Compare Bill CSIHB 993 - History 
D HB 993 (preflled 218100) 
D BIii Analysis ofHB 993 (3117/00- Business Regulation .. ) 
D CSIHB 993 (3121 /00- Business Regulation .. ) 
[) Bill Analysis of CSIHB 993 (3121100 - Business Regulation ... ) 
D Bill Analysis ofCSIHB 993 (4/6/00- Insurance) 
[) Amendment to CSIHB 993 (4I11/00- Insurance) 
D 8111 Analysis of CSIHB 993 (4/11100 - Insurance) 
D BIii Analysis ofCSIHB 993 (4114100 - GOYI. Rules ... ) 
D BIii Analysis of CSIHB 993 (4119100 - Govt. Rules ... ) 
D Final Bill Analysis of CSIHB 993 (6129/00 - Business Regulation .. ) 

v D Compare Bill HB 11 09 - History 
D H81109 
[) Bill Analysis of HB 1109 (3J9/00 - Community Affairs) 
[) Amendment to HB 1109 (3123/00- Community Affairs) 
[) Bill Analysis of HB 1109 (3/23/00 - Community Affairs) 
D Bill Analysis of HB 1109 (3124/00 - Business Regulation .. ) 
D Amendment to HB 1109 (3128/00- Business Regulation ... ) 
[) 81II Analysis of HB 1109 (3/30/00 - Business Regulation .. ) 
D 1'mendments (7) to HB 1109 (4124-25/00) 
[) House Journal for 4125100, pp. 7 4 7-757 
D HB 11 09 First Engrossed 
[) Amendments (10) to HB 1109 First Engrossed (4126-5121 /00) 
D House Journal for 511/00, pp. 1254-1256 
D HB 1109 Second Engrossed 
D Final Bill Analysis ofHB 1109 (5116/00 - Community Affairs) 

v D Compare Bill HB 1583 - History 
D HB 1583 (prefiled 2n9/00) 

v D Compare BIii HB 2115- History 
D Bill Analysis of PCB 00-01 (10/4199- Business Regulation) 
D HB 2115 (tiled 3123/00) 
D Bill Analysis of HB 2115 (3124100 - Business Regulation ... ) 
D Bill Analysis of HB 2115 (4110/00 - General GOYI. Approps.) 
D Amendment to HB 2115 (4112/00- Genral Govt. .A,pprops.) 
D BIii Analysis of HB 2115 (4112/00 - Gen. Govt . .A,pprops.) 
D 1'mendment to HB 2115 (4124/00 - Ogles) 
D House Journal for 4128100, pp. 1170-1171 
D HB 2115 First Enarossed 
D Final 8111 Analysis of HB 2115 (6/29100. Business Reaulallon. ) 



. , . 

v CJ Compare BIii HB 2239- History 
CJ Bill Analysis of PCB 00-03 (3127/00- Business Regulation ... ) 
Cl HB 2239 (!lied 3131 /00) 
Cl Bill Analysis of HB 2239 (3/31 /00 • Business Regulation ... ) 
CJ Amendments Cl) to HB 2239 (4127-28/00) 
CJ Final BIii Analysis ofHB 2239 (6/29/00- Business Regulation ... ) 

v CJ Compare Bill CSISB 1064 - History 
CJ SB 1064 (preflled 1121/00) 
[) CSISB 1064 (3121/00- Regulated Industries) 
CJ staff Analysis of CSISB 1064 (3118/00- Regulated Industries ... ) 
CJ Staff Analysis or CSISB 1 004 (3131 /00 rev. 4/4/00 - Comprehensive Planning ... ) 
CJ Amendment to CSISB 1064 (415100 - Comprehensive Planning .. ) 
[) Amendments (11) to CSISB 1064 (512-4100) 

v CJ Compare Bill CSISB 1464 - History 
Cl SB 1464 (preflled 2116/00) 
[) staff Analysis of SB 1464 (3110/00 rev. 414/00- Comprehensive Planning ... ) 
CJ CSISB 1464 (4118/00 - Regulated Industries ... ) 
CJ staff Analysis ofCSISB 1464 (4118/00- Regulated Industries) 

v CJ Compare BIii CSISB 1800 - History 
CJ SB 1800 (prefiled 2128/00) 
CJ CS/SB 1800 (4113100- Regulated Industries) 
CJ staff Analysis of CS/SB 1800 (4114/00- Regulated Industries) 
Cl Amendments (2) to CSJSB 1800 (4125-27/00) 



FLORIDA LEGISLATURE-COMBINED SESSIONS-2000 

CITATOR-BILLS INTRODUCED AND PASSED 

515 

(Citator reflects Florida Statute numbers listed in final passed bill-not 
necessarily final statutory placement. Verify with F.S. tracing tables.) 

FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 721 (CONT.! FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 7.tl (CONT) 
72118 S 908. �12000-302) 741 316 S 1124, HJ&all{ 2000-220 J 
721 19 S 908, H..lli(2000-302) 7413165 S 1126, H 1037(2000-219) 
721 20 S 908, fi._filQ(2000-302) 741 32 H 4025 
721 21 S 908, H ... 5i3J2000-302) 741 ,01 H 4025 
721 24 S 908, H...fill3.(2000-302) 741402 H 4025 
72126 S 908, �{2000-302) 741405 H 4025 
72127 S 908, li...5.2..3.(2000-302) 
72129 S 908, =(2000-302) FLORIDA STATUl'E CHAPTER 742 

721 51 S 908, H 59312000-302) 742031 S 1500, H 2421 
72152 S 908, =(2000-302) 742 107 S 1854, H 2409 

721 53 S 908, �12000-302) FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 743 
721 55 S 908, li.,Qfil.(2000-302) 743 07 H 2421 
721 551 S 908, =(2000-302) 
721 552 S 908, H.5_fil(2000-302) FLORIDA STATUI'E CHAPI'ER 7« 
721 553 S 908. li..5..M(2000-302) 74.( 3031 S 1804, H 933 
721 56 S 90�. =(2000-302) 74-4309 S 358(2000-3491, S 1196(2000-135), 
72158 S 908, H 593 S 1804, S 1856, 
721 81 S 908, H 593(2000-302) H 933, H 1993, 
72182 S 908, �! 2000-302) H 2203, H 2259 
72184 S 908, li...52J(2000-302) 74.( 3135 S 180-4, H 933 
721 85 S 908, tl...filQ(2000-302) 7.(4 3145 S 1048, H 947 
72186 S 908, �(2000-302) 744 3146 S 1050 

74( 3201 S 1804, H 933 
FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 723 744 3215 S 1048, H 947 
723 003 S 84-6, S 2342, 

H 543, H 1041, 
74( 331 S 1804, H 933 

H 2391 
744 362 $ 1804, H 933 

723 004 S 2342, H 2391 
744 3678 S 1804, H 933 

723 005 S 2342, H 2391 
744 368 S 1804, H 933 

723 006 S 2342 
744 369 S 1624 

723 011 S �342, H 2391 
744 3691 S 1804, H 933 

723 012 S 23(2, H 2391 
744 3701 S 1804, H 933 

723 015 S 2342 
744444 S 974, H 1057!2000-1551 

723 021 S 23-42, H 2391 744474 S 35&2000-349), S 1856, 

723 022 S 2342, H 2391 
H 1993, H 2259 

723 033 S 2342, H 2391 744 534 S 1042 

723 035 S 23(2 744 702 S 1048, H 947 

723 037 S 2342, H 2391 744. 7021 S 1048, H 947 

723 051 S 2342 744 703 S 104.8, H 947 

723 059 S 2342, H 2391 744 704 S 1048, H 947 

723 071 S 846, H 1041 7(4 705 S 1048, H 947 

723 072 S 8(6, H 1041 744 708 S 1048, H 947 

723 073 S 21(2 744 7081 S 35&2000-349), S 1856 
723 0751 �{2000-258), H 2439 H 1993, H 2259 
723 076 S 2342 744 709 S 1048, H 947 
723 078 S 846, H 1041 FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 751 
723 079 S 2342 751 01 H 4025 
723 0791 S 2342 751 011 H 4025 
FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPI'ER 725 751 0.( H 4025 
725 06 £..Z.2Q.<2000-372), S 1996, FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 752 

H 1083, H 1109 752 01 S 288, S 976, 
725 08 S 1996, H...1Q8J.( 2000-162 ) H 423, H .... lQfil!:(2000-156} 
FLORIDA STATlTI'E CHAPTER 731 752 011 S 288, H -423 
731111 S 906, H 425 752 015 S 288, H 423 

752 07 S 288, H 423 
FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPl'ER 732 
732 107 S 832, H 615 FLORIDA STATIITE CHAPTER 753 
732 9216 S 2132, lUQ.a1(2000-305) 753 001 S 310, H 18il 

753 002 , S 310, H 1871 
FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 733 753 003 S 310 
733 604 S 906, H 425 753 004 S 310, S 980, 
733 817 S 982, H 1065(2000-1591 !i.J..Qy_3_( 2000-158 l, H 1871, 
FLORIDA �STATUTE CHAPTER 737 H 4025 
737 206 �12000-245) 753 01 S 310, H 1871 
737 2065 H 599<2000-2451 753 02 S 310, H 1871 
737 303 tl...m2000-2-45) 75303 S 310, H 1871 
737 4031 S sso, �12000-245) 753 04 S 310, H 1871 
737 4032 S 830, �(2000-245) 75305 S 310 
737 4033 S 830, H 599<2000-245J 753 06 H 1869 
737 625 li._ffl(2000-245) 
737 626 �t 2000-245 ! 

FLORIDA STATlITE CHAPI'ER 760 
760 02 S 1038, S 1090, 

FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 741 S 2232, H 495, 
741 03055 H 4025 H 581, H 2367 
741 03056 H 4025 760 06 S 1090, H 495 
741 28 S 708. H 2309 760 10 S 1090, H 495 
741 29 S 974, H....1Qfil(2000-155) 760 101 S 2232. H 2367 
741 2901 H 2309 760 102 S 2232, H 2367 
741 2902 H 4025 760 103 S 2232, H 2367 
741 30 S 703, S 1942, 760 104 S 2232, H 2367 

H 377. H 2309 760 105 S 1090. H 4g5 

(BILLS UNDERLINED HAVE PASSED BOTH CHAMBERS, 

lCITATOR INCLUDES COMMITrEE SUBS 6 AMENDED BILI.SJ 

;t....!.";,-;':. 

FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 760 (CONT) 
760 11 

760 26 

76029 
760 31 
760 34 
760 51 
760 60 
760 80 
760 855 

S 1090, 
S 2232, 
H 2367 
S 194, 
s..z.fil8(2000-353), 
S 1326, 
S 1326, 
S 2232, 
S 2232, 
S 2232, 
S 2232, 
H 1947 

S 1624, 
H 495, 

S 2310, 
H 2261 
H 897 

H 897 
H 2367 
H 2367 
H 2367 
H 2367 

FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPI'ER 766 
765 102 �(2000-295), H 2429 
765 1103 �2000-295), H 2429 
765 203 S 1890(2000-295), H 2429 
765 204 s..la9Q( 2000-295 ), H 2429 
765 205 �12000-295t, H 2429 
765 303 �12000-295), H 2429 
765 305 �2000-295}, H 2429 
765 306 �(2000-295), H 2429 
765 401 �(2000-295), H 2429 
FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 766 
766 101 S 1932, H 567, 

li_ID(2000-318) 
766 102 S 808, S 1718, 

S 2492, H 1659, 
H 1953 

766 105 S 906, H 425 
766 106 S 808, S 984, 

S 992, �(2000-341), 
H 59h2000-318>. H829. 
lU.Q_fill 2000-160 I, H 1625, 
H 4063 

766 110 S 1932, H 567, 
.fi___Q_filt2000-318J 

766 1115 S 1932, �12000-2421, 
H 567, H 591!2000-3181, 
H 2315 

766 202 S 808 
766 207 S 1940, H 171 
766 209 S 1940 H 171 
766 301 S 1242 
766 305 S 984, H 1067(2000-160) 
766 31 S 1242 
766 31" S 984, H___l_Q_fil ( 2000-160 1 
FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPI'ER 767 
767 06 S 700 
767 12 S 700 
767 14 S 700, H 355 
FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 763 
768 071 S 103-4, 
768 072 S 1034 
768 151 �(2000-341), H 4063 
768 27 S 177&2000-341), H 4063 
768 28 S 974, S 1962, 

H__lQ_fil(2000-155) 
768 29 H 13512000-1741 
768 30 �2000-3411, H 4063 
768 733 S 1720, H....l12J.(2000-128) 
768 735 S 1856 
768 79 S 750 
768 81 H 1651 
FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPI'ER 772 
772 104 S 2288, H 2327 
772 11 S 1136. H 109 
772 12 S 2414, �2000-320) 
FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 773 
773 01 S_TIQ( 2000-354 ), S 2324 
773 03 s..J.1.Q:( 2000-354), S 2324 
FLORIDA STATUTE CHAPTER 775 
775 021 S 276, H435 
775 027 � 2000-315), H1' 
775 082 S 1618, 
775 0823 S 312, 
775084 S 1151&,,, f1 

B..IIDI 



scuioo.->Bdls-.>Bill%20Info:S-/.200220->Ses!IKll1Y.202000. Online S�www.Jcg.state.tl us/Scaioofmdcx. .. 20Info'1.JAS•/.2S200220Yell)l'/43EScuiooY.2S202000 

1 of3 

/s·· OM!M bi - uns ne

.. , f ',�..,.��.r.: �/:f•�� >•): •t. ♦ 
♦ , A 

J11111p To: Bil Tgtf4} Amfodrolrpt1) Staff Ana,lyai&(J 1 YoMHWorvOl 

Senate 0220: Relating to Regulation of Nonmedical Professions 

S 220 GENERAL BILUCS/1ST ENG by Rogulatod lndustriu; Regulated lnduslnos; 
(C0-5PONSORS) Forman (Compare CSl!l.§ll. 2NO ENGl!illil, lilW, 1 ST 
ENG,);U11§. J:i.lla CSl2ND ENG/Uili, Cs.\U.OM. � CSl&..1.IIQO) 
BtAY■bon of NOIV]]ldqJ prpr.ypcw· provdN per elem & trawl 
expenses for bd of directors & staff of FIi. Engineers Management 
Corp., requns OPPAGA, n consultation 'Mttl Legislllt:we Conmittee on 
lriergovemrnental Relations lo eonduct IWdy of eorwtruc:tion retainage 
methods, adds circurrstanc:e under wtuch engineering docun.nts rnJst be 
su.cl, revilles scope of work of co�rcal & residential pooilspa 
conlrlldors & swirm'Wlg pooVspe servlc:mg c:ortrac:tors, etc. Amends FS. 
EFFECTIVE DATE 07101/200CI except H othel'W'ise provided 
10/07199 SENATE Profiled 
11/05199 SENATE Referred to Regui.ted Industries 
03/cr7/00 SENA TE lntroducod, rolorrod to Rogulotod Ind- -sJ 00023 
03/23IOO SENATE On Committee as,-nde- Regulated lndustnes. 0312&00, 3 30 

pm, 412-K 
03/28/00 SENATE Cornn �-CS by Rogulalad Ind-: YEAS 7 NAYS 0 

-sJ 00351, CS read first� on 03l30/00-SJ 00353 
03/29,'ll() SENATE Pllood on Calondor-sJ 00351 
04/27/00 SENATE PIie.ci on Sptcill Order Ca�r --sJ 00520; Read second time 

-sJ 00567 
05/02/00 SENATE Rud third Imo -$J 00752, CS po .. od, YEAS 40 NAYS 0 

-sJ 00752 
05I02IOO HOUSE In Messages 
05IOM)0 HOUSE ReceNed -HJ 01718; RHd second time -HJ 01719, Amendment(s) 

odoplod-HJ 01719; Rood thin! timo -HJ 01730, CS possod • 
amondlod, YEAS 119 NAYS 0-HJ01730 

05/05.00 SENATE In retumflg messages, W.staken up-SJ 01427, Cona.irred 
-sJ 01-437; CS possod as amondlod, YEAS 38 NAYS O -sJ 01437, 
Ordered engroSHd, then er.-olled -SJ 01437 

0&'13'00 &gMd by Officen and preMracl to Governor 
06/29100 Approwd by Governor, et.pier No 2000-3n, SN also CSISB 

1016 (Ch 2000-356) 

Bill Text: 

BtN Name 
S0220 

S0220C1 

S 0220E1 
S0220ER 

Dot. Poo1od 
08/25/2000 
0&'2512000 

0&'25/2000 
08/25/2000 

Avaitllble Fomals 
•W•b Pas, ,liellE
31tWtb page .El!E

Ji>Wtb Pl/II •:etiE
'<if W1b Paet •"2f

Committee Amendments and Filed F�or Amendments:� 

S0220. 
Amendment ID 

S0220C1. 

Dote Poslad Availlble Fomats 

I/ 2.J Pr: 

Clllllanl. 

, I Id ,,., / 

_] 1 "'6' 

2/2/2001 10,39 AM 



sess100...>Btlls->B1IW.20lnfo S-/.20022()...>Seui.on"/.202000 Online S�www leg.state.fl us/Scsstonfmdcx. .. 20Info"I.JAS•/.25200220-/.2D'/.J&Sesston"/.25202000 

2of3 

Amondmort ID 
1<43073 
392008 
795133 

S 0220E1 
Amondmort ID 

S 0220ER· 
Amondmort ID 

Staff Analysis: [gp\ 

Analys•ID 
S0220S1Z 
S0220 
S0220 

Vot•HIsto� 

Cha,- Roi Call 
HOUSE 0556 
SENATE 0035 
SENATE 0083 

Citations: 

STATUTE CITATIONS:(Il2p) 

011231:45 
� 
= 
0252 92◄ 
0404058 
0468603 
O◄M:§04 
0◄68 605 
Offil 607 
� 
0:4M 617 
Cl-468.619 
-= 

0:468627 
� 
9460633 

0471 0035 
0◄71 005 
0:471 011 
001 015 

0◄71 017 
lMILllZ1 
0471 023 
P:471 025 
0471 033 
0◄11 ma
� 
0◄01222 
PM9103 
0◄89105 
0◄09110 
0409120 
W9503 
0489505 
O◄a9507 
0409 514 
91fl9515 

Domf'ootod 
05I06l2000 
0510612000 
0510612000 

Doto Postad 

Doto Postad 

Sponoor 
BRC 
R•gulllt.d lndusblN: 
HoUN MeNNge Sumrr..ry 

Voto Dole 
05/05100 
05/02100 
05/05100 

Available Fonmts 
♦ Wtb PIRI ♦ eDE
♦ Wtb Pipe ♦ eDE
♦ Wtb PIRt ♦ eDE

Available FOON!s 

Available Fomwts 

Av,ulllt>. Fomwls 
••eDE 
♦eDE 
,i.EQE

Availlb6e Fonmts 
� WobPIAt 
;\/ Wtb PIRO 
ll<jW•bPlge 

2/2/200 I 10 39 AM 



scss,on->Btlls: Online Sumilinc htlp://www leg state fl.us/Semmfmdex. ... _ModC'"ViewBtlllnfo&Billnum-o'l93&YCIF2000 

I of2 

,
>'-

" ' 

-·,°"""4t � ..

�W�Q� 
J■mp To� Bil Ierlr'2) Arolockotrts{ I } 

House 0993: Reiab!;2 to Construction Documents 

StaffAoabMC01 Vote H"'9o,O} 

H N3 GENERAL BILL/CS by Buainua Regulatlon &. Consumw Affairs (CAC); arown: 
(CO-SPONSORS) Futch; Trovillion; Pruitt; Argenio; Greenstein; Patteraon 
(Similar� Compare 2ND ENG1H..UJ1J. CS/1ST ENC31lil211. CSl1ST 
E�CS/2NO� 
Co[)!ll;rudlon Qocuroonts adds arcumstanct under whtch enginHmg 
documents must be •••d; adds demrtion ot •■your Amends 4'71 025, 
633 021, EFFECTIVE DATE Upon be<olTllng law, 
02/0e/OO HOUSE Preflled 
02/24100 HOUSE Referred to Bus111ffS RegulatJon & Col16Umer Affairs (CAC); 

Insurance (CAC), Governmental Ru6es & Regulations {PRC), 
Conmunlly Nian (PRC); General Governn-1 Appropriations 
(FRC) 

03/07/00 HOUSE lntroduet,d, referred to Business RegulatJon & Consumer 
Nfa1rs (CAC), lnauranc:e (CAC), Governn.ntal Ruies & 
Regulations (PRC); Cormu,ity Affairs {PRC), General 
Governn-.nt Appropnations {FRC) •HJ 00068 

03117100 HOUSE On CorrmltN ■gendll- Business Regulation & Consumer Affairs 
(CAC), 03/21/00, 1 00 pm, -413-C 

03/21100 HOUSE Cornrn Action CS by eu.ineN Regulllbon & Conaurner Affairs 
(CAC), YEAS 8 NAYS O •HJ 00366 

03l29fOO HOUSE CS ,.ad ftrat tn,e on 03/29/00 •HJ 00360 
03/27,00 HOUSE P9nd.-.g revtewdCS under Rule 113-HJ 00366
O-CA'.l3100 HOUSE Now in Insurance (CAC) -HJ 00366 
CM/OMlO HOUSE On� age-- Int"'"'""' (CAC), 04/11l.1JO, 2.◄5 pm.

Reed Hal 
04/1 CWO HOUSE Conm Action. Favor■bie \\11th 1 amendrr-.nt(s) by Insurance 

(CAC), YEAS 1◄ NAYS 0-HJ 00537 
04/11/00 HOUSE Now In Governmental Rules & Regulobono (PRC) -HJ 00537 
04/17100 HOUSE On Cermillff agenda- Governmental Rule$ & Regulations (PRC),

04/19100, S·OOam, 12-H 
04/19100 HOUSE Cemm Action. Favorable by Govommoral Rule$ & R.,iations 

(PRC);YEAS 8 NAYS 0-HJ 00585 
0◄12(YOQ HOUSE Now 11 Cenvnunlly Nfain (PRC) •HJ 00585 
<M/26100 HOUSE Wthdrawn from Comm.riity Affan (PRC) �HJ 00775, Now in 

General Government ApproJ:riatlons (FRC) 
0027/00 HOUSE Wthdrawn from General Govtimment Appropriations (FRC) 

�HJ 00838, Placed on calendar, available for General Calendar 
OS'OSIOO HOUSE O.d on Calendar, ldenJSlmJCompare S.1(1) pasMd, refer to 

CS/SB 220 (Ch. 2000-3n), CS/SB 1018 (Ch 2000-356) 

BIii Text 

Bil Narr. 
H0993 
H 0993C1 

Doto Poslod

0&'211/2000 
0&'211/2000 

Corrvnlttee Amendments and Filed Ftoor Amendments: � 

H 0893: 

Amendment ID Doto Poslod 

H 0993C1 

Avaiable Fomwts 
•W•b E'IC!I ;ifllf 
4Vffbet91� 

Avail.blit Fom.ts 

Cllllion:I. 

2/2/200 I 10 ◄3 AM 



semon->Btlls Online Sunshine http //www leg state fl us/Scss1m/mdex. .. _ Mode=V1cw8tlllnfo&Billnum=0993& Y ear=2000 

2of2 

Amendmeri ID 

8821"9 

Staff Analysis: [Sp) 

No Staff Analysis Available 

VoteHl•to� 

No Voto HIOlcry Available 

Citations: 

STATUTE CITATIONS (I2Jl) 

0471 025 

CONSTITUTION CITATIONS· 

Date Po.t.d 

04/12/2000 

!,vf) 

I,-.,, I I+

1-Tr. 
4-(11 

NO CONSTITUTION CITATIONS FOUND FOR REQUESTED BILL 

Awulable- Fomwts 
..JfWtbPlat•el2E /,v_fvY-,.,._,( ( ,') ' (, 

?-!<rs I 4/ 11--
,S-- 12 I/ I I/ '7 (_ I 'i_

6R C I 

ljf r , 'I/

,�� if( ••��,1C:1tiiefi¾�w--ia;n�!�1tiet-11laL ,: 

Ol&cluner The 1nformabon on this ayatem ie unvenficd The .10uma.la or pnnted bills of the reapec.tive chambers should be coosulted fOf off"icial 
purpcllilef, Copyright Cl 2000 State of Flonda Cootact; YI 

3 /17 

;/;;, I 

I?/ 2 "I 

2/2/200 I IO �3 AM 



:sossico-->Btlls: On1mc Sumtune http·//www leg !late fl us/Scssim/mdex. . _ MOCW'ViewBilllnf�Bollnum~II09.tY CIF2000 

I of3 

.-'s···a..hi , uns ne 

..... ,t['l'\+�:l"J: "i��,�:ht',,,10 ).: ' � +d+(+bft 

J■mp To. 811 T■xtCU Amendowrt&C12l 

House 1101: Relat1!!2, to Construction 

Stwff MlbM'ffi 

H 110I GENERAL BIUJ2ND ENG by Stansel; (CO�RS) Casey (Compare 
CSJCS/JilUL 3RD ENG/liil1l. CS/Jl.jllj. CSfiliil li1HI, Will. 
CSJCS/1ST ENG� CS/1ST ENG/li.WIL CS/2ND ENC3/li.1ll1L � 
CSIJ..liH.C�C� 
ConstrudiPn proVldes for licensing of locaJly licenMd contractors; 
proVldn for� payrrant for nonconstrudbn Mrw::e., reVIMs 
language re tmety payment for purchlHs of eonstrudion seMCH, 
procedures for calc:uill.bon of payrrant due dates, mandatory int.rest, & 
i�roper Invoices & '9SOlutlon of dlsputn, provides for recovery of 
court costs & attorney's fees under �rtH'\ arcunwllnc»s, etc. Amwlds 
FS. EFFECTNE DATE: 07/01/2000 ex�pt as otherwise proVKted 
02/11/00 HOUSE Prelilod 
0212� HOUSE Reforred to Comminity Mair> (PRC), Busin ... Regulation & 

Consu,..., Man (CAC) 
03/07/00 HOUSE Introduced, referred to Corrm1.1nrty Mairs (PRC); Business 

Regulabon & Co,,..,,.., Mair> (CAC) -HJ 00076 
03/21/00 HOUSE On ConrniltH agenda-Conrnunlly Mairs (PRC), 03/23/00, HlO 

pm, Morria Hall 
03/23/00 HOUSE Comm Acbon. Favon,ble With 1 a,...ndmonl(s) by Comrninlly 

Mairs (PRC); YEAS 10 NAYS 0-HJ 003&4 
03/2� HOUSE Now In Buslnea Regulabon & Conou,..., Mairs (CAC) 

-HJ 0036'4, On � agenda- Buolneso Regulotiol1 & 
Consun.r Man (CAC), 03128/00, 1 30 pm, 413-C 

03/28100 HOUSE Comm. Action·-Favorablll wfth 1 amendment(s) by BusN11 
Regulabon & Consumer Affaws (CAC), YEAS 8 NAYS 0 
-HJ OCM16 

03iJOIIOO HOUSE Plloed on calendar, avallllbki for General Calendar ·HJ 00416 
04/19/00 HOUSE Placed on Special C>n»r Calendar 
04/25/00 HOUSE Placed on Spe<:,ol Ordef Calandar, RHd second !me -HJ 007 47-;­

,._,...ndment(s) adoptod -HJ 007 47 
05/01/00 HOUSE Read third time -HJ 01254, ,._,...ndmenl(s) adoptod -HJ 01255, 

Passedasamended;YEAS 119 NAYS 0•HJ01256 
05J01JOO SENATE In Messages 
05/02/00 SENATE Received, ..terred to Reguiatod Industries; Govemmonlal 

0..rs,gt,t and Pr-lly -6J 00897 
OSIOSIOO SENATE Oted in Commit .. on Regulated Industries, ktenJSinJCompare 

Bo!�•) pa ... d, roferto HB 219 (Ch 2000-141), CS/S8 220 
(Ch 2000-372), CS/SB 1016 (Ch. 2000-356) 

BUI Text: 

Vott HIMX)'( U 

Bil Nan. 
H 1108 
H 1108E1 
H 1108E2 

Data Postad 
Oll/211/2000 
Oll/2&/2000 
08/28/2000 

Available Forrrall 
.. Wtb f'l!!t • .fllf 
'1iWtb Pia ,a,ellf

.\""1b Paa � 

Committee Amendments and Filed Floor A.mendm.nts: � 

H 1108: 

.cl1alloni. 

21212001 10.45 AM 



sessioo->Btlls. Online Stmshme 

2of3 

Amendment ID 
18,4301 
2042115 
331299 
393277 
-71l5 
795-01 
903958 
S0.131 
9358-45 

H 1109E1 l 1" / 
Amendment ID 

033825 
133381 
182681 

--- -

203925 

394SM7 
532038 
610213 
844177 

-�--
9e0807 

H 1109E2 
Amendment ID 

Staff Analysis· [gp\ 

No Staff Analysis Avalloble 

Vot• History: [OP?

Cho..­
HOUSE 

Cltat,ons: 

Roi Call 
0331 

STATUTE CITATIONS.Uml) 

0112 31"5 

0218 735 

010:4058 
P468803 
0468 60:I 
0466605 
0466607
0460600
04M §17 
0468.619 

0468627 

httpJ/www leg state fl USl'Sc:ssim/mdex... _Mode=ViewBilllnfo&.Billnum==l 109& Y ear=2000 

DotePostod 
<M/25/2000 
<M/2612000 
03/3112000 --- -------�-

<M/26/2000 
<M/26/2000 
<M/2612000 
03/25/2000 
<M/26/2000 
<M/26/2000 

Doto Pootod 
05/03/2000 
05/03/2000 
<M/27/2000 
05/03l2000 
05/03/2000 
05/03/2000 
05/03i2ooo 
<M/27/2000 
05/03/2000 
<M/2712000 

Doto Postod 

SR.c .,72"

..E.E.-C� .,_/ so 

Vo• Date 
05/01/00 

--� 

Availlb. Fom-.ts 
♦ W.b P,91 4 EDE 
♦ Wtb P,91 '<l EDE
JL Wt_b f'iAt A EDE 
•iWtb PiAt >II EDE 

---

•IW•b P,91 .. iEDE 
a:;w,b Pl,91 .. ..eoE. 
• Wtb Plat • eDE
♦ Web Page • E12E

G. <l'..-Jd,�...., 
{,,u-- 1-

t:�.., ,.. /2.,7 J 

,-1/(h/... I 
f,z •• � -2.. 
Flof",',...-f,."-'I:. 
(",,;; I' 
;:::;o,,.. ',._,f r~.,1 

+/21 
,, 

,h& 

1 /21 

/'I-->;, "'/Y'S31-S 
_s/u 

/+.., '/Y',54> 
♦ Wob P.111 ,-, EDE h,rln. ;, 

4/ .Z'f J 

Availlbie Fonrats 
4,W.b P.111. EDE 
• Wtb PIPI A EDE
,If Web P.111 � EDE
.a- W,b PIPt ., eDE
• W.b P,91 • eJlE

L,- ✓,- r s/i 
L--.:: r ', 

k:�f:rf,uv 4 /z 6
-'h,t..cf".e .s/1 

,, 

• Web page • .eDf �' - � (./ I,<,,., ( s I I 
�- . .-�,.., 7,: ,-6 � 5 / I 
,t Wtb paqa ,a eCf. t'r o.V/V / 4 /.z G 
a w.b e,91 .- fllE "' . u. E ,.__ .s I,
• W.bP,91 ... EDE 011,,-- 9 /z 6

Avaioble Fonnots 

r -A -"'7 '1 ,-:,4 z. 
( ft ,q .:/2..:? 

Available FOffl'llta 
1'lWthPl91 

57u, 

21212001 10 45 AM 

1/ 2' 



scssioo-.>Btlls· Onltnc Suolhmc bttpl/www.log!llatefl.us/Sessiooiindcx. ... _Modc-ViewBilllnfo&Bdlnwn=J583&Y...,2000 

I of2 

,,
-.? 

'' 

,·o..u-. 

,sunshine 

.. 1��" +t?\-1' .. ;',t?4-141t"'� ++ '•+.::,1, � t
,. 

¥ 

J•mp Te: Bil T1¥10) ArolOOO'WfA( Q} 

House 1583· Relating to Pool/Spa Contracting 

Sgt( AnabH(O) 

H 1113 GENERAL BILL bf Ruuell (CompoR 2ND ENGJ!il1ll, 1im1. CS/1ST 
E�C� 
PRoVSnl Cnotradrlg· redeftnN scope of '#Ork of c:omrr.rcilll & 
Naidertal pooVapa contrac:k>r'li & IIIMrmwlQ pool/spa Mrviang 
c:o,._ctors Amends 438 105 EFFECTFV'E DATE. Upon t»coming law. 
02/29/00 HOUSE Profilod 
03107/00 HOUSE lnb'oduced -HJ 00102 
0311 (KIO HOUSE Referr.ci to Business RegWllbon & Consumer Afflln (CAC), 

General Government Appropriations (FRC) -HJ 00283 
03/22/00 HOUSE Wthdra'n'n from Business Regulation & ColWUl'T'ler Nfan (CAC), 

G.neral GovemnwntAppropnation5 (FRC), Wlthdrav;n from 
further cons,,lden/Stm'Compare Blll(a) passed, r.fer to CS/SB 
220 (Ch. 2000-Jn) -HJ 00295 

Bill Text: 

Vote Hi&aPo,O) 

BIi Name 
H 1583 

Date Posltd 
oef.Ze/2000 

Available Fonnall 
,fofi•b Pl•• i1t.Ellf 

CommittH Amendmenta and Flied Floor Amendments:� 

H 1583 
No Amendments Available 

Staff Analysis: [OP) 

No Slaff Analysis Ava•blo 

VoteH11to� 

No Vola Hlolory Ava•blo 

Citations: ,C&ill. 

STATUTE CITATIONS,(IoJl) 

-= 

CONSTITUTION CITATIONS: 

NO CONSTITUTION CITATIONS FOUND FOR REQUESTED BILL 

laallom.

2/2/2001 10.49 AM 



sessaoo->Btlls Online &auhinc htlp://www leg state.fl iwSessioofmdex. .. _ModCFVicwBtlllnfo&Btllnum-2115.tY..-2000 

I of2 

-�-� .. .

� "(-1;'...'f,,1 ,:t; .,,� �'r.t:.f :c �· ,.;,:;. , +i '' +-, ' = + 

J■,np To· Bil Ja¥1(2) AowOXDlrpt 2) staff Anatysls(O I Vo■ Hwtoo«:m 

House 2116: Rel•tlng to Florida Engineers Management Corp. 

H 2115 GENERAL BILL/1ST ENG by Business Regulation & Consumer Affairs (CAC); 
Ogles; (CO-SPONSORS) Brown (Compare CS/1ST � 
Rodde EnAIDHtJ M1rwg1rn1nt Com ■mends .Florida EnglnNl'I Managen.nt 
Corporation J.d'. provides for ttrrTn.bon of ntlill appomtments & for 
new appointments to board of clrectori, pJOVIClel ■ddrtional requi'ements 
of conlntct bet\wen nw.nagemerc corporabon & DBPR: provdn for 
ITllllintenanee of board reco,ds by management corporation; provides 
rulerm.ktng IIUthorty to board to ensure secunty of ex■nm!Ona, etc. 
Amands Ch 471, Ibrogat.s repeal of 471 038 EFFECTIVE DATE 
07/01/2000 
03/23,00 HOUSE Filed 
03/2alOO HOUSE Referred to General Government Appropriations (FRC) -HJ 00351 
03/29/00 HOUSE lntroducoa •HJ 00351 
04/07JOO HOUSE On Comrntt.• agenda- General Gov.mment Appropriations 

(FRC), 0011100, 1'()() pm, 21«: 
CM/11/00 HOUSE Comm. Action -Favorable 'Nlt'i 1 ■mendrnent(s) by General 

Govemmont Appropnallons (FRC}, YEAS 10 NAYS 0-HJ 00550 
CM/13/00 HOUSE Placed on calendar, ava1lllble for General C■lendar-HJ 00550 
CM/2400 HOUSE Placed on General C■lend■r, Tempon.riy postponed, on Second 

Re■dmq -HJ 00665 
Oo4/27/00 HOUSE Pacod on Spocool O<dor Calendar 
IW28IOO HOUSE Pacod on Spociol Order Cs-r, Rood NCOnd tmo -HJ 01170;­

Amondmont(s} adopted -HJ 01170 
05I03'00 HOUSE T-111rly poslponed, on Third Roadlrcl -HJ 01-459 
05/05100 HOUSE Died on Calendar, ldenJSmJCon-.-re Bll(s) passed, reNrto 

CS/SB 220 (Ch 2000-Jn} 

Bill Text: (Ig_ 

Bill Name 
H 2115 
H 2115E1 

Dote Posted 
08/28/2000 
Oll/21112000 

Committee ArnenMlents and Filed Floor Amendments:� 

H2115. 
Amondmont ID 

121757 
2'450<17 

H 2115E1 
Amendment ID 

Staff Analysis: [gpJ 

No Staff Analysts Avall■ble 

Dote Posted 
0,4/25/2000 
04/14/2000 

Dote Postod 

AvalllltM Fomats 
<l Web Pl•• •fllE

♦Y,,•• Pia, ,.eDE

Avallblo Fom-.ts 
•i W,b Pia, .. fl2E
♦ W1b Pia, �Ellf

Avai■ble Fomwts 

� 

�V�o�••�H:.;:;l•�to;;:.ryu[.o�s.1'------------���.;.. ______________ ..;;-;;.. ______ ,_
No Vote History Avaloblo 

2/2/200 I IO 50 AM 



SCSS&m->Bilb Online Sumib.me http·//www leg sWe ft.us/Scssim/'mdcx. ... _ Mode"'V1cwBilllnf�Btllnum=2239& Y car=2000 

l of2 

,OnllM .., • 

r;. ,-:,. '* ,r��, �- ..t,t,_.♦- ♦ :�+ -♦ 
� + • + *+� 

J11mpTo Bt1T1Xk1) Mllrx:lrnttA£Zl Staff Anabrw(O) YAM HM>QftO) 

House 2239: Relat:1n,2 to Construction 

H 2231 GENERAL BILL by Business Regulabon & Consumer Affairs (CAC); Ogles; 
(CO-SPONSORS) Cantens; Futch; OrNnstein; J. Miller, Brown (Similar 
c� Co"""''" 2ND EN°'1:l..11QI. tum CS/1ST ENG� 
Constructw>n HtabU11hes buidng code enforcement officials' bl of 
rights to provide speaal procedures ror invesbg■tion of C.Of11Jlal'lta 
aganst such officials, revtMS 1rtert re ex■rflN.tion requared for 
certific:ation ■s bulding oode administrator, plan1 exaniner, or 
bu11dmg code lllSpedor; reYIM$ grandfathenng provaionll for 
OM'bfic:abon of regilt9red elec:tncal & alarm system contractors, etc 
Amends FS. EFFECTIVE DATE 07/01/2000 
03/31/00 HOUSE FMd, Introduced -HJ 00411 
O.I06IOO HOUSE Referred to Communty Maira (PRC) -HJ 00497 
04/18100 HOUSE VW:hdra'IM'I from ConYn.lnly AlfllWI (PRC) -HJ 00557; PIIIC9d on 

calendar, available for General C■lendl.r 
Oli/27/00 HOUSE Placed on Speaal Order Calendar 
CW2:St'OO HOUSE Placed on Specllll Order Calendar; Retained on Calendar 
05/05/00 HOUSE Died on Calendar, ktenJSm.JCompare Blll(s) p■.1Md, refer to 

Bill Text: 

811 Nan. 
H2238 

CS/SB 220 (Ch 2000-372) 

O..Po-
08/28/2000 

Comnuttee Amendments and Filed Floor Amendments:� 

H2239 
AmondmortlD 

111875 
375053 
650508 
n= 

85-4315 
941687 

975-467 

Staff Analysis: [SR!

No Staff Analysis Avalllli. 

Vote History: [gp) 

No Vote HIStory Available 

Cltatlono: liall/, 

STATUTE CITATIONS (IoJ>) 

Coto Post.d 
OS/0312000 
04/28/2000 
OS/0312000 
04/28/2000 
OS/0312000 
04/28/2000 
04/28/2000 

AvalahM- Formats 
•W•bP191 'l>fllf

Available Formats 
.& Wtb Ptg1 • EDE 
.,Wtb Pia. fllE 

• Wtb Pt91 • fllE
a, Wtb Paa ill, fllE

.&,tW1bPIA1.ec.E 
_. Web Pia 4, fllE 

♦' w.i, Pt91 a, eD.E

l:lallom. 

2/2/2001 IO·ll AM 



SCSlloo->Bills: Online Suruhinc httpl/www log state ft.UJIScSlimfmdcx. ... _MOOC"V1ewBilllnfo.tBillnum-llJ6.4.tYeor2000 

I of2 

:· 09tiM 

,Sunshine 

� 4:, ...... i II,, -�,..-.,.,€",+ + + + + ' � " '' ,,� ..,< � + 

Juap To. EU T1U'2l Arnaocktwrpl 12) 

Senate 10U· Relating to Fire Protection systema 

Staff AnabMC2) Vow HlllPOdffi 

S 10M GENERAL BILL.JCS by Regulated lndustriu; Forman; (CO-SPONSORS) Myers 
(Similar CSllillll, Compare 2ND ENG/li11R CS/1ST ENGlll.lZll, CS/1ST 
ENG/S.mll. CS/2ND ENG/u.Q1i) 
Fu ProtedK>n Systoow reqUHS profusional eng11, .. ra to wl ■H 
mlll bid documents, provtdn definlion of tarm ,ayoll' Amends 
471 025, 633.021 EFFECTNE DATE: Upon booom,ng law. 
01121/00SENATE Profiled 
01/26/00 SENATE Referred to Regulalad lndUl&tnes, Corrc>r•hensive Planning. 

1.oa11 end Millary Man 
03/07/00 SENATE lnb'oduotd, referred to Regulated Industries; Comprehenlive 

Plll.rw,11g, Local and M�ttary Affan -sJ 00066 
03/18100 SENATE On ConvritlH --- Regulot.d Ind-. 03/21/00, 3.30 

pm, 412-K 
03/21/00 SENATE Conm. Action CS by Regulated Industries, YEAS S NAYS 0 

-sJ 00305, CS rHd first bml on 031'29/00-sJ 00313 
03/23100 SENATE Now In Co"l)f'ehenslve Plllnnlng, Local ■nd Military Affairs 

-sJ 00305 
03l30IOO SENATE On Commttee agenda- Col'J1)(ehensive Plamlng, Local and 

MYilary Man, 04/04/00, 2 00 pm. 308-C 
CMI04IOO SENATE Comm. Acbon -Favorable vdth 1 amendment(•) by Co11"4)1'ehena,w 

f'lrln"'"II, l.oall and Mlilary Allan, YEAS 8 NAYS 0 
-sJ 00390 

CW05/00 SENA TE Plac.d on Calandor -SJ 00380 
04/1 1100 SENA TE Placed on Spec•I Order Calendar -SJ OCM06 
CM/12/00 SENATE Placed on Specaal Order Calendar -SJ 0().420 
CW18/00 SENATE Pla<»d on Spoetal Order Calendar -sJ 00462 
CW19/00 SENA TE Pla<»d on Spoclal O<dor C.landor -sJ 00462 
CW26l'OO SENATE Placed on Spe(:•I Order Calendar-SJ 00520 
04/2:M)() SENA TE Placed on Speael Order C.6-nd■r -SJ 00581 
05/01/00 SENA TE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 00628 
05/02/00 SENATE Plo<»d on Spoclol Onlor Colander -sJ 00725 
05I03IOO SENATE Placed on Spec■I Order Calendar-SJ 00888 
05/CMIOO SENA TE Placed on Specal Order Calendar -SJ OOQ8.4 
OSI05/00 SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar -SJ 011-45, Died on Calendar, 

lden.lSimJCornpare 8111(•) pessed, ref.,- to CS/SB 220 (Ct, 
2()()().372), CS/SB 1016 (Ch 2000-356) 

BiH Text: 

BIi N■me 
S 1064 
S 1064C1 

Doto Pooled 
08/25/2000 
08/2512000 

Committee Amendments and Flied Floor Amendments:� 

S 1064. 
Amendment ID 

S 1064C1 

Doto Poslad 

Av■iabtll Fom■ts 
:a-¥,/tb PIRI � 
_.Wtbf'lg••� 

Avai■bll Fom.ts 

� 

2/212001 10·54 AM 



ses.s1on->Bdls Onlmc Sunmmc http://www leg state ft.tu/Session/index. .. _MO<IC'"VicwBilllnfo&Billnum-1064kYC&F2000 

2of2 

Dole- Availllbte Fomats 
05/CM/2000 ♦ Web PIA• • EDE
05/04/2000 ♦ Wah PIP■ • .eD.f

<1: Web Pago • EDE n,,.'fc4,(1 /. � 7use,81-J 05/CM/2000 s;~ 

05/04/2000 • ,Wob pago ... EDE s--/"- ' . 
,, ,. ,I 

Amondmort ID 
10548-48 

((l 102510 
:;_ 121400 
32320-4-I 
"/- 27-4088 

312708 
J 31-4600 
b 380TTO 
'7 <492274 
_y 582414 

11 1593388 
C,883984 

05/CM/2000 
0410712000 

• Web Pago .-J EDE
.;Web Pago • ellf __ ro ,,.,, p Pl...

, ...., 4/J-
05/04/2000 • Web Pago .. EDE .vi,+r1, ., (r s/z .. ft---;, O,,;-fq...,J 

Staff Analysis: qgp)

Analys•ID 
S 10&4 
S 10&4 

VoteHlsto� 

No Vote Hestory Avaiable 

Citations· 

STATUTE CITATIONS:CI<>I>) 

001025 

CONSTITUTION CITATIONS 

05/CM/2000 
05/04/2000 
05/CM/2000 
05/06'2000 
05/04/2000 

Sponsor 
Regu■ted lndustnes 
OoiiiiUillt; AffalfllS 
C'.e-,,..,p f>,..._.....,_ 

• W.b Pi,91 • .eD.E
♦ Wob Pago � EDE
♦ Web Pago a EDE
ilf Web Pago * EDE
11 W.bf'ago .jEDE

< ,' ',d 
J, 
, 

/ I 3/lil"l-'f 

AvalllltHe Fomwts 
•llEDE
� EDE

NO CONSTITUTION CITATIONS FOUND FOR REQUESTED BILL 

I' 

JvLl/o,,J s/1 
/''1/"-,4,({ ., I"-

��-.. . , ��. �.:----:Mi�,,· .Q , '��,,.-���''$Ji� , �✓!-�i�Q-) it: ; qt ,,�,. � .... NJ q -�� � 

Disclaimer The information oo this &ystem • unvenlled. The journals or pnnted bills of the reapec:t,ve chambers shouk:I be conautted for otr1C1al 
purp<>&eS Copynght O 2CXXJ State a Rood• CmfN# \II 

,, 

ft- ...,, '' 

2/2/2001 10:54 AM 



=ioo->B,11< Onhne Sm!hnc httpJ/www leg !ltatc.O us/Scssionfmdcx.. _Modc,cV1cwBilllnfo,Uldlnum-I'464&YeaF2000 

I of2 

' ,OflilM • • ~ -� 

:r-,---�J•r•·�"' .,n.,-J.«,:<.:r,"' <.' 
""� :M:«i ;.f":,-�� ,. 

�,
..,

�j�: > >> , ��ty 

Jump To: 811 TUU:2) Arolrdmtrq{O) 

Senate 14"· Relating to Florida Prompt Payment Act 

Staff Anatwls(2) Vnte Hidpry(Ql 

S 1"4 GENERAL BILUCS by Re�ated lndunie■; W- (Compare CSIHJIZ1i, 
2ND � CSJ1STENGJ� 
FlorJia Pmm,X P,,yment A¢ pro\lldn for tirNly paym«tt for 
noncollltructton NMCff, rwvtMI proviliona governing bmtly payrrant 
for purchaMs of construcbon services, reviHs provisions re prooedurM 
for cak=ulltion 04' payment due dates; revises prCM&IOns re bond of 
contractor construcbng pubke buildings, requwes OPPAGA H'l 
consultabon with L.egisl■bve ComnttN on Intergovernmental Re■bons 
to conduct study of construc::bon r•tailage methods, etc Amends FS 
EFFECTIVE DATE 07.101/2000 except as otherv-nse provided 
02116/00 SENATE Profiled 
02/2,4/00 SENATE Referred to Comprehensive Planning, Local and Military 

Man; Regulated Industries, Corm"llrot and Eoonorric 
Opportunitios 

03/07/00 SENATE lntroduc:»d, r.fwr.d to Compfehensive Plllnl'lng, Local and 
MIIDry Aff■n, Regulated lndU5tries, Corrrnerce and Econorric 
OpportuntbH -5J 00086 

03121/00 SENATE On� ■gnda-- Corrprehensrve Plamlng, Local and 
Miltary Affan, 03/28100, 9 00 am, 308-C -Not consider.cl 

03l30IOO SENATE On Corrvntt .. agenda- Co�rehensive Flaming, Local Ind 
M�Ury Mairs, 04/04/00, 2 00 pm. 3C»-C 

04/04/00 SENATE Corrvn. Action Favorab4e \Wt\ 1 arMnctrr.nt(s) by Comprehensive 
Planning, Local and Mitary Man; YEM 6 NAYS 1 
-sJ 00390 

04/0SIOO SENATE Now., Regulat.d Industries -SJ 00380 
CJ.4/13/00 SENATE On Commllfff ogende- Reguloled lnduslnH, CJ.4/111/00, 9:00 

am, -412-K 
CJ.4/111/00 SENATE Conm ktlon. CS by Regullltod lndustnes, YEAS 7 NAYS 0 

-SJ 00486, CS read first tn-. on CM/19r'OO -SJ 00,488 
04/19,00 SENA TE Now 1n eorm.,01 Ind Ec:ononie Opportunll:I .. -SJ CXt-488 
05I05IOO SENATE Died 1n CommtiH on CorrYMrce and Econornc Opportunlbes, 

ldenJSlm./Co"l"'re BiKs) passed, refer ID CS/SB 220 (Ch. 

BIii Text: 

Bil Name 
S1-IM 
S 1-4&4C1 

2000-JnJ 

Doto -d 
0&'25/2000 
08/2512000 

Committee Amendments and Flied Fk>or Amendments: � 

S1-IM 
No Amendments Avalllli. 

S 1-4&4C1 • 
No Amendments Avallable 

Staff Analysis: [Sp\

Avallable Forrrats 
•W•b Pi11t ill .e!l.E
AjlY•b P.111 .-,.e!l.E

l:DllolJll 

2/2/200 I 10 56 AM 



sc:ss100->B1lls. Online StmS111e httpJ/www.leg state fl U.VSess1oofmdex.. _ Mode=V1ewBtlllnfo&B1llnum=1464&Year=2000 

2of2 

Analys•ID 

S 1-

s 1-

VoteHisto� 

No Vote History Available 

Spontor 

Oon111mlt) Mfai,s --,-

Regullltied lndustnN 

Available F0mWits 

♦Ellf

.Ellf 

:;:C::itat::,:lo;::n::•:.= J.WIIII-----------------------------------,-

STATUTE CITATIONS (IgJ>) 

ll2.1llZ. 

0210735 

CONSTITUTION CITATIONS. 

NO CONSTITUTION CITATIONS FOUND FOR REQUESTED BILL. 

���ilijf i)i''�·--�·liill
""

��· �� �-�...li¼V ... 'tA!R :��r ���-✓:\���.✓. 

Dleclalmer The 1nfonnabon on ttu• system• unvenfied The jounw,5 or pmted bills of the respective chamberti should be consulted for o1fical 
pul"P(ll!le5 Copynght O 2000 State rt Flonda O>oo¥;t YI 

2/2/200 I 10 56 AM 



scss1m->Bdls: Online &m:Sl11c http://www.lcg !lalc fl.us/Scssioofmdex. ._ Modc=ViewBtlllnfo&Btllnum-18001; Y eaF2000 

I of2 

�-S=hine 

, � '' ,jl,lc 
, • +,, t .. ,�� �- �"·,/� ! '� ',' ,, +, , +f", 

Jump To: Bill Iu1C2) Aowrxtn:wrtaC2) $tiff Ml,tysls( 11 Vote Hilk!o10) l.Jlllloia

Senate 1800: Relat1n,2 to Construction 

S 1IOO GENERAL BILL/CS by Regulated Industries; Mitchell (Slmdw tl.llll. 
Compare 3RD ENG.ttllll, 2ND ENGlll..11a ll..ll9. CS/CS/1ST E� 
CSIISTEN� CS/2ND ENG/� 
ConstructP<r reviHs requnnwra for elevator inspec:tion1 & Nrvioe 
mai'nenance contracts: r.vlses .,19r,t ,. uanw.bon required for 
certification as building code administrator, plarw examiner, or 
bulldtng cede r,,ipeetor; establlOhes speaal daq,lr,ary proced"'" to, 
enforcerr-.nt officials, �n• offices of Conetrucbon lndu.by 
Licensing Board to b9 in Leon County, elc Amends FS EFFECTIVE DATE: 
07/01/2000 
02128/00 SENATE Pr.tiled 
03/07100 SENATE Introduced, referred to Regulated lndusbies -SJ 00110 
04/10'00 SENATE On Cormwllff •110ndo- Reguialod Ind-..., 04/13/00, 10-00 

am, .t12-K 
04/13/00 SENATE Corm, Action-CS by Ragulotod Industries. YEAS 5 NAYS 0 

-SJ 004&4, cs read firsttme on 04/18100 -SJ ()Oll7,4 
04/17/00 SENATE Placed on Calandor -SJ 00464 
05103l00 SENA TE Placed on Special Order Calendar -sJ 00888 
05/04/00SENATE Placed on Special Order Calendar-SJ 00004 
05/05/00 SENATE Placed on Speaal Order Calendar -8J 01145, Died on Calendar, 

ktenJSim./Compare BHl(s) passed, ,...,_r to HB 219 (Ch 
2000-141), CS/SB 220 (Ch. 2000-Jn), CS/SB 1018 (Ch. 

Bin Text: 

BiN Narnt 
S 1800 
s 1eooc1 

2000-356) 

Dato Postod 
08/25/2-QOO 
08125/2000 

Committee Amendments and Flied Floor Amendments:� 

S 1800 
Amendmort ID 

s 1eooc1 
Amendmort ID 

481140 
� 

Staff Analysis· qpp} 

Aru,lysil ID 
S 1800 

Vote History: [gp\ 

No Vote HlslO,y Available 

Citations: 

Dato Postod 

Dato Postod 
04/26/2000 
05/03/2000 

Sponsor 
Ragulaltd lndustnN 

Availllblit Forrrats 
.W,bPa.91 

*W.bP.91;&.et2E 

Avalabie Formats 

Avaiable Formats 
.; Wtb P,age •• .e.Df (-1"- " 1 ,, � -If

•w.bP.e- -fl->.e.t2E Ft?'r......-, ..,,,J 

Availllble Formats 
I 

4lfllE 1 i"f 

1 /2, 
1 /z7 

2/2/2001 10:53 AM 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 

""AS PASSED BY THE LEGISLATURE"" 
CHAPTER I: 00-372, Laws of Florida 

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
COMMITTEE ON 

BUSINESS REGULATION & CONSUMER AFFAIRS 
FINAL ANALYSIS 

BILL#. CS/SB 220 

RELATING TO: Regulation of Nonmedical Professions 

SPONSOR(S): Senate Regulated Industries 

TIED BILL(S): None 

ORIGINATING COMMITTEE(S)/COMMITTEE(S) OF REFERENCE: 
(1) REGULATED INDUSTRIES YEAS 7 NAYS 0 
(2) 
(3) 

I. SUMMARY:

CS/SB 220 combines a number of bills, or portions of bills, related to nonmedical professions of
which most deal with construction, electrical or alarm system contracting. The act:

1) Reenacts and saves from automatic repeal the Florida Engineers Management Corporation
(FEMC). (HB 2115)

2) Establishes special procedures for discipline of building code enforcement officials
(Building Code Enforcement Official's Bill of Rights), when investigated by the Department
of Business and Professional Regulation (DBPR). It increases the licensure validity period
for provisional licensees; and allows counties with a population of 75,000 or less greater
leeway regarding licensure qualification requirements. (HB 2239 and HB 1109))

3) Requires the Office of Program Policy Analysis and Government Accountability (OPPAGA)
to study the various aspects of local governments' temporarily holding a percentage of
money from their progress payments to various contractors, subcontractors, and material
suppliers (retainage). (HB 715)

4) Clarifies the roles and responsibilities of professional engineers and fire protection
contractors in the design and installation of fire sprinkler systems. It also requires that the
final bid documents the engineer provides to the owner must be sealed, making the
engineer accountable for them. (CS/HB 993)

5) Clarifies that locally licensed, registered electrical contractors that qualify to be
grandfathered into state certification must receive an unlimited electrical certification
certificate, and makes the grandfathering available through November 1, 2004. The act
clarifies that a contract with an unlicensed contractor is unenforceable. It provides that the
Electrical Contractors Licensing Board may not adopt a rule over the proposed objections
of the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee, unless the DBPR approves the
proposed rule The act provides that an authorized representative of a company that
makes personal emergency response systems can provide these modular systems to
clients without having to be a licensed alarm contractor. (HB 2239)

The act has no significant fiscal effect upon state or local government. 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE2 

II. SUBSTANTIVE ANALYSIS:

A. DOES THE BILL SUPPORT THE FOLLOWING PRINCIPLES:

1. Less Government Yes [x] No □ N/A □ 

2. Lower Taxes Yes □ No □ N/A [x) 

3. Individual Freedom Yes □ No □ NIA [x] 

4. Personal Responsibility Yes □ No □ N/A [x] 

5. Familll Empowerment Yes □ No □ N/A [x] 

For any principle that received a "no" above, please explain: 

B. PRESENT SITUATION:

See section-by-sec!Jon portion of this analysis.

C. EFFECT OF PROPOSED CHANGES:

See section-by-section portion of this analysis.

D. SECTION-BY-SECTION ANALYSIS:

The Florida Engineers Management Corporation (HB 2115) 

Section 1. Reenacts, modifies, and saves from automatic repeal the Florida Engineers 
Management Corporation (FEMC) 

Section 2. Repeals the section of the FEMC enacting legislation (section 5 of ch. 97-312, 
L.O.F.) which had set FEMC for automatic repeal on October 1, 2000.

Section 3. Amends s. 471.005, F S., makmg technical changes and adding a definition for 
"board of directors," management corporation," and "Secretary." 

Sections 4-10. Amend ss. 471.0035, 471.011, 471.015, 471.017, 471.021, 471.023, 
471.033, F.S., making technical changes. 

Present Situation 

The Florida Engineers Management Corporation (FEMC) is a private corporation statutorily 
established to provide administrative support to the Florida Board of Professional 
Engineers (BPE). Prior to the creation of FEMC in 1997, such administrative support had 
been provided by the Department of Business and Professional Regulation (DBPR). 

FEMC serves approximately 27,000 licensed engineers with 13 full-time staff. DBPR 
contracts with FEMC for the regulatory services and employs a full-time contract manager 
to provide active supervision and to determine compliance with contract requirements. 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE3 

DBPR retains responsibility for emergency orders and prosecuting unlicensed practice 
cases. 

FEM C's by-laws provide that the its CEO shall also serve as the executive director of the 
BPE. These by-laws were adopted as part of the original contract executed between FEMC 
and the previous DBPR administration in 1998. The issue of who should control the 
appointment of the BPE executive director became a point of contention between FEMC 
and the present DBPR administration during the 2000 session, with DBPR insisting that 
appointment of any board's executive director should be under the control of DBPR. 
DBPR's contention was supported by s. 455.203(2), F.S., which provides that the DBPR 
shall, "appoint the executive director of each board, subject to the approval of BPE."' 

On March 29, 2000, an agreement between BPE, FEMC, and DBPR stipulated that the 
DBPR contract administrator would serve as the BPE executive director. However, at this 
point (May 23, 2000), the CEO of FEMC remains the executive director of the BPE. 

As provided in its enacting legislation, the section establishing FEMC (s. 471.038, F.S.) will 
automatically repeal on October 1, 2000, unless reenacted. If the section is repealed, 
FEMC will cease to exist and its administrative responsibilities, along with any remaining 
funds, will revert to DBPR. 

FEMC is, to date, the only instance of a private corporation being created to provide staff 
support for the regulation of any profession under DBPR. However, other professions have 
expressed an interest in following the lead of FEMC, and additional privatization efforts are 
expected. 

The enacting legislation for s. 471.038, F.S., stated that the Legislature had determined 
"that the privatization of certain functions that are performed by the department for the 
board will encourage greater operational and economic efficiency and, therefore, will 
benefit regulated persons and the public." 

A performance review of FEMC conducted by the Office of Program Policy Analysis and 
Government Accountability, and issued in March of this year, concluded that performance 
had improved under FEMC, with FEMC handling more cases, and disposing of a higher 
percentage of them in a more timely fashion than had DBPR. On the other hand, the 
review found that the administrative costs for regulating the engineers' profession had 
increased 16% (or $247,467) above the regulatory costs from the previous renewal year 
under DBPR 

Effect of Changes 

The act abrogates the scheduled repeal of FEMC, preserving the current method of 
providing administrative, investigative, and prosecutorial services to the Board of 
Professional Engineers. 

The act subjects FEMC's board of directors and staff to the travel and per diem provisions 
of s. 112.061, F.S. It also provides that FEMC may make only prudent expenditures directly 
related to the responsibilities of the BPE and in accordance with the contract. 

1 It is not clear that the department has ever actually sought explicit approval from any board for any executive 
director. The current adm1nislrat1on's pos�ion IS that unless a board explicitly disapproves of an executive director at the time 
he or she IS presented to the board, the DBPR assumes the board approves the appointment 



STORAGE NAME. s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE4 

The act establishes and phases in staggered terms of service for the FEMC's Board of 
Directors. All initial appointments expire on October 31, 2000, and current members may be 
appointed only to one additional term. Two members are to be appointed for two years, 
three members are to be appointed for three years, and two members are to be appointed 
for four years. One of the laypersons must be appointed to a 3-year term and the other 
layperson must be appointed to a 4-year term. Thereafter, all appointments are for 4-year 
terms. 

The act requires FEMC to pay DBPR for specified costs associated with regulatory services 
DBPR provides. Specifically, FEMC must pay all cost of representation by Board counsel, 
all costs associated with the contract administrator, and all costs associated with the 
Division of Administrative Hearings. 

FEMC is required to develop, in conjunction with DBPR, performance standards and 
measurable outcomes, which BPE must adopt by rule. 

The act also provides that all meetings of FEMC's board of directors are public meetings 
subject to the public meetings law. Although section 471.038, F.S., expressly provides that 
FEMC's records are public records and are subject to the public records law, there is no 
such express provision presently for public board meetings Despite this omission, FEMC's 
legal counsel has expressed the opinion that meetings of the board of directors are subject 
to public meetings law, and the current practice is to give notice of the meetings and to 
make them open to the public. 

FEMC is made the sole repository for all records of BPE, including all historical information 
and records. FEMC must maintain these records in accordance with the guidelines of the 
Department of State 

BPE is to provide by rule the security procedures that FEMC must follow to ensure the 
security of licensure examinations. 

The act deletes obsolete language requiring the performance audit of FEMC for the period 
of January 1, 1998, through January 1, 2000, by the Office of Program Policy Analysis and 
Governmental Accountability. The act provides for an annual audit of records by a certified 
public accountant, which is subject to review by the Department and the Auditor General. 

No provision in the act explicitly deals with the issue of who appoints the executive director 
of BPE. However, during the legislative session, an agreement was reached that returned 
that authority to DBPR 

Retainage (HB 715, House Community Affairs Amendment) 

Section 11. Requires the Office of Program Policy Analysis and Government 
Accountability (OPPAGA) to conduct a study on retainage. 

Present Situation 

The 1992 study, Alternatives to 10% Retainage, stated that the practice of retamage is 
unique to the construction industry. Retainage consists of the owner holding back a 
stipulated percentage of each progress payment, with this retainage to be paid upon 
completion of the contractor's work or upon completion of the entire project. As stated in 
the study, this retainage (typically 10%) is considered a financial guarantee that the 
contractor will: 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGES 

• complete the work;
• correct defects; and
• be capable of financing the project.

Contractors and subcontractors see retainage as having such disadvantages as: 

• Increasing the cost of construction (the contractor often must borrow money to stay
afloat, waiting for retainage payments);

• Affecting cash flows adversely;
• Increasing project duration and reducing productivity;
• Affecting workmanship and quality adversely; and
• Forcing contractors/subcontractors to front-load progress payment requests.

According to the finding of the 1992 report, owners, both public and private, tend to believe 
that they cannot get all the necessary work items completed without holding retainage. The 
report also found that it appears that subcontractors and suppliers/vendors are more 
adversely affected by retainage than the contractors. If the owner holds 10% retainage, the 
contractor typically also holds 10% retainage from each of his or her subcontractors. This 
means that even the first subcontractor on the project, who has completed all of his or her 
work to the owner and contractor's satisfaction, will wait until the project is fully complete to 
receive the balance of the monies owned under his or her contract. On larger projects, this 
time period can take several years. The average profit margin in the construction industry 
is currently estimated to be substantially less than 10%, often running as low as 5-6%. 
Therefore, unless and until retainage is released, the subcontractor has no profit in the job, 
and may, in fact, be financing the job until completion. In addition, contractors and 
subcontractors must pay in full for materials purchased. 

The Florida Department of Management Services (DMS) is the state agency that has the 
primary responsibility for construction and maintenance of state buildings The OMS 
indicated that it has a policy of charging 10% retainage on the first half of the project, and 
5% on the remaining portion. 

The 1992 report found that most public agencies, including the federal Government 
Services Administration (GSA), had revised their traditional 10% retainage policy. The 
prior standard of 10% throughout had been reduced. Many public jobs require only 5%. 
The Department of Defense and GSA have adopted the policy that retainage should be 
withheld only for specific reasons, such as failure to maintain schedules. 

The report noted that almost all public construction is bonded. They further noted that the 
private construction industry could also adopt some of the revisions being practiced in the 
public construction sector if bonding became accessible to most of the contractors or if a 
majority of the contractors could qualify for bonding. 

Effect of Changes 

Requires OPPAGA, in consultation with the Leg1slat1ve Committee on Intergovernmental 
Relations, to conduct a study of local jurisdictions' construction retainage methods. The 
section specifies areas to be examined, requires study conclusions and recommendations, 
and requires a report to the Legislature and the Governor by January 1, 2001. 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE& 

Building Code Administrators and Inspectors (HB 1109) 

Section 12. Amends subsections (2) and (6) of s. 468.603, F.S., to replace references to 
"inspector" with "building code inspector" in the definitions of "building code inspector" and 
"categories of building inspectors." A new subsection (8) Is added to define "Building 
Code Enforcement Official." 

Section 13. Amends section 468.604, F.S., relating to responsibilities of building code 
administrators, plans examiners, and inspectors, to replace references to "inspector" with 
"building code inspector." 

Section 14. Amends paragraph (c) of subsection (2) of s. 468.605, F.S., relating to 
membership of the Florida Building Code Administrators and Inspectors Board, to replace 
references to "inspector" with "building code inspector." 

Section 15. Amends section 468.607, F.S., relating to certification of building code 
administration and inspection personnel, to replace references to "inspector" with "building 
code inspector." 

Section 17. Section 468.617, F.S., relating to joint inspection departments, is amended to 
replace references to "inspector" and "inspection· with "building code inspector" or "building 
code inspection " 

Pre_sent _Situation 

Part XII of chapter 468, F.S., provides for the regulation of building code administrators and 
inspectors by the Board of Building Code Administrators and Inspectors (Board) within the 
Department of Business and Professional Regulation (DBPR). The statute provides for 
various types and levels of mandatory certification of building code administrators and 
inspection personnel. The program is funded by license fees and one-half of 1 % surcharge 
on every building permit (local governments retain up to 10% of the surcharge, then the 
DBPR-projected funding needs of the board are subtracted, and the remainder goes to the 
Construction Industries Recovery Fund, established under part I of ch. 489, F.S.). 

A building code administrator supervises enforcement of building code regulation, induding 
plans review, enforcement, and inspection. A building code inspector inspects construction 
that requires permits to determine compliance with building codes and state accessibility 
laws. A plans examiner reviews plans submitted for building permits to determine 
compliance with construction codes. 

There are several categories of inspector and plans examiners certificates, relating to the 
scope of the activities the licensee may perform (e.g., building inspector, commercial or 
residential electrical inspector, mechanical inspector, building plans examiner, plumbing 
plans examiner, etc.). Part XII sets forth the requirements for licensure for the various 
types and categories of certificate holders, induding credentials from specified private 
organizations or specified experience (or a combination of education and experience) and 
an examination. 

Section 468.607, F.S., provides that no person may be employed by a state agency or local 
government to perform the duties of building code administrator, plans examiner, or 
inspector after October 1, 1993, without possessing a proper valid certificate issued in 
accordance with the provisions of part XII of chapter 468, F.S. 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE7 

Section 468.603(2), F.S., provides a definitJon of "building code inspector" or "inspector." 
The terms "inspector; "building inspector," and "building inspection" are used throughout 
part XII of chapter 468, F.S., as well as in other chapters of the Florida Statutes. 

Effect of Changes 

These provisions clarify that any person who does building code inspections is not merely a 
"code inspector," but is rather a person inspecting building code construction for 
compliance with the building code. 

Section 16. Amends section 468.609, F.S., relating to standards for certification. 

Present Situation 

Subsection (4) of s. 468.609, F.S., provides that no person may engage in the duties of a 
building code administrator, plans examiner, or inspector after October 1, 1993, unless 
such person possesses one of the following types of valid certificates issued by the board 
attesting to the person's qualifications to hold such position: 

• A standard certificate;

• A limited certificate (allows an individual to continue to wor1< only in the position held on
July 1, 1993);

• A provisional certificate (allows an individual to wor1< for 1 to 3 years pending
qualification for a standard certificate).

Effect of Changes 

Subsection (5) is amended to revise language providing legislative intent that examinations 
used for certification under this part be substantially equivalent to examinations 
administered by the Southern Building Code Congress International, the Building Officials 
Association of Florida, the South Florida Building Code, and the Council of American 
Building Officials. References to the Building Officials Association of Florida and the South 
Florida Building Code are deleted. 

Subsection (7) is amended to expand the period the board may provide for the issuance of 
provisional certificates from a minimum of 1 year and a maximum of 3 years to a minimum 
of 3 years and a maximum of 5 years. Eligibility requirements for provisional certificates 
are added to limit provisional certificates to newly employed or promoted building code 
inspectors or plans examiners who meet eligibility requirements specified in subsection (2) 
and newly employed or promoted building code administrators who meet eligibility 
requirements specified in subsection (3). 

Subsection (8) Is deleted to remove obsolete provisions and remove language providing 
that any individual who holds a valid certificate issued by the Southern Building Code 
Congresses International, the Building Officials Association of Florida, the South Florida 
Building Code, or the Council of American Building Officials certification program, or who 
has been approved for certification under such programs not later than October 1, 1995, 
shall be deemed to satisfy requirements for certification. Finally, a building code 
administrator who holds a limited or provisional license in a county with a population of less 
than 75,000 people is authorized to provide supervision. 



STORAGE NAME. s0220s1z.brc 
DA TE. July 1, 2000 
PAGES 

Building Code Enforcement Officials Bill of Rights (HB 1109) 

Section 18. Creates section 468.619, F.S., creating the Building Code Enforcement 
Officials Bill of Rights. 

Present Situation 

Building officials have alleged that in several instances, the Department of Business and 
Professional Regulation (department) and the Board of Building Code Administrators and 
Inspectors have taken an inordinate amount of lime to reach conclusions to drop cases. In 
al least one instance, they prevented a licensee from renewing his license, because their 
investigation was still ongoing. This caused him to lose his job. In general, some of the 
building officials are convinced that the department abuses its prosecutorial authority and 
that the board does not listen to reason. Therefore, they believe, additional due process 
protections are needed. 

Currently, the department's complaint and disciplinary processes are as follows: 

The department Is required to investigate all legally sufficient complaints ii receives, 
pursuant to the provisions of section 455 225, F.S. The detenninalion of legal sufficiency is 
made upon initial receipt of a complaint received from the public or other source. A 
complaint is legally sufficient when the allegation, if true, amounts to a licensure violation. 

Once the complaint is received, it must be forwarded to the proper office. Most complaints 
against regulated professionals are received at a central location, processed, and 
distributed to the appropriate board office. Legal sufficiency is determined, if possible, from 
the description of the alleged violation. Sometimes, additional information, such as copies 
of documents, may be required. In some cases this can be done quickly, but in others ii 
can take a much longer period of lime and require the cooperation of sources outside the 
control of the department 

If legal sufficiency is determined, the case Is sent to the investigative office in the area 
where the alleged violation occurred. This can lake several days to get the complaint to 
the proper office and assigned to an investigator. The investigator must rely on the 
cooperation of others to conduct the investigation. Sometimes subpoenas must be issued 
lo get information. As an investigation progresses, new leads and sources of information 
are revealed which must be pursued. Sometimes, especially in a technical area such as 
building code matters, experts must be retained to perform expert analysis. 

Once an investigation of a legally suffioent complaint is completed, it is forwarded to the 
Office of General Counsel for review and presentation to the probable cause panel of the 
board. The panel, which consists of at least two board members, determines whether there 
is probable cause to support prosecution of the matter. The complaint, the investigation, 
and the panel's deliberations are confidential until ten days after probable cause is found 
by the panel. If probable cause is not found, the case remains confidential and may be 
closed or sent back for further investigation. 

When probable cause is found, the department files an administrative complaint and 
pursues prosecution of the matter. Each prosecuted case eventually ends up before the 
board. The board is the agency head for purposes of taking final agency action in each 
case. 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1 z.brc 
DA TE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE9 

Appeals of the board's decision may be taken to the District Courts of Appeal pursuant to 
section 120.68, F.S. The rights of licensees are protected during the disciplinary process 
by chapter 120, F.S., and the uniform rules adopted by the Administration Commission 
pursuant thereto, s 455.225, F.S., and the Florida and United States Constitutions. 

Effect of Changes 

This section of the act establishes the building code enforcement officials' bill of rights, 
providing several due process protections not explicitly provided elsewhere. Most of these 
rights relate to assuring speedy disposition of a disciplinary investigation conducted by 
DBPR. 

The section stipulates that local government enforcement officials (building officials, 
inspectors, and plans examiners) are different from other professionals licensed under the 
department, and that their different circumstances merit additional specific disciplinary 
protections. The section is modeled after provisions in the "Law Enforcement and 
Correctional Officers Bill of Rights," in chapter 112, F.S. 

Significant provisions in this section include: 

1) Requiring the DBPR to inform the licensee of any complaints, including the substance
of the allegation, within 10 days;

2) Requiring the DBPR to send their case to probable cause within six months, at which
time the probable cause panel may give the department up to 90 days to complete their
investigation;

3) Requiring the local government to provide the legal defense for the building code
enforcement official for actions he or she took within the scope of his or her
employment.

4) Allowing the enforcement official to sue for abridgment of his or her civil rights arising
out of the official's performance of his or her duties; and

5) Providing that if a court finds that DBPR prosecution was "without merit," or if a
Judgement against DBPR is awarded to the enforcement official, the DBPR shall be
liable for the enforcement official's legal costs and attorney's fees.

Building Code Administrators and Inspectors (HB 1109) 

The changes in sections 19 through 30 are technical changes, relating to terminology. 

Section 19. Amends subsection (3) of s. 468.621, F.S., relating to disciplinary 
proceedings, to replace a reference to "inspector" with "building code Inspector." 

Section 20. Amends subsection (2), (3), and (4) of s. 468.627, F.S., relating to application, 
examination, and fees, to replace references to "inspector" and "inspection· with "building 
code inspector" or "building code inspection· and clarify "regulation· refers to "construction 
regulation." 

Section 21. Amends section 468.631, F.S., relating to the Building Code Administrators 
and Inspectors Fund, to replace references to "inspector" and "inspection· with "building 
code inspector" or "building code inspection." 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE10 

Section 22. Amends subsection (1) of s. 468.633, F.S., relating to authority of local 
government, to replace a reference to building "inspector" with "building code inspector." 

Section 23. Amends paragraph {a) of subsection (1) of s. 112.3145, F.S., relating to 
disclosure of financial interests and clients represented before agencies, to replace a 
reference to "building inspector" with "building code inspector." 

Section 24. Amends subsection (3) of s. 125.56, F.S., relating to the adoption of 
amendments of building codes, to replace a reference to "building inspector" with "building 
code inspector." 

Section 25. Amends paragraph (g) of subsection (5) of s. 212.08, F.S., relating to sales 
tax exemption for building materials used in an enterpnse zone, to replace a reference to 
"building inspector" with "building code inspector." 

Section 26. Amends paragraph (a) of subsection (2) of s. 252.924, F.S., relating to party 
state responsibilities, to replace a reference to "building inspection• with "building code 
inspection.• 

Section 27. Amends paragraph (j) of subsection (3) of s. 404.056, F S , relating to 
environmental radiation standards and programs, to replace a reference to "building 
inspections· with "building code inspections • 

Section 28. Amends section 471.045, F.S., relating to professional engineers performing 
building code inspector duties, to replace a reference to "building inspection• with "building 
code inspection." 

Section 29. Amends section 481.222, F.S., relating to architects performing building code 
inspector duties, to replace a reference to "building inspection· with "building code 
inspection.• 

Section 30. Amends paragraph (b) of subsection (18) of s. 489.103, F.S., relating to 
exemptions from regulation of construction contracting, to replace a reference to "building 
inspections• with "building code inspections • 

Construction Contract Indemnification Agreements 

Section 31. Amends s 725.06, F.S., to clarify indemnification provisions in construction 
contracts. 

Present Situation 

Currently, construction contracts may contain indemnification clauses. In an 
indemnification clause, one party may agree to protect a second party against loss or 
damage specified in the contract and may agree to cover negligence by the second party. 
In other words, one party may agree to pay the costs of another party's negligence. 
Section 725.06, F.S., limits indemnity agreements in construction contracts. Pursuant to 
the statute, all indemnification agreements between parties to a construction contract are 
void and unenforceable unless: 

1) A monetary limit is placed on the extent of the indemnity and is included in the
project specifications or bid document, if any; or



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE11 

2) Specific consideration is included in the contract in exchange for the indemnity
provision

This provision applies to any person contracting for construction with architects, engineers, 
general contractors, subcontractors, sub-subcontractors, and material men. If the indemnity 
agreement meets the requirements of section 725.06, F.S., parties are free to establish 
mutually acceptable terms. 

Effect�of Changes 

The section provides that a construction contract may not require a party to a contract to 
assume responsibility for something they did not cause through their own negligence, 
recklessness, or intentional wrongful misconduct. 

Professional Engineers/Design Plans 
at a Bid Meeting (HB 993) 

Section 32. Amends s 471.025, F.S., relating to engineers responsibility to seal their work 
product. 

Present Situation 

Engineers are licensed and regulated by the Board of Professional Engineers, under the 
Department of Business and Professional Regulation, pursuant to ch. 471, F.S. Engineers 
perform consultation, planning, and design of engineering systems. Chapter 471, F. S., 
provides for testing, licensure, and discipline of engineers. 

Engineers are required to seal (physically emboss) plans that they submit "for public 
record." Sealing a plan makes the professional responsible for the plan in the sense that 
they can be disciplined if the plan is done poorly. Plans for "public record" basically refers 
to plans submitted to a building department for purposes of pulling permits. Such plans are 
kept "on file," and can be viewed/researched by the public. 

However, prior to submitting plans to the building department, engineers also typically 
submit their plans at what is called a "bid meeting.• A bid meeting is a meeting between the 
engineer, the owner, and the contractor who will be building the system in question. The 
purpose of the bid meeting is for the owner to obtain bids from the contractor regarding 
what he or she would charge for building the system described in the plans. 

Fire protection contractors allege, and presented evidence supporting their allegation, that 
at many such meetings regarding the impending construction of a fire sprinkler system, 
they are presented with an engineer's fire protection system plans that are incompetently 
done. However, since these plans are not "for public record," the engineer is not required 
to seal these plans and, therefore, cannot be held accountable for them under the current 
law. 

Effect of Changes 

The section requires professional engineers to seal their final bid documents before 
providing them to an owner. The effect of this is that engineers will be responsible for the 
accuracy and competency of documents they present at bid meetings. 

Pool/spa Contractors (HB 2239) 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE12 

Section 33. Amends s. 489.105, F.S., relating to pool and spa contractors' job scope. 

Present Situation 

The job scope of each type of construction contractor is set forth in their respective 
definitions in s. 489.105, F.S. The activities listed in the definition become activities that 
only a person holding that license can lawfully perform. The existing job scope of a 
commercial pool contractor lists, among other things, uniting and fiber glassing. Interior 
pool finishing work that is not uniting or fiber glassing does not currently require a license. 
The Construction Industry Licensing Board (CILB) has recommended that a more general 
term, "interior finishes," replace the detailed listing, in order to capture new and evolving 
technologies using new materials. 

Effect of Changes 

The section provides a more broad and inclusive term, "interior finishes," to describe 
certain pool work in the commercial pool/spa job scope, to replace the more narrow and 
specific terms currently used. This provision would require persons doing any kind of pool 
finishing work, using any technology or material, to be licensed as a commercial pool/spa 
contractor. It also clarifies and streamlines the existing definition of the various types of 
pool contractors. 

Grandfathering Registered Construction Contractors 
into State Certification (HB 2239) 

Section 34 and 39. Amend s. 489.118, F S., relating to construction contractors, and s 
489.514, F.S., relating to electrical and alarm systems contractors, to clarify and add to the 
grandfathering language passed in 1999. 

Present Situation 

Legislation adopted in 1999 provided that applying registered contractors may be granted a 
certification, under certain circumstances. Registered contractors are locally licensed 
contractors, who then must register with the state. Registered contractors may practice 
only in the jurisdiction(s) which issue(s) the local license. Contractors who hold a 
certification may practice statewide 

The process, in which a special hcensure path Is opened and made available for a limited 
time period, is know as "grandfathering.' In order to be grandfathered, the applicant must: 
(1) Have at least five years experience as a registered contractor; (2) Have passed an
acceptable examination; and (3) Have had no serious discipline imposed on him or her.

The Electrical Contractors Licensing Board (ECLB), subsequent to that 1999 legislation, 
attempted to create additional licensure categories in rule, and then use these categories 
as the categories into which the grandfathered applicants would be moved These 
categories would have different names and different, more limited, job scopes than the 
existing categories, and is contrary to the purpose of the 1999 law. 

The Joint Administrative Procedures Committee staff proposed objections to each of the 
versions of the ECLB's proposed rules Eventually, the ECLB ceased its attempts to create 
the additional categories in rule, and declared that qualified registered applicants would be 
grandfathered into statutory categories (see discussion in section 38). 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE13 

Effect of Changes 

Section 489.118, F.S., is in part I of chapter 489, F.S., which applies to all contractors 
except electrical and alarm system contractors. Section 489.514, F.S., is in part II of 
chapter 489, F.S., which applies to electrical and alarm system contractors. Changes in 
each of these two sections designate three additional testing companies as providing 
exams acceptable under the grandfathering process, and provide that the board shall 
accept the stipulated examinations as fulfilling qualificalion requirements, without spending 
their time investigating the format or detailed content of the examination. The sections also 
provide that persons must make application by November 1, 2004, in order to avail 
themselves of the grandfathering opportunity. 

Finally, section 39 of the act amends s. 489.514, F.S. (applying to the ECLB), to make 
explicit that the ECLB must grandfather approved applicants into an existing statutory 
category. 

Contracts with Unlicensed Contractors (HB 2239) 

Section 35 and 43. Amend ss. 489.128, and 489 532, F S, relating to provisions making 
contracts with unlicensed contractors unenforceable. 

Present Situation 

Sections 489.128 (applying to construction contractors) and 489.532, F.S. (applying to 
electrical and alarm system contractors), provide that contracts with unlicensed contractors 
are unenforceable. However, each section also provides that the section does not apply if 
the contractor "obtains or reinstates• his or her license. The overall effect is to make the 
section unenforceable, since there is always the potential that some day in the future the 
contractor will obtain a license, or reinstate his or her license. 

Effect of Changes 

The section closes the perceived loophole in the two provisions that make contracts with 
unlicensed contractors unenforceable. No longer will the possibility that the unlicensed 
contractor may at some later date obtain or reinstate his or her license exist as an 
exception to the provision, effectively disabling it. (See section V C., Other Comments. p. 
19) 

Electrical and Alarm System Contractor Licensure 
Exemptions (HB 2239) 

Section 36. Amends s. 489.503, F.S., darifying two exemptions from electrical or alarm 
system contractor licensure requirements. 

Section 37. Amends s. 489.505, F.S., to clarify that a system designed to detect a fire or 
burglary, even if it is plugged in or wireless, rather than hard-wired, cannot be considered a 
PERS system. 

Present Situation 

There is presently an exemption from electrical contractor licensure requirements for any 
person licensed under chapter 527, F.S., which relates to liquefied petroleum gas dealers, 
dispensers, and installers. 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE14 

Another exemption provides that an employee of a company that produces a personal 
emergency response system (PERS) may distribute such a system without having to be 
licensed as an alarm system contractor. PERS is a modular system that plugs into a phone 
jack and automatically dials an emergency ("panic") number when signaled by the system 
owner. A PERS system signals, rather than detects, and is not specifically intended for 
burglary or fires. 

Effec;t of ChangeJ; 

The section darifies the licensure exemption related to the sale of liquefied petroleum gas, 
providing that it applies only when the person licensed under ch. 527, F.S., is performing 
work regulated by that license. 

The section also allows persons who are authorized dealers or distributors for the producer 
of a personal emergency response system to be exempted from having to be an alarm 
contractor in order to provide these modular systems. 

Joint Administrative Procedures Committee (JAPC) 
Approval of Board Rules (HB 2239)

Section 38. Amends s. 489.507, F.S., limiting board authority to enact a rule over the 
objections of the Joint Administrative Procedures Committee. 

Present Situation 

JAPC reviews all rules proposed by each executive branch agency. JAPC staff determines 
whether, in their view, the rule lacks proper statutory authority, or is otherwise 
objectionable. If the staff makes such a detennination, it communicates by letter with the 
agency proposing the rule, asking the agency to cite the proposed rule's specific statutory 
authority, or otherwise dear up their concerns. These communications are considered a 
"proposed objection· (an actual obJection may only be made by a JAPC committee vote). 

Currently, when JAPC staff proposes an objection to a board's proposed rule, the board 
may: 

1) Ignore the proposed objection and neglect to respond (in which case the rule is
automatically considered withdrawn), or

2) Modify the rule to satisfy the concerns expressed in the proposed objections; or 

3) Refuse to modify the rule, and proceed to file such rule with the Department of
State.

If the board refuses to modify the rule, the proposed objection goes before the JAPC 
committee, and the JAPC committee may then formally vote an objection. The executive 
director of JAPC then certifies the objection to the agency head. A note of this objection is 
then made in the Florida Administrative Code, attached to the rule itself. However, a JAPC 
objection does not impede the adoption of a rule. Once filed with the Secretary of State, 
the rule takes effect in 20 days. 

JAPC may choose to report to the Speaker of the House and the President of the Senate 
the refusal to modify the rule to satisfy the objection, and a bill may be filed to repeal the 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE15 

rule. However, to date, no board has refused to modify, and JAPC has never voted a 
formal objection. 

During the last year, the Electrical Contractors Licensing Board (ECLB) has contended with 
the JAPC staff over a rule relating to grandfathering registered electrical contractors into 
state certification (see the "Present Situation• section of this analysis immediately 
preceding the discussion of sections 34 and 39). In April, at its regularly scheduled 
meetmg, the ECLB apparently determined that it was going to refuse to modify its rule to 
satisfy the concerns expressed in the proposed objections. 

Subsequent to that meeting (and in apparent reaction to an amendment filed on the floor of 
the House which would have repealed the existence of the ECLB if the rule had been 
adopted), the ECLB called an emergency meeting and reversed its course, abandoning its 
attempt to promulgate the rule In question. 

Effect of Cha.!lQ.es 

The section provides that the ECLB may not file a rule with the Secretary of State if the 
board has failed to remove any proposed objections of JAPC regarding that rule, unless the 
ECLB has obtained approval of the rule from the DBPR. The section further provides that 
the DBPR may repeal any rule which the ECLB has previously filed with the Secretary of 
State without removing any JAPC proposed objections relating to that rule. 

Grandfathering Registered Electrical and Alarm System Contractors 
into State Certification (HB 2239) 

Section 39. Amends s 489.514, F.S., to cianfy provisions which require the ECLB to 
grandfather registered electrical and alarm system contractors into state certification. (See 
section 34 of this analysis for discussion) 

Training of Alarm System Monitoring Personnel (HB 2239) 

Section 40. Amends s. 489.5185, F.S , relating to training of alarm monitoring personnel. 

Present Situation 

Section 489.518, F.S., requires licensed electrical or alarm system contractors to obtain 
training, for persons in their employ who do installing, repairing, selling, servicing on-site, 
or monitoring of burglar alarm systems. These persons are termed "burglar alarm system 
agents." Similar provisions are in s. 489.5185, F.S., for fire alarm system agents. Each law 
has a number of exceptions to these requirements. 

These laws were established primarily in the hope that training all alarm system agents 
would produce more capable work crews, and reduce the incidence of false alarms. 
"Monitoring• basically consists of answering a phone and forwarding the information in a 
responsible and competent fashion, so requinng technical training for monitoring 
personnel, to prevent false alarms, is not a practical solution. 

Section 489.518, F.S., exempts burglar alarm system agents who only do monitoring from 
the training requirements However, this same exemption from training requirements does 
not currently exist in s. 489.5185, F.S., regarding fire alarm system agents who only do 
monitoring. 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE 16 

Effect of Changes 

The section exempts fire alarm system agents, who only do monitoring, from training 
requirements. 

Electrical and Alarm System Contracting (HB 2239) 

Section 41. Amends s 489.522, F.S., requiring a licensee to put his or her license on 
inactive status within a certain time period if he or she is not designated as a qualifier for 
any company. 

Present Situation 

Every electrical construction business in Florida must designate a licensed person who is in 
charge of, and responsible for, that business's electrical contracting activities. The 
licensee who is designated is said to "qualify' that business. Presently, when a licensee 
ceases to be a qualifier for an electrical business in Florida, that business has 60 days to 
obtain another qualifier. There is, however, no time frame within which the licensee must 
affiliate himself or herself with another business or otherwise advise the board of his or her 
status. 

Under the scenario discussed above, the licensee who had qualified that business still 
holds his or her individual license, but the regulatory board has no idea whether that 
licensee has ceased operating, or whether he or she is continuing to operate ( either 
wor1<.ing for himself or herself, or qualifying another business). 

All licensees with an active license are required to hold, or be under their company's, 
wor1<.ers compensation insurance. That insurance does not transfer from one company to 
another. Therefore, when a licensee leaves a construction company he or she is required 
to obtain wor1<.ers compensation insurance either under another company, or for himself or 
herself. 

Effect of Changes 

This section provides that if a licensee no longer qualifies a business, he or she must either 
report that he or she is qualifying another business within 60 days, report that he or she is 
wor1<.ing for (qualifying) himself or herself, or place his or her license in an inactive status. 
The purpose of this provision is to enable the Electrical Contractors Licensing Board to 
better track the licensee, and check whether the licensee has (re)obtained wor1<.ers 
compensation insurance. 

Section 42. Amends s. 489.531, F.S., creating criminal penalties for unlicensed electrical 
or alarm system contracting. 

Present Situation 

There are presently no criminal penalties for unlicensed electrical or alarm system 
contracting found in part II of chapter 489, F.S. Criminal penalties for unlicensed activity 
are virtually always a component of a professional licensure practice act. 

Effect of Change� 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE. July 1, 2000 
PAGE17 

This section establishes the penalty for engaging in unlicensed contracting as a first degree 
misdemeanor, and establishes the penalty for a subsequent violation as a third degree 
felony. It also provides that the following activities are a third degree felony: (a) 
Unlicensed contracting during a declared state of emergency; and (b) Unlicensed 
operation by a pollutant storage systems contractor, a precision tank tester or an internal 
pollutant storage tank lining applicator. It also changes several references regarding "local 
license· to "registration," and instances of "locally licensed" to ·registered." 

Section 43. Amends s. 489.532, F.S., relating to invalidating contracts with unlicensed 
contractors (See section 35 of this analysis). 

Fire Protection Contractors (HB 993) 

Section 44. Amends s. 633.021, F.S., to define "layour (an activity understood as being 
within the job scope of a fire protection contractor). 

Present Situation 

Currently, engineers design fire sprinkler systems over a certain size (50 sprinkler heads), 
and fire sprinkler contractors develop installation (implementation) drawings from the 
engineer design direction. A dispute between the two professions exists regarding the 
scope of work for the engineer and the contractor, with each side arguing the other is doing 
work that the other should be performing. 

Section 553.79(6), F.S., requires certain doa.Jments to be sealed by an engineer, in order 
for the construction or alteration project to receive a building permit, including: 

(c) Fire spnnk/er documents for any new building or addition which includes a fire
sprinkler system which contains 50 or more sprinkler heads. A fire protection Contractor
I, Contractor II, or Contractor IV, cenified under s. 633.521, may design a fire spnnkler
system of 49 or fewer heads and may design the alterauon of an existing fire sprinkler
system if the alteration consists of the relocation, addition, or deletion of not more than
49 heads, notwithstanding the size of the existing fire sprinkler system.

This same requirement appears in s. 633.021 (5), F.S. There is no definition in statute 
regarding what elements or level of detail need to exist in the "documents· for fire sprinkler 
systems. There is also no definition in statute of what elements or level of detail constitute 
"layouts· (which are the doa.Jments produced by fire protection contractors, according to 
parameters set forth in the engineer design doa.Jments). 

However, the Board of Professional Engineers (BPE) has adopted a rule (Rule 61G15-32, 
F.A C.) that sets forth the minimum standard of practice for engineers, with regard to design
of fire protection systems. As a practical matter, this amounts to setting forth the minimum
level of detail and content required in such doa.Jments.

The fire sprinkler contractors argue that the BPE rule identifies activities that are typically 
done by a fire protection contractor. They further assert that the actual effect of the BPE 
rule, coupled with the absence of defining clarity in the law, shifts certain roles and 
responsibilities in establishing the details of a fire protection system from the contractor to 
the engineer. 

The Board of Professional Engineers argues that they are within their responsibility in 
settmg forth such a definition, and that engineers are working within their responsibilities in 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE18 

performing the activities set forth in the rule. They further insist that the engineer 
possesses the "big picture· information on fire protection factors inside and outside the 
building that the fire protection contractor lacks, and that choices and decisions historically 
made by contractors have needed (but lacked) engineer input all along. 

While the engineers' rule stipulating the contents of the design document and identIfy1ng 
certain details in the fire protection system (details that the contractors claim should be 
within their purview) does not explicitly prohibit fire protection contractors from making 
those decisions, it does create a problem for the contractors. If the engineer delineates the 
system in detail in his or her design document, the contractor must then either follow those 
details, or be required to obtain an engineer's approval for any and every change. Such 
approval takes time and increases the cost of construction. Contractors argue that the 
nature of fire protection system design is such that a viable and effective system may take 
any one of several forms and costs. They assert that the contractor has knowledge of 
current fire protection technology options and material choices that most engineers cannot 
be expected to possess. Taking these facts into consideration, contractors argue that it 
makes no economic sense to bind them to system detail choices (implementation decisions) 
made by engineers who cannot be expected to be as knowledgeable as contractors 
regarding fire protection technologies and materials. 

Effect of Changes 

The section makes it explicit that fire protection contractors are responsible for producing a 
fire protection system layout, i.e., hydraulic calculations and detailed positioning of system 
components. 

RepeaUObsolete Language (HB 2239) 

Effect of Changes 

Section 45. Repeals s. 489.537(8), F.S., to delete obsolete provisions establishing a 
grandfathering pathway for certain varieties of alarm contractors who had, several years 
ago, been allowed to lawfully operate without a license. 

Sections 46 & 47. Amend ss. 489.505, and 489.515, F.S., for technical purposes relating 
to the subsection repealed in the previous section of this act. 

Effective date 

Section 48. Provides that the act shall take effect July 1, 2000. 

Ill. FISCAL ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT: 

A. FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE GOVERNMENT:

1. Revenues:

None.



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE 19 

2. Expenditures:

None.

8. FISCAL IMPACT ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS:

1. Reyenyes:

None.

2. Ex_fillndItures:

This act may reduce some local government expenditures required to recruit and retain
necessary building code personnel The expansion of the validity period of provisional
certificates should be particularly beneficial to counties with a population of less than
75,000, several of which have experienced difficulties in recruiting and retaining
certified building code staff.

C. DIRECT ECONOMIC IMPACT ON PRIVATE SECTOR­

No significant impact.

D. FISCAL COMMENTS:

None.

IV CONSEQUENCES OF ARTICLE VII. SECTION 18 OF THE FLORIDA CONSTITUTION: 

A APPLICABILITY OF THE MANDATES PROVISION: 

This act does not require counties or municipalities to spend funds or to take an action 
requiring the expenditure of funds. 

8. REDUCTION OF REVENUE RAISING AUTHORITY:

This act does not reduce the authority that counties or municipalities have to raise revenue
in the aggregate.

C. REDUCTION OF STATE TAX SHARED WITH COUNTIES AND MUNICIPALITIES·

This act does not reduce the percentage of a state tax shared with counties or
municipalities

V. COMMENTS:



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE 20 

A CONSTITUTIONAL ISSUES: 

None. 

B. RULE-MAKING AUTHORITY:

The provisions in section 38 of the act constrain the authority of the ECLB in promulgating
rules. See the section-by-section portion of this analysis for a full discussion.

C. OTHER COMMENTS:

Regarding sections 35 and 43 of this act, the following intent language was read on the
House Floor, as well as the Senate Floor, prior to the final vote on the bill, in each house:

A couple of the provisions in this bill are designed to darify the unlicensed 
contract invalidation provisions in sections 489.128, and 489.532, F.S. 
Recent court decisions appear to have misapplied those sections, and are 
allowing contracts with the unlicensed contractors to be enforced - because 
the unlicensed contractor may obtain a license some time in the future. That 
was not intended By deleting the last sentence in those sections, this bill 
makes dear that contracts with unlicensed contractors are unenforceable, 
period. 

Also, one provision of note is absent from the bill. A provision moving the Construction 
Industry Licensing Board from Jacksonville to Leon County had been present in several 
versions of the House and Senate bills dealing with construction matters. However, in the 
waning days of session, that provision was removed from this bill (and any other bills which 
passed, as well). 

VI. AMENDMENTS OR COMMITTEE SUBSTITUTE CHANGES:

CS/SB 220 began as a bill to reenact and save from automatic repeal the Flonda Engineers
Management Corporation (FEMC). Amendments were adopted in the Senate committee and
the bill was made a Committee Substitute, becoming identical to HB 2115. The bill passed the
Senate, and was sent to the House At that point the bill still only applied to FEMC. The
additional sections, transforming the bill into the more broad and indusive act described in this
analysis, were amended onto the bill (per an agreement with the Senate) on the House Floor.
These additional provisions were the substance of HB 2239, CS/HB 993, CS/HB 1109, and HB
715. The Senate concurred with the House amendments and passed the bill.

VII. SIGNATURES:

COMMITTEE ON BUSINESS REGULATION & CONSUMER AFFAIRS·
Prepared by: Staff Director. 

Gip Arthur Rebecca R, Everhart 



STORAGE NAME: s0220s1z.brc 
DATE: July 1, 2000 
PAGE 21 

FINAL ANAL VSIS PREPARED BY THE COMMITTEE ON BUSINESS REGULATION & 
CONSUMER AFFAIRS: 
Prepared by· Staff Director: 

Gip Arthur Rebecca R. Everhart 



STORAGE NAME: h1109z.ca 
DA TE: May 16, 2000 

.. FAILED TO PASS THE LEGISLATURE .. 

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
AS REVISED BY THE COMMITTEE ON 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

BILL#: HB 1109 

FINAL ANALYSIS 

RELATING TO: Building Code Administrators 

SPONSOR(S): Representative Stansel and other 

TIED BILL(S): None 

ORIGINATING COMMITTEE(S)/COMMITTEE(S) OF REFERENCE: 
(1) COMMUNITY AFFAIRS (PRC) YEAS 10 NAYS 0
(2) BUSINESS REGULATION AND CONSUMER AFFAIRS (CAC) YEAS 8 NAYS 0
(3)
(4) 
(5) 

I. SUMMARY:

The provisions of HB 1109, as amended by the Committee on Community Affairs, are included
in CS/SB 220, 1st Eng., which passed the Legislature.

Provisional licenses allow newly employed or promoted building code administrators, building
code inspectors, and plans examiners to serve without having passed the examination, or
having met the experience or training requirements necessary to sit for the examination. This
bill increases the amount of time, from 1-3 years to 3-5 years, a person can serve while holding
a provisional license. It also requires that persons who obtain the provisional license must
meet the training or experience requirements necessary to sit for the licensure examination.
The bill makes a number of other darifying and technical changes.

See "effect of proposed changes· and "section-by-section· portions of this document for more
details.

The bill has no significant fiscal impact on state government. This bill may reduce some local
governments' expenditures required to recruit and retain necessary building code personnel.

The Committee on Community Affairs adopted one amendment that is traveling with the
bill. As discussed in the "AMENDMENTS OR COMMITTEE SUBSTITUTE CHANGES"
section of the analysis, the amendment provides that direct supervision and the
determination of qualifications may be provided by a building code administrator who
holds a limited or provisional certificate In any county with a population of less than
75,000 and In any municipality located within such county.

The Committee on Business Regulation & Consumer Affairs adopted an amendment that
moves the Construction Industry Licensing Board from Jacksonville to Leon County.
That amendment Is also traveling with the bill.



STORAGE NAME. h1109z.ca 
DATE: May 16, 2000 
PAGE2 

II. SUBSTANTIVE ANALYSIS:

A. DOES THE BILL SUPPORT THE FOLLOWING PRINCIPLES:

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

Less Government 

Lower Taxes 

Individual Freedom 

Personal Responsibility 

Famil}'. Empowerment 

Yes □ No □ NIA [X) 

Yes □ No □ NIA [X] 

Yes □ No □ NIA [X] 

Yes □ No □ NIA [X] 

Yes □ No □ NIA [X] 

For any pnnciple that received a "no" above, please explain: 

B. PRESENT SITUATION:

Building Officials Certification

Part XII of chapter 468, F.S., provides for the regulation of building code administrators and
inspectors by the Board of Building Code Administrators and Inspectors (Board) within the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation (DBPR). The statute provides for
various types and levels of mandatory certification of building code administrators and
inspection personnel. The program Is funded by license fees and one-half of 1 % surcharge
on every building permit (local governments retain up to 10% of the surcharge, then the
DB PR-projected funding needs of the board are subtracted, and the remainder goes to the
Construction Industries Recovery Fund, established under part I of ch. 489, Florida
Statutes).

A building code administrator supervises building code activities, including plans review,
enforcement, and inspection. A building code inspector inspects construction that requires
permits to determine compliance with building codes and state accessibility laws. A plans
examiner reviews plans submitted for building permits to determine compliance with
construction codes.

There are several categories of inspector and plans examiners certificates, relating to the
scope of the activities the licensee may perform (e.g., building inspector, commercial or
residential electrical inspector, mechanical inspector, building plans examiner, plumbing
plans examiner, etc.). Part XII sets forth the requirements for licensure for the various
types and categories of certificate holders, including credentials from specified private
organizations or specified experience (or a combination of education and experience) and
an examination.

Section 468.607, F.S., provides that no person may be employed by a state agency or local
government to perform the duties of building code administrator, plans examiner, or
inspector after October 1, 1993, without possessing a proper valid certificate issued in
accordance with the provisions of part XII of chapter 468, F.S. Subsection (4) of s.
468.609, F.S., provides no person may engage in the duties of a building code
administrator, plans examiner, or inspector pursuant after October 1, 1993, unless such
person possesses one of the following types of certificates, currently valid, issued by the
board attesting to the person's qualifications to hold such position·



STORAGE NAME: h1109z.ca 
DATE: May 16, 2000 
PAGE3 

• A standard certificate;

• A limited certificate (allows an individual to continue to work only in the position held on
July 1, 1993);

• A provisional certificate (allows an individual to work for 1 to 3 years pending
qualification for a standard certificate).

Standard Certificate 

Subsection (5) of s. 468.609, F.S., provides that to obtain a standard certificate, an 
individual must pass an examination approved by the board which demonstrates the 
applicant has fundamental knowledge of the state laws and codes relating to the 
construction of buildings for which the applicant has code administration, plans examining, 
or inspection responsibilities. The subsection provides legislative intent that such 
examinations be substantially equivalent to the examinations administered by the Southern 
Building Code Congress International, the Building Officials Association of Florida, the 
South Florida Building Code (Dade and Broward), and the Counal of American Building 
Officials. 

Subsection (2) of s. 468.609, F S., provides eligibility requirements to take the examination 
for certification as an inspector or plans examiner. Applicants must meet criteria relating to 
experience and/or education to take an examination. An applicant who holds a standard 
certificate as issued by the board and satisfactorily completes an inspector or plans 
examiner training program of not less than 200 hours in the certification category sought is 
also eligible to take an examination. All applicants must demonstrate successful 
completion of the core curriculum and specialized or advanced module course work 
approved by the Florida Building Commission, as part of the Building Code Training 
Program established pursuant to s. 553.841, F.S., appropriate to the licensing category 
sought or, pursuant to authorization by the certifying authority, provides proof of completion 
of such curriculum or course work within 6 months after such certification. 

Subsection (3) of s. 468.609, F. S., provides eligibility requirements to take the examination 
for certification as a building code administrator. Applicants must meet criteria relating to 
experience and/or education to take an examination. All applicants must demonstrate 
successful completion of the core curriculum and specialized or advanced module course 
work approved by the Florida Building Commission, as part of the Building Code Training 
Program established pursuant to s. 553.841, F.S., appropriate to the licensing category 
sought or, pursuant to authorization by the certifying authority, proV1des proof of completion 
of such curriculum or course work within 6 months after such certification. 

Limited Certjficatio11 

Subsection (6) of s. 468.609, F.S , provides a building code administrator, plans examiner, 
or inspector holding office on July 1, 1993, is not required to possess a standard certificate 
as a condition of tenure or continued employment, but must be required to obtain a limited 
certificate. The subsection provides that by October 1, 1993, individuals who were 
employed on July 1, 1993, as building code administrators, plans examiners, or inspectors, 
who are not eligible for a standard certificate, but who wish to continue in such 
employment, must submit to the board an application and certification fees and shall 
receive a limited certificate qualifying them to engage in building code administration, plans 
examinabon, or inspection in the class, at the perfonnance level, and within the 
governmental jurisdiction in which such person is employed. The limited certificate is valid 



STORAGE NAME: h1109z.ca 
DATE: May 16, 2000 
PAGE4 

only as an authorization for the building code administrator, plans examiner, or inspector to 
continue in the position held, and to continue performing all functions assigned to that 
position, on July 1, 1993. A building code administrator, plans examiner, or inspector 
holding a limited certificate can be promoted to a position requiring a higher level certificate 
only upon issuance of a standard certificate or provisional certificate appropriate for such 
new position. 

Provisional Certification 

Subsection (7) of s. 468.609, F.S., authorizes the Board to provide for the issuance of 
provisional certificates valid for such period, not less than 1 year nor more than 3 years, as 
specified by board rule, to any newly employed or promoted building code administrator, 
plans examiner, or inspector. 

Exceptions 

Subsection (8) of s. 468.609, F.S., provides that any individual who holds a valid certificate 
under the provisions of s. 553.795, F.S., (which was repealed by chapter 93-166, L.O.F.) or 
who has successfully completed all requirements for certification pursuant to such section, 
shall be deemed to have satisfied the requirements for receiving a standard certificate 
prescribed by this part In addition, the subsection provides that any individual who holds a 
valid certificate issued by the Southern Building Code Congress International, the Building 
Officials Association of Florida, the South Florida Building Code (Dade and Broward), or 
the Council of American Building Officials certification programs, or who has been 
approved for certification under one of those programs not later than October 1, 1995, shall 
be deemed to have satisfied the requirements for receiving a standard certificate in the 
corresponding category prescribed by this part. Employees of counties with a population of 
less than 50,000, or employees of municipalities with a population of less than 3,500, shall 
be deemed to have satisfied the requirements for standard certification where such 
employee is approved for certification under one of the programs set forth in this paragraph 
not later than October 1, 1998. 

Statutory References to Building Inspectors and Inspections 

Section 468 603(2), F.S., provides a definition of "building code inspector" or "inspector.• 
The terms "inspector," "bu1ld1ng inspector," and "building inspection· are used throughout 
part XII of chapter 468, F.S , as well as in other chapters of the Florida Statutes. 

C. EFFECT OF PROPOSED CHANGES:

This bill deletes language staling legislative intent that examinations required for
certification as a building code administrator or building code inspector or plans examiner
be substantially similar to examinations administered by the Building Officials Association
of Florida and the South Florida Building Code. According to DBPR, these organizations
do not offer examinations. The bill increases the period the Board may provide for the
issuance of provisional certificates from a minimum of 1 year and a maximum of 3 years to
a minimum of 3 years and a maximum of 5 years. Eligibility requirements for provisional
certificates are added to limit provisional certificates to newly employed or promoted
building code inspectors or plans examiners who meet training or experience eligibility
requirements to take the certification examination and newly employed or promoted
building code administrators who meet ehg1bihty requirements to take the certification
examination.



STORAGE NAME: h1109z.ca 
DATE: May 16, 2000 
PAGES 

The bill deletes obsolete standard certificate equivalency provisions, and revises various 
statutory provisions to provide for consistency in terminology relating to building code 
inspector and building code inspection 

D. SECTION-BY-SECTION ANALYSIS:

Section 1. Subsections (2) and (6) of s. 468.603, F.S., relating to definitions of "building
code inspector" and "categories of building inspectors" are amended to replace references
to "inspector" with "building code inspector."

Section 2. Section 468.604, F.S., relating to responsibilities of building code
administrators, plans examiners, and inspectors, is amended to replace references to
"inspector" with "building code inspector."

Section 3. Paragraph (c) of subsection (2) of s. 468.605, F.S., relating to membership of
the Florida Building Code Administrators and Inspectors Board, is amended to replace
references to "inspector" with "building code inspector."

Section 4. Section 468.607, F.S., relating to certification of building code administration
and inspection personnel, is amended to replace references to "inspector" with "building
code inspector."

Section 5. Section 468.609, F.S., relating to standards for certification, is amended to
replace references to "inspector" with "building code inspector."

Subsection (5) is amended to revise language providing legislative intent that examinations
used for certification under this part be substantially equivalent to examinations
administered by the Southern Building Code Congress International, the Building Officials
Association of Florida, the South Florida Building Code, and the Council of American
Building Officials. References to the Building Officials Association of Florida and the South
Florida Building Code are deleted.

Subsection (7) is amended to expand the period the board may provide for the issuance of
provisional certificates from a minimum of 1 year and a maximum of 3 years to a minimum
of 3 years and a maximum of 5 years. Eligibility requirements for provisional certificates
are added to limit provisional certificates to newly employed or promoted building code
inspectors or plans examiners who meet eligibility requirements specified in subsection (2)
and newly employed or promoted building code administrators who meet eligibility
requirements specified in subsection (3).

Subsection (8) is deleted to: remove obsolete provisions and remove language providing
that any individual who holds a valid certificate issued by the Southern Building Code
Congresses lnternallonal, the Building Officials Association of Flonda, the South Florida
Building Code, or the Council of American Building Officials certification program, or who
has been approved for certification under such programs not later than October 1, 1995,
shall be deemed to satisfy requirements for certification.

Section 6. Section 468.617, F.S., relating to joint inspection departments, is amended to
replace references to "inspector" and "inspection· with "building code inspector" or "building
code inspection.·

Section 7. Subsection (3) of s. 468.621, F.S., relating to disciplinary proceedings, is
amended to replace a reference to "inspector" with "building code Inspector."



STORAGE NAME: h1109z.ca 
DA TE. May 16, 2000 
PAGE& 

Section 8. Subsection (2), (3), and (4) of s. 468.627, F.S., relating to application, 
examination, and fees, is amended to replace references to "inspector" and "inspection• 
with "building code inspector" or "building code inspection• and clarify "regulation• refers to 
"construction regulation." 

Section 9. Section 468.631, F.S., relating to the Building Code Administrators and 
Inspectors Fund, is amended to replace references to "inspector" and "inspection" with 
"building code inspector" or "building code inspection." 

Section 10. Subsection (1) of s. 468.633, F.S., relating to authority of local government, is 
amended to replace a reference to building "inspector" with "building code inspector." 

Section 11. Paragraph (a) of subsectJon (1) of s. 112.3145, F.S., relating to disclosure of 
financial interests and clients represented before agencies, is amended to replace a 
reference to "building inspector" with "building code inspector." 

Section 12. Subsection (3) of s. 125.56, F.S., relating to the adoption of amendments of 
building codes, is amended to replace a reference to "building inspector" with "building 
code inspector." 

Section 13. Paragraph (g) of subsection (5) of s. 212 08, F.S., relating to sales tax 
exemption for building materials used in an enterprise zone, is amended to replace a 
reference to "building inspector" with "building code inspector." 

Section 14. Paragraph (a) of subsection (2) of s. 252.924, F.S., relating to party state 
responsibilities, is amended to replace a reference to "building inspection· with "building 
code inspection." 

Section 15. Paragraph U) of subsection (3) of s. 404.056, F.S., relating to environmental 
radiation standards and programs, is amended to replace a reference to "building 
inspections• with "building code inspections • 

Section 16. Sec!Jon 471.045, F S , relating to professional engineers performing building 
code inspector duties, is amended to replace a reference to "building inspection· with 
"building code inspection." 

Section 17. Section 481.222, F.S., relating to architects performing building code 
inspector duties, is amended to replace a reference to "building inspection• with "building 
code inspection." 

Section 18. Paragraph (b) of subsection (18) of s. 489.103, F.S., relating to exemptions 
from regulation of construction contracting, is amended to replace a reference to "building 
inspections· with "building code inspections." 

Section 19. An effective date of July 1, 2000, is provided. 

Ill. FISCAL ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT: 



STORAGE NAME: h1109z.ca 
DATE: May 16, 2000 
PAGE7 

A FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE GOVERNMENT: 

1. Reve_rn.1es:

This bill has no impact on state revenues.

2. Expenditures:

This bill has no impact on state expenditures.

B. FISCAL IMPACT ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS:

1. Revenues:

This bill has no impact on local government revenues

2. Expenditures:

This bill may reduce some local government expenditures required to recruit and retain
necessary building code personnel. The expansion of the validity period of provisional
certificates should be particularly beneficial to small and medium size local
governments that have experienced difficulties in recruiting and retaining certified
building code staff.

C. DIRECT ECONOMIC IMPACT ON PRIVATE SECTOR:

To the extent this bill assists small and medium size local governments that have
experienced difficulties in recruiting and retaining certified building code staff, the bill may
benefit the pnvate sector in obtaining appropriate approvals and permits in a timely fashion.

D. FISCAL COMMENTS:

See the AMENDMENTS OR COMMITTEE SUBSTITUTE CHANGES section of the analysis
for a discussion of the fiscal impact of the amendment traveling with the bill.

IV. CONSEQUENCES OF ARTICLE VII, SECTION 18 OF THE FLORIDA CONSTITUTION:

A APPLICABILITY OF THE MANDATES PROVISION:

This bill does not require counties or municipalities to expend funds or to take action 
requiring the expenditure offunds. 

B. REDUCTION OF REVENUE RAISING AUTHORITY:

This bill does not reduce the authority that municipalities or counties have to raise
revenues in the aggregate.

C. REDUCTION OF STATE TAX SHARED WITH COUNTIES AND MUNICIPALITIES:



STORAGE NAME: h1109z.ca 
DA TE: May 16, 2000 
PAGES 

This bill does not reduce the percentage of state tax shared with counties or municipalities. 

V. COMMENTS:

A CONSTITUTIONAL ISSUES: 

None. 

B. RULE-MAKING AUTHORITY·

This bill does not necessitate additional rulemaking authority.

C OTHER COMMENTS: 

Florida Department of Business and Professional Regulation 

DBPR submitted an analysis of HB 1109 stating the bill has no fiscal impact on the 
department. In reference to the changes to provisional certificates and the addition of 
experience requirements, the analysis states experience is very important and will better 
protect the public by requiring experience for all provisional licensees. 

Florida Association of Counties 

A representative of the Florida Association of Counties indicates the Association strongly 
supports HB 1109. 

Florida League of Cities 

A representative of the Florida League of Cities indicates the League supports HB 1109. 

VI. AMENDMENTS OR COMMITTEE SUBSTITUTE CHANGES:

Committee on Community Affairs

The Committee on Community Affairs adopted one amendment on March 23, 2000, that is
traveling with the bill. The amendment inserts language on page 10, line 31, after the period,
that provides that direct supervision and the determination of qualifications may be provided by
a building code administrator who holds a limited or provisional certificate in any county with a
population of less than 75,000 and in any muniapality located within such county

The Committee on Business Regulation & Consumer Affairs adopted an amendment that is
traveling with the bill. It moves the Construction Industry Licensing Board from Jacksonville to
Leon County.

The department states that ii intends to house the board staff 1n space it currently leases in its
Northwood Mall facility. Currently, the CILB has 25 full time employees (FTE's) and six OPS
employees. The department has indicated that ii intends to maintain the CILB as a separate
entity within the Division of Professions. However, it also intends to move some of the FTE
positions currently dedicated to the CILB to staff the DBPR Call Center. The DBPR Call Center
is intended to receive all of the DBPR "800 number" information inquiries and complaint intake.
The department states that all of current CILB staff will be given an opportunity to fill vacant
positions in DBPR's Jacksonville office (Real Estate, Regulation, and Alcohol Beverage and
Tobacco divisions) if they do not want to relocate to Tallahassee.



STORAGE NAME: h1109z.ca 
DA TE: May 16, 2000 
PAGE9 

The department indicates that there will be an annual savings to the department of $95,851 
(the annual lease on the Jacksonville facility). They also indicate that there will be a number of 
other savings, and that server costs for computers, phone costs, and postage savings will total 
approximately $10,000 per year. 

The current rent per square foot in Jacksonville is lower than will be billed back to the CILB 
trust fund account for staff space in the Northwood Mall facility. However, since some of the 
current Cl LB staff positions will be allocated to the Call Center, and since duplication of some 
technical support space (e.g., copying, printing, etc.) will be eliminated, it appears likely that the 
overall cost charged back to the CILB will not rise. The department states that the expenses for 
moving equipment and furniture are expected to total $7,500. 

VII. SIGNATURES:

COMMITTEE ON COMMUNITY AFFAIRS:
Prepared by: Staff Director: 

Thomas L Hamby Joan Highsmith-Smith 

AS REVISED BY THE COMMITTEE ON BUSINESS REGULATION AND CONSUMER 
AFFAIRS: 
Prepared by: Staff Director 

Gjp Arthur Rebecca B Everhart 

FINAL ANALYSIS PREPARED BY THE COMMITTEE ON COMMUNITY AFFAIRS: 
Prepared by: Staff Director: 

Thomas L. Hamby Joan Highsmith-Smith 


	Session Law 00-372
	Recommended Citation

	tmp.1719500358.pdf.ap3T9

